BID TABULATION #2064 CLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST PAGE10F7

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW & SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005 DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004 DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: BADGER TRUCK CENTER PRIMARY BID
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM [DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE STERLING MODEL LT 8500 8 $ 79,307.00 | $ 634,456.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE 8 $ 1,513.00 | $ 12,104.00
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION $ 80,820.00 | $ 646,560.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL NO BID 6 $ - s -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID 6 $ - s -
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID 6 $ - |s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 $ - s -
3 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD NO BID 2 $ - s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 $ - |s -
TOTAL BID $ 646,560.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST PAGE20F7

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW & SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005 DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004 DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: BADGER TRUCK CENTER ALTERNATE BID
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM [DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE STERLING MODEL LT 9500 8 $ 86,593.00 | $ 692,744.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE 8 $ 840.00 | $ 6,720.00
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION $ 87,433.00 | $ 699,464.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL NO BID 6 $ - |s -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID 6 $ - |s -
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID 6 $ - s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 $ - |s -
3 [bumP BODY, 16 YARD NO BID 2 $ - |s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 $ - s -
TOTAL BID $ 699,464.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CcLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST
SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007
SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007
SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW &

DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: CASPERS' TRUCK EQUIPMENT

PAGE 3 OF 7

DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000

MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE NO BID 8 - -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID 8 - -
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION - -

2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL HENDERSON MARK E 6 35,204.00 211,224.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE 6 10,649.00 63,894.00
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM 6 NO COST -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 45,853.00 275,118.00

3 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD HENDERSON MARK E 2 26,585.00 53,170.00
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 26,585.00 53,170.00
TOTAL BID 328,288.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST PAGE 4 OF 7

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW & SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005 DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004 DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM [DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE INTERNATIONAL/7500 8 $ 84,700.00 | $ 677,600.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE 8 $ 225.00 | $ 1,800.00
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION $ 84,925.00 | $ 679,400.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL NO BID 6 $ - |s -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID 6 $ - |s -
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID 6 $ - s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 $ - |s -
3 [bumP BODY, 16 YARD NO BID 2 $ - |s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 $ - s -
TOTAL BID $ 679,400.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CcLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST
SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007
SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007
SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW &

DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT

PAGE 5 OF 7

DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000

MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE NO BID 8 $ - -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID 8 $ - -
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION $ - -

2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL CRYSTEEL SELECT 6 $ 31,900.00 191,400.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE 6 $ 6,892.00 41,352.00
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM 6 NOT AVAILABLE -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 $ 38,792.00 232,752.00

3 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD CRYSTEEL SELECT 2 $ 25,994.00 51,988.00
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 $ 25,994.00 51,988.00
TOTAL BID 284,740.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST PAGE6 OF 7

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW & SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005 DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004 DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: TRUCK COUNTRY OF WISCONSIN
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM [DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW, W/PUSHER AXLE FREIGHTLINER M2112 8 $ 87,355.00 | $ 698,840.00
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTION LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR TRUCK CHASSIS:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE 8 $ 3,536.00 | $ 28,288.00
TOTAL COST: TRUCK CHASSIS, INCLUDING OPTION $ 90,891.00 | $ 727,128.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW & ICE CONTROL NO BID 6 $ - |s -
ADDITIONAL COST FOR OPTIONS LISTED IN SPECIFICATION
FOR DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL:
OPTION: PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID 6 $ - |s -
OPTION: HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID 6 $ - s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY INCLUDING ALL OPTIONS 6 $ - |s -
3 [bumP BODY, 16 YARD NO BID 2 $ - |s -
TOTAL COST: DUMP BODY 2 $ - s -
TOTAL BID $ 727,128.00




BID TABULATION #2064 CLOSED 01/17/2008 @ 2:00 PM-CST PAGET7 OF 7

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, 64,000 LB GVW & SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005 DRAWING #2000-7, DATED 10/6/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD - SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004 DRAWING #2000-9, DATED 10/12/2000
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 8/9/2007

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 8/9/2007

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 8/9/2007

EMAIL: Janine.Wilant@milwaukee.gov

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM (LINE 1 - TRUCK CHASSIS, LINE 2 - DUMP BODY-SNOW & ICE CONTROL, LINE 3 -
DUMP BODY) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE
SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS. BIDDER IS NOT REQUIRED TO BID ALL THREE LINE ITEMS (LINE 1, LINE 2 AND/OR
LINE 3) TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AN AWARD.

LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE PRICE QUOTED FOR THE PURCHASE OF:

QUANTITY - 8 EACH - TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW,

QUANTITY - 6 EACH - DUMP BODY, 16 YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL AND/OR

QUANTITY - 2 EACH - DUMP BODY, 16 YARD

FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE AND WILL NOT INCLUDE THE DISCOUNT STATED FOR THE POSSIBLE PURCHASE OF
ADDITIONAL UNITS IN 2008 BY THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE AND/OR CITY OF WAUWATOSA.

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT A BID IF A MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENT IS STATED.



