

BID TABULATION #19924

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR TEMPORARY AND PERMANENT TRAFFIC SIGN MATERIALS
 OPENED OCTOBER 31, 2023 @ 4:30 PM-CT

PURCHASING AGENT: MARKIESHA HENDERSON
 TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3612
 EMAIL: MAHEND@MILWAUKEE.GOV

| BIDDER | ITEM # | ITEM DESCRIPTION | UOM | UNIT PRICE | % DISCOUNT | DISCOUNT PRICE PER UOM | EST. QTY PER YEAR | TOTAL | GROUP TOTAL | LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | |
|---|----------|---|---|------------|------------|------------------------|-------------------|--------|-------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|----|
| DECKER SUPPLY CO., INC. (MADISON, WI) | GROUP 1 | 1 | 3M 4000 SERIES DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$2.90 | 0.00 | \$2.90 | 20,250 | \$58,725.00 | \$74,666.16 | N/A | YES AMERICAN MADE | NO |
| | | 2 | 3M 1170 SERIES ELECTROCUT FILM | SQ. FT. | \$1.00 | 0.00 | \$1.00 | 4,500 | \$4,500.00 | | | | |
| | | 3 | 3M IJ180CV3 PRINTABLE VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$1.60 | 0.00 | \$1.60 | 975 | \$1,560.00 | | | | |
| | | 4 | GERBER 220 SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$1.69 | 0.00 | \$1.69 | 3600 | \$6,084.00 | | | | |
| | | 5 | GERBER 280 SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$7.92 | 0.00 | \$7.92 | 187.5 | \$1,485.00 | | | | |
| | | 6 | GERBER 280I SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$7.92 | 0.00 | \$7.92 | 187.5 | \$1,485.00 | | | | |
| | | 7 | 3M 880I SERIES INK, 1GAL CAN | GALLON | \$100.00 | 0.00 | \$100.00 | 8 | \$800.00 | | | | |
| | | 8 | 3M 891I THINNER FOR 880I SERIES INK | GALLON | \$27.16 | 0.00 | \$27.16 | 1 | \$27.16 | | | | |
| | GROUP 2 | 1 | NAZDAR 59000 SERIES INK, 1GAL CAN | GALLON | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 10 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | N/A | YES AMERICAN MADE | NO |
| | | 2 | NAZDAR 5560 FAST THINNER FOR 59000 SERIES INK | GALLON | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 4 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | | 3 | NAZDAR SW37 SCREEN WASH | GALLON | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 330 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| 4 | | MATRAPLAST HI-CORE CORRUGATED WHITE SHEET, 4MM THICK, 18"X24" | PIECE | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | 10,000 | \$0.00 | | | | | |
| LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC (FRANKFORT, OH) | GROUP 1* | 1 | 3M 4000 SERIES DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$5.81 | 50.00 | \$2.905 | 20,250 | \$58,826.25 | \$66,000.77 | N/A | YES AMERICAN MADE | NO |
| | | 2 | 3M 1170 SERIES ELECTROCUT FILM | SQ. FT. | \$1.79 | 40.00 | \$1.074 | 4,500 | \$4,833.00 | | | | |
| | | 3 | 3M IJ180CV3 PRINTABLE VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | \$1.806 | 13.00 | \$1.571 | 975 | \$1,531.94 | | | | |
| | | 4 | GERBER 220 SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | NO BID | 0.00 | NO BID | 3600 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | | 5 | GERBER 280 SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | NO BID | 0.00 | NO BID | 187.5 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | | 6 | GERBER 280I SERIES VINYL SHEETING | SQ. FT. | NO BID | 0.00 | NO BID | 187.5 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | | 7 | 3M 880I SERIES INK, 1GAL CAN | GALLON | \$112.50 | 13.00 | \$97.875 | 8 | \$783.00 | | | | |
| | | 8 | 3M 891I THINNER FOR 880I SERIES INK | GALLON | \$30.5573 | 13.00 | \$26.585 | 1 | \$26.58 | | | | |
| | GROUP 2 | 1 | NAZDAR 59000 SERIES INK, 1GAL CAN | GALLON | \$133.09 | 0.00 | \$133.090 | 10 | \$1,330.90 | \$40,988.54 | N/A | YES AMERICAN MADE | NO |
| | | 2 | NAZDAR 5560 FAST THINNER FOR 59000 SERIES INK | GALLON | \$74.36 | 0.00 | \$74.360 | 4 | \$297.44 | | | | |
| | | 3 | NAZDAR SW37 SCREEN WASH | GALLON | \$75.94 | 0.00 | \$75.940 | 330 | \$25,060.20 | | | | |
| | | 4 | MATRAPLAST HI-CORE CORRUGATED WHITE SHEET, 4MM THICK, 18"X24" | PIECE | \$1.43 | 0.00 | \$1.430 | 10,000 | \$14,300.00 | | | | |

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC DID NOT BID ALL ITEMS IN GROUP 1. THEREFORE, BIDDER IS NOT ELIGIBLE FOR GROUP 1 AWARD

AWARD WILL BE MADE IN GROUP TOTAL OR GRAND TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE AT LEAST ONE (1) COMPLETE GROUP TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT DISCOUNT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GROUP TOTALS. THE GROUP TOTALS SHALL BE ADDED TOGETHER TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000. **EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017**, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S OFFICE OF EQUITY AND INCLUSION (OEI), THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

- THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
- THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or \$25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE
3. SRC BID INCENTIVE