BID TABULATION #21500

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR PISTOLS, OPTICS, AND RELATED SUPPLIES

OPENED 02/19/2026 @ 4:30 PM-CT

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL SILER

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2392
EMAIL: MICSIL@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PAGE 1 OF 2

BIDDER

ITEM #

ITEM
DESCRIPTION

uom

UNIT
PRICE

QTY

TOTAL

GRAND TOTAL

LBE AFFIDAVIT
SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN
AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

SRC
AFFIDAVIT
SUBMITTED?

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
(PFLUGERVILLE, TX)

GLOCK G17 GENG6 PISTOL
WITH POLYMER SIGHTS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

NO BID

305

N/A

HOLOSUN 509T (HE-509T-RD-|
X2 LEM) OPTIC IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
DATED UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$342.03

33

s

$113,211.93

SAFARILAND 7390RDSAG
DUTY HOLSTER, BLACK
PLAIN, FOR GLOCK 17 GEN 6
WITH LIGHT. MIXTURE OF
LEFT AND RIGHT-HANDED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

EACH

NO BID

305

N/A

C&H PRECISION G6-509T-ST
MOUNTING PLATE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$55.67

305

$16,979.35

AMERIGLO GL-507,
AMERIGLO GL-524, OR
AMERIGLO GL-526 BACKUP
SUPPRESSOR HEIGHT
SIGHT SET IN ACCORDANCE
WITH CITY OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$35.23

305

$10,745.15

$140,936.43

NO

NO

NO

RAY O'HERRON CO., INC.
(DANVILLE, IL)

GLOCK G17 GENG6 PISTOL
WITH POLYMER SIGHTS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$461.95

30

a

$140,894.75

HOLOSUN 509T (HE-509T-RD-|
X2 LEM) OPTIC IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
DATED UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$317.00

331

$104,927.00

SAFARILAND 7390RDSAG
DUTY HOLSTER, BLACK
PLAIN, FOR GLOCK 17 GEN 6
WITH LIGHT. MIXTURE OF
LEFT AND RIGHT-HANDED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

EACH

NO BID

305

N/A

C&H PRECISION G6-509T-ST
MOUNTING PLATE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$49.00

305

$14,945.00

AMERIGLO GL-507,
AMERIGLO GL-524, OR
AMERIGLO GL-526 BACKUP
SUPPRESSOR HEIGHT
SIGHT SET IN ACCORDANCE
WITH CITY OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

$38.92

305

$11,870.60

$272,637.35

NO

NO

NO
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GLOCK G17 GEN6 PISTOL
WITH POLYMER SIGHTS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY
1 OF MILWAUKEE NO BID 305 N/A
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1

UPDATED 02/10/2026.

HOLOSUN 509T (HE-509T-RD-
X2 LEM) OPTIC IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY

2 OF MILWAUKEE $309.99 | 33
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1

DATED UPDATED 02/10/2026.

SAFARILAND 7390RDSAG
DUTY HOLSTER, BLACK
PLAIN, FOR GLOCK 17 GEN 6
WITH LIGHT. MIXTURE OF

) 3 LEFT AND RIGHT-HANDED IN $133.00 305 [ $40,565.00
ST(F‘;EU'%'EE; \SN'I';‘C ACCORDANCE WITH CITY EACH $171,469.59 NO NO NO
OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

C&H PRECISION G6-509T-ST
MOUNTING PLATE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CITY

4 OF MILWAUKEE $54.00 305 | $16,470.00
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1

UPDATED 02/10/2026.

AMERIGLO GL-507,
AMERIGLO GL-524. OR
AMERIGLO GL-526 BACKUP
SUPPRESSOR HEIGHT

s SIGHT SET IN ACCORDANCE $36.78 | 305 $11.827.90
WITH CITY OF MILWAUKEE
SPECIFICATION NO. 45-C-1
UPDATED 02/10/2026.

s

$102,606.69

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS
IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN
5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE’S OFFICE OF EQUITY
AND INCLUSION (OEI), THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-
18.9) IF:

oTHE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
#THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or $28,171.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC
BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT
ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST
BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC)
AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID
INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE

2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE

3. SRC BID INCENTIVE



