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BID TABULATION #21497 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR GASOLINE TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716
OPENED 11/20/2025 @ 4:30 PM-CT EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

LBE AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

LBE AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

LBE AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

LBE AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

N/A YES N/A NO N/A NO N/A NO

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14810 516,750 $1,110,030.68 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15730 516,750 $1,114,784.78 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15920 516,750 $1,115,766.60 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14110 516,750 $1,106,413.43

DELIVERY ADDRESS 

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD)

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TRANSPORT 

LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS 

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD)

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TRANSPORT 

LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS 

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TANK 
WAGON LOAD)

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TRANSPORT 

LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS 

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD)

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TRANSPORT 

LOAD)
2142 W. CANAL STREET N/A $0.03000 2142 W. CANAL STREET N/A 0.04500 2142 W. CANAL STREET N/A 0.05080 2142 W. CANAL STREET N/A 0.04890
3921 W. LINCOLN AVENUE N/A $0.02950 3921 W. LINCOLN AVENUE N/A 0.05800 3921 W. LINCOLN AVENUE N/A 0.06790 3921 W. LINCOLN AVENUE N/A 0.06940
2024 W. HOLT AVENUE $0.10000 N/A 2024 W. HOLT AVENUE $0.55200 N/A 2024 W. HOLT AVENUE $0.42290 N/A 2024 W. HOLT AVENUE $0.25000 N/A
3025 W. RUBY AVENUE N/A $0.01000 3025 W. RUBY AVENUE N/A 0.04470 3025 W. RUBY AVENUE N/A 0.05200 3025 W. RUBY AVENUE N/A 0.04870
6710 W. INDUSTRIAL ROAD N/A $0.02283 6710 W. INDUSTRIAL ROAD N/A 0.05800 6710 W. INDUSTRIAL ROAD N/A 0.05820 6710 W. INDUSTRIAL ROAD N/A 0.05250
5230 W. STATE STREET N/A $0.01000 5230 W. STATE STREET N/A 0.05800 5230 W. STATE STREET N/A 0.06380 5230 W. STATE STREET N/A 0.06080
123 N. 25TH STREET $0.30000 N/A 123 N. 25TH STREET $0.35700 N/A 123 N. 25TH STREET $0.37080 N/A 123 N. 25TH STREET $0.15000 N/A
3850 N. 35TH STREET N/A $0.04000 3850 N. 35TH STREET N/A 0.05100 3850 N. 35TH STREET N/A 0.05610 3850 N. 35TH STREET N/A 0.05060

COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL
AVERAGE TANK WAGON LOAD $0.20000 9,250 $1,850.00 AVERAGE TANK WAGON LOAD $0.45450 9,250 $4,204.13 AVERAGE TANK WAGON LOAD $0.39685 9,250 $3,670.86 AVERAGE TANK WAGON LOAD $0.20000 9,250 $1,850.00
AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.02372 507,500 $12,038.75 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.05245 507,500 $26,618.38 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.05813 507,500 $29,502.67 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.05515 507,500 $27,988.63
SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $0.00 37 $0.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $60.00 37 $2,220.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $60.00 37 $2,220.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $65.00 37 $2,405.00

$1,123,919.42 $1,147,827.28 $1,151,160.13 $1,138,657.05

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL COST PER GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14810 746,400 $1,603,341.84 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15730 746,400 $1,610,208.72 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15920 746,400 $1,611,626.88 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14110 746,400 $1,598,117.04

DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON 

(TRANSPORT LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON 

(TRANSPORT LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON 

(TRANSPORT LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON 

(TRANSPORT LOAD)
749 W. STATE STREET $0.06400 749 W. STATE STREET $0.02900 749 W. STATE STREET $0.02600 749 W. STATE STREET $0.02730
245 W. LINCOLN AVENUE $0.02000 245 W. LINCOLN AVENUE $0.02900 245 W. LINCOLN AVENUE $0.03100 245 W. LINCOLN AVENUE $0.03360
2333 N. 49TH STREET $0.02300 2333 N. 49TH STREET $0.02700 2333 N. 49TH STREET $0.02870 2333 N. 49TH STREET $0.02740
6929 W. SILVER SPRING DRIVE $0.01500 6929 W. SILVER SPRING DRIVE $0.02700 6929 W. SILVER SPRING DRIVE $0.02870 6929 W. SILVER SPRING DRIVE $0.02590
2920 N. 4TH STREET $0.03000 2920 N. 4TH STREET $0.02900 2920 N. 4TH STREET $0.02870 2920 N. 4TH STREET $0.03020
3006 S. 27TH STREET $0.01000 3006 S. 27TH STREET $0.03200 3006 S. 27TH STREET $0.02870 3006 S. 27TH STREET $0.03210
3626 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.02200 3626 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.02700 3626 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.02870 3626 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.02690
4733 W. VLIET STREET $0.00500 4733 W. VLIET STREET $0.02700 4733 W. VLIET STREET $0.02950 4733 W. VLIET STREET $0.02810

COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL
AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.02363 746,400 $17,633.70 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.02838 746,400 $21,179.10 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.02875 746,400 $21,459.00 AVERAGE TRANSPORT LOAD $0.02894 746,400 $21,598.95
SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $0.00 5 $0.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $60.00 5 $300.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $60.00 5 $300.00 SPLIT-LOAD DELIVERY FEE $65.00 5 $325.00

$1,620,975.54 $1,631,687.82 $1,633,385.88 $1,620,040.99

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL COST PER GALLON ESTIMATED GALLONS SUBTOTAL

UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14810 31,700 $68,094.77 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15730 31,700 $68,386.41 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.15920 31,700 $68,446.64 UNLEADED GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE $2.14110 31,700 $67,872.87

DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST PER 
GALLON (TANK 
WAGON LOAD) DELIVERY ADDRESS

DELIVERY COST 
PER GALLON (TANK 

WAGON LOAD)
100 W. VIRGINIA AVENUE $0.45000 100 W. VIRGINIA AVENUE NO BID 100 W. VIRGINIA AVENUE $0.40050 100 W. VIRGINIA AVENUE $0.25000
1313 W. RESERVOIR STREET $0.05000 1313 W. RESERVOIR STREET NO BID 1313 W. RESERVOIR STREET $0.39920 1313 W. RESERVOIR STREET $0.25000
10320 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.05000 10320 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE NO BID 10320 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.41350 10320 W. FOND DU LAC AVENUE $0.25000
2130 W. OKLAHOMA AVENUE $0.05000 2130 W. OKLAHOMA AVENUE NO BID 2130 W. OKLAHOMA AVENUE $0.41670 2130 W. OKLAHOMA AVENUE $0.25000
6205 W. BURLEIGH STREET $0.05000 6205 W. BURLEIGH STREET NO BID 6205 W. BURLEIGH STREET $0.39770 6205 W. BURLEIGH STREET $0.25000
6680 N. TEUTONIA AVENUE $0.35000 6680 N. TEUTONIA AVENUE NO BID 6680 N. TEUTONIA AVENUE $0.40140 6680 N. TEUTONIA AVENUE $0.25000

COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL COST MULTIPLIER SUBTOTAL
AVERAGE TANK WAGON $0.16667 31,700 $5,283.33 AVERAGE TANK WAGON N/A 31,700 N/A AVERAGE TANK WAGON $0.40483 31,700 $12,833.22 AVERAGE TANK WAGON $0.25000 31,700 $7,925.00

$73,378.10 N/A $81,279.86 $75,797.87

$2,818,273.06 N/A $2,865,825.87 $2,834,495.91

MFD TOTAL

(ALL DEPARTMENTS) GRAND TOTAL

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT (MPD)

BIDDER

INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS LLC
(GAINSVILLE, GA)

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW)

MPD TOTAL

MILWAUKEE FIRE DEPARTMENT (MFD)

DPW TOTAL

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW)

DPW TOTAL

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT (MPD)

BIDDER

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
(FORT WAYNE, IN)

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW)

DPW TOTAL

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT (MPD)

BIDDER

MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINSVILLE, INC. DBA 
MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY
(GAINSVILLE, GA)

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW)

DPW TOTAL

MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT (MPD)

BIDDER

EDWARD H WOLF & SONS, INC.
(SLINGER, WI)

AWARD WILL BE MADE INDIVIDUALLY BY DEPARTMENT: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW), MILWAUKEE POLICE DEPARTMENT (MPD), AND MILWAUKEE FIRE DEPARTMENT (MFD), OR IN TOTAL (ALL DEPARTMENTS) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE 
SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.  

BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE QUOTES FOR ALL OF THE USER DEPARTMENTS LISTED IN THIS BID AND SPECIFICATION TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR A TOTAL AWARD.

THE LOW BIDDER FOR UNLEADED GASOLINE FOR DPW SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE QUOTED TOTAL COST PER GALLON (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) MULTIPLIED BY DPW’S ESTIMATED USAGE OF 516,750 GALLONS PLUS THE AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TANK WAGON DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 9,250 GALLONS, THE 
AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TRANSPORT DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 507,500 GALLONS, AND THE QUOTED SPLIT LOAD DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 37.

MFD TOTAL

(ALL DEPARTMENTS) GRAND TOTAL

MPD TOTAL

MFD TOTAL

(ALL DEPARTMENTS) GRAND TOTAL

MILWAUKEE FIRE DEPARTMENT (MFD)

MPD TOTAL

MILWAUKEE FIRE DEPARTMENT (MFD)

MPD TOTAL

MILWAUKEE FIRE DEPARTMENT (MFD)

MFD TOTAL

(ALL DEPARTMENTS) GRAND TOTAL

THE LOW BIDDER FOR UNLEADED GASOLINE FOR MFD SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE QUOTED TOTAL COST PER GALLON (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) MULTIPLIED BY MFD’S ESTIMATED USAGE OF 31,700 GALLONS PLUS THE AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TANK WAGON DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 31,700 GALLONS.  MFD DOES 
NOT ORDER SPLIT LOADS.  

THE LOW BIDDER FOR UNLEADED GASOLINE FOR MPD SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE QUOTED TOTAL COST PER GALLON (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) MULTIPLIED BY MPD’S ESTIMATED USAGE OF 746,400 GALLONS PLUS THE AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 746,400 GALLONS, AND 
THE QUOTED SPLIT LOAD DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 5.
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3. SRC BID INCENTIVE

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:
●THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND 
●THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% OR $27,892.

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 
365-7-1.  A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1.  SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE 
SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.  EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL 
BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE’S OFFICE OF EQUITY AND INCLUSION (OEI), THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $30,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED 
THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% or $25,000.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE AN AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% OR $25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE 
DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000. 
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