

BIDDER	CLARUSTEC, INC. (EDISON, NJ)	COMCENTIA, LLC (MEQUON, WI)	GENESIS CORP. DBA GENESIS 10 (MILWAUKEE, WI)	INFOJINI, INC (COLUMBIA, MD)	ENTRISON, LLC (MILWAUKEE, WI)	ABAXENT, LLC (PEWAUKEE, WI)	V GROUP, INC. (CRANBURY, NJ)	EXPERIS US, INC. (MILWAUKEE, WI)	SYSLOGIC, INC. (BROOKFIELD, WI)
SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED	NO	NO	NO	NO	YES	YES	NO	YES	YES
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	N/A	N/A	NO	N/A	YES	N/A	N/A	YES	N/A
GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION									
1 APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT (HOURLY RATE)									
1.1 IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER	\$130.00	\$87.00	\$110.00	\$100.00	\$130.00	\$125.00	\$103.69	\$95.00	\$115.00
1.2 PROJECT LEADER	\$120.00	\$77.00	\$85.00	\$84.50	\$145.00	\$100.00	\$98.56	\$70.00	\$90.00
1.3 SYSTEMS ANALYST	\$100.00	\$67.00	\$85.00	\$66.30	\$135.00	\$75.00	\$85.00	\$82.00	\$85.00
1.4 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST	\$100.00	\$70.00	\$90.00	\$71.50	\$130.00	\$90.00	\$88.67	\$80.00	\$70.00
1.5 PROGRAMMER	\$95.00	\$70.00	\$95.00	\$65.00	\$120.00	\$90.00	\$96.95	\$85.00	\$60.00
1.6 WEB DESIGNER	\$80.00	\$60.00	\$65.00	\$54.60	\$125.00	\$80.00	\$83.72	\$90.00	\$40.00
1.7 DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST	\$84.00	\$55.00	\$75.00	\$60.00	\$95.00	\$70.00	\$79.96	\$48.00	\$40.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 1	\$709.00	\$486.00	\$605.00	\$501.90	\$880.00	\$630.00	\$636.55	\$550.00	\$500.00
2 ORACLE PEOPLESFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT (HOURLY RATE)									
2.1 PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESFT DEVELOPMENT	\$150.00	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$80.00	NO BID	\$180.50	\$129.51	\$100.00	\$115.00
2.2 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE	\$145.00	\$105.00	\$130.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$147.50	\$129.00	\$95.00	\$90.00
2.3 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS//PAYROLL SUITE	\$145.00	\$120.00	\$130.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$147.50	\$130.02	\$95.00	\$90.00
2.4 ORACLE PEOPLESFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE	\$100.00	\$75.00	\$100.00	\$88.30	NO BID	\$100.00	\$105.74	\$125.00	\$75.00
2.5 ORACLE PEOPLESFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE	\$100.00	\$75.00	\$100.00	\$90.00	NO BID	\$100.00	\$105.74	\$125.00	\$75.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 2	\$640.00	\$465.00	\$600.00	\$258.30	\$0.00	\$675.50	\$600.01	\$540.00	\$445.00
3 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS) (HOURLY RATE)									
3.1 SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN	\$125.00	NO BID	\$75.00	\$32.50	NO BID	\$63.00	\$94.82	\$60.00	\$75.00
3.2 JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN	\$100.00	NO BID	\$55.00	\$35.10	NO BID	\$55.25	\$76.39	\$50.00	\$65.00
3.3 SENIOR GIS ANALYST	\$125.00	NO BID	\$70.00	\$45.36	NO BID	\$94.50	\$119.17	\$60.00	\$85.00
3.4 JUNIOR GIS ANALYST	\$100.00	NO BID	\$55.00	\$40.20	NO BID	\$78.75	\$75.11	\$50.00	\$60.00
3.5 GIS DEVELOPER	\$125.00	NO BID	\$75.00	\$58.24	NO BID	\$105.00	\$104.91	\$70.00	\$60.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 3	\$575.00	\$0.00	\$330.00	\$211.40	\$0.00	\$396.50	\$470.40	\$290.00	\$345.00
4 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT (HOURLY RATE)									
4.1 DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR	\$130.00	\$90.00	\$85.00	\$70.20	\$130.00	\$85.00	\$88.14	\$85.00	\$90.00
4.2 LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS	\$120.00	\$85.00	\$85.00	\$67.60	\$140.00	\$100.00	\$91.16	\$75.00	\$90.00
4.3 NETWORK SPECIALIST	\$100.00	\$35.00	\$75.00	\$48.10	\$140.00	\$80.00	\$88.00	\$60.00	\$70.00
4.4 TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST	\$100.00	\$45.00	\$75.00	\$45.86	\$130.00	\$65.00	\$80.37	\$65.00	\$65.00
4.5 SCCM SPECIALIST	\$130.00	\$55.00	\$75.00	\$60.90	\$130.00	\$80.00	\$91.29	\$60.00	\$65.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 4	\$580.00	\$310.00	\$395.00	\$292.66	\$670.00	\$410.00	\$438.96	\$345.00	\$380.00
GRAND TOTAL	\$2,504.00	\$1,261.00	\$1,930.00	\$1,264.26	\$1,550.00	\$2,112.00	\$2,112.00	\$1,725.00	\$1,670.00

BIDDER		CALIFORNIA CREATIVE SOLUTIONS, INC. DBA CCS GLOBAL TECH (POWAY, CA)	DEVICARE SOLUTIONS LTD (COLUMBUS, OH)	SENTINEL TECHNOLOGIES, INC. (DOWNERS GROVE, IL)	ACCOUNTING EQUIPMENT CORP DBA AE BUSINESS SOLUTIONS (MADISON, WI)	GNC CONSULTING, INC. (FRANKFORT, IL)	MARS IT CORPORATION DBA MARS SOLUTIONS GROUP (WAUKESHA, WI)	CYNET SYSTEMS, INC (STERLING, VA)
SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	YES
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION								
1 APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT (HOURLY RATE)								
1.1	IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER	\$150.00	\$105.00	\$118.00	\$92.00	NO BID	\$85.00	\$95.06
1.2	PROJECT LEADER	\$130.00	\$102.00	\$106.00	\$85.00	NO BID	\$75.00	\$72.75
1.3	SYSTEMS ANALYST	\$108.00	\$84.00	\$92.00	\$70.00	NO BID	\$65.00	\$72.75
1.4	PROGRAMMER/ANALYST	\$132.00	\$82.00	\$121.00	\$73.00	NO BID	\$70.00	\$72.75
1.5	PROGRAMMER	\$116.00	\$76.00	\$102.00	\$72.00	NO BID	\$70.00	\$77.60
1.6	WEB DESIGNER	\$104.00	\$79.00	\$82.00	\$65.00	NO BID	\$75.00	\$58.20
1.7	DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST	\$100.00	\$76.00	\$72.00	\$57.00	NO BID	\$55.00	\$77.60
TOTAL FOR GROUP 1		\$840.00	\$604.00	\$693.00	\$514.00	\$0.00	\$495.00	\$526.71
2 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT (HOURLY RATE)								
2.1	PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT	\$140.00	\$115.00	\$188.00	NO BID	\$175.00	\$115.00	\$116.40
2.2	SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE	\$120.00	\$112.00	\$160.00	NO BID	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$116.40
2.3	SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE	\$120.00	\$110.00	\$160.00	NO BID	\$150.00	\$145.00	\$116.40
2.4	ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE	\$125.00	\$73.00	\$140.00	NO BID	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$87.30
2.5	ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE	\$125.00	\$73.00	\$140.00	NO BID	\$110.00	\$105.00	\$87.30
TOTAL FOR GROUP 2		\$630.00	\$483.00	\$788.00	\$0.00	\$695.00	\$625.00	\$523.80
3 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS) (HOURLY RATE)								
3.1	SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN	\$159.00	\$73.00	\$210.00	NO BID	\$199.00	\$65.00	\$72.75
3.2	JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN	\$113.00	\$53.00	\$152.00	NO BID	\$142.00	\$55.00	\$53.35
3.3	SENIOR GIS ANALYST	\$153.00	\$78.00	\$202.00	NO BID	\$192.00	\$70.00	\$63.05
3.4	JUNIOR GIS ANALYST	\$113.00	\$53.00	\$152.00	NO BID	\$142.00	\$60.00	\$53.35
3.5	GIS DEVELOPER	\$153.00	\$83.00	\$202.00	NO BID	\$192.00	\$75.00	\$63.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 3		\$691.00	\$340.00	\$918.00	\$0.00	\$867.00	\$325.00	\$305.50
4 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT (HOURLY RATE)								
4.1	DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR	\$124.00	\$95.00	\$128.00	\$90.00	NO BID	\$80.00	\$82.45
4.2	LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS	\$132.00	\$85.00	\$98.00	\$85.00	NO BID	\$85.00	\$82.45
4.3	NETWORK SPECIALIST	\$119.00	\$75.00	\$92.00	\$53.00	NO BID	\$70.00	\$72.75
4.4	TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST	\$119.00	\$49.00	\$87.00	\$60.00	NO BID	\$60.00	\$48.50
4.5	SCCM SPECIALIST	\$140.00	\$65.00	\$95.00	\$73.00	NO BID	\$55.00	\$72.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP 4		\$634.00	\$369.00	\$500.00	\$361.00	\$0.00	\$350.00	\$358.15
GRAND TOTAL		\$2,795.00	\$1,796.00	\$2,899.00	\$875.00	\$1,562.00	\$1,795.00	\$2,712.02

NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:

- 1 DELDRI R. DUGGER DBA LELAND DUGGER & ASSOCIATES LLC (WAUKEGAN, IL) LATE BID
- 2 CIRRUSAGE LLC (GLENVIEW, IL) FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN DID NOT INCLUDE SBE FIRM AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID.
- 3 TECHDEMOCRACY LLC (PISCATAWAY, NJ) DID NOT SUBMIT FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 4 PAUL SOLOMON DBA SOLOMONS INTERNATIONAL, LLC (LANSDALE, PA) DID NOT SUBMIT COMPLETED FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 5 CAPITAL DATA, INC. (BROOKFIELD, WI) DID NOT SUBMIT INVITATION TO BID
- 6 N-TECH CONSULTING, LLC (GREEN BAY, WI) DID NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN GROUP AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 7 PARAGON DEVELOPMENT SYSTEMS, INC. (BROOKFIELD, WI) FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN DID NOT INCLUDE SBE FIRM AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 8 APTUDE, INC. (LISLE, IL) FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN DID NOT INCLUDE CERTIFIED SBE FIRM AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID

BID TABULATION #17704

VSC FOR IT PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
OPENED 05/11/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PURCHASING AGENT: JUWANIA A. KEYS
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3508
EMAIL: JUKEYS@MILWAUKEE.GOV

- 9 **NEW RESOURCES CONSULTING, LLC (MILWAUKEE, WI)** FORM A-CONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE PLAN DID NOT INCLUDE CERTIFIED SBE FIRM AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 10 **INSTANTSERVE, LLC (WAYNE, PA)** INCOMPLETE FORM A-CONTRACT COMPLIANCE PLAN
- 11 **HEARTLAND BUSINESS SYSTEMS, LLC (LITTLE CHUTE, WI)** DID NOT SUBMIT PRICING WITH BID
- 12 **INFOJINI, INC. (COLUMBIA, MD)** NON COMPLYING FOR GROUP 2 ONLY, DUE TO NOT BIDDING ON ENTIRE GROUP AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 13 **CONVERGEONE, INC. (BLOOMINGTON, MN)** DID NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN GROUP AS REQUIRED BY INVITATION TO BID
- 14 **CORE BTS, INC. (INDIANAPOLIS, IN)** TOOK EXCEPTION TO CITY'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS
- 15 **CHERRYROAD TECHNOLOGIES, INC. (MORRIS PLAINS, NJ)** PROVIDED A PRICE LIST THAT IS DIFFERENT THAN THE PRICE LIST REQUESTED

AWARD OF BID:

MULTIPLE AWARDS WILL BE MADE BY GROUP OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDERS COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS IN A GROUP TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD IN THAT GROUP.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF POSITIONS QUOTED IN EACH GROUP.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000. **EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017**, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S OFFICE OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$30,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

- THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
- THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% OR \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE
3. SRC BID INCENTIVE