

BID TABULATION #18452

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR AMMUNITION
OPENED 10/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PURCHASING AGENT: DIANA HERREJON
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3716
EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

| BIDDER | ITEM # | ITEM DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER & PART # | UOM | UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES) | ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE | ITEM TOTAL | GRAND TOTAL | LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? |
|---|--------|--|--------------------------------------|------------------|---|------------------------|--------------|----------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|
| CHRISTOPHER J. VEGA DBA EXTENSIVE ENTERPRISES CONFLICT SOLUTIONS, LLC (MILWAUKEE, WI) | A | CARTRIDGES, RIFLE .308 CALIBER, 168 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE308TT2 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM308-168 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$4,000.00 | 8,000 | \$32,000.00 | \$1,278,490.00 | NO | NO | YES |
| | B | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 55 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - AE223 (PREFERRED). MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER CARTRIDGES - USA223R1K | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM556-55 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,150.00 | 185,000 | \$212,750.00 | | | | |
| | C | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 62 GRAIN SPEER GOLD DOT SOFT POINT #24445SP MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER 64 GRAIN (5.56MM) CARTRIDGES - RA556B | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM556-62 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,200.00 | 15,000 | \$18,000.00 | | | | |
| | D | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4", 2-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE132-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FIOCCHI 128LE00B | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$4,800.00 | 45,000 | \$216,000.00 | | | | |
| | E | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4, 3-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE127-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FIOCCHI 12EX00BK OR 12BK008 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$4,800.00 | 6,000 | \$28,800.00 | | | | |
| | F | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN + P SPEER GOLD DOT 124GR+P - PART #53617 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM9-124+ | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$820.00 | 15,000 | \$12,300.00 | | | | |
| | G | CARTRIDGES, 9MM MARKING ROUNDS, 7 GRAIN SPEER FORCE -ON-FORCE MARKING CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTE) | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM9-SM | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$3,000.00 | 15,000 | \$45,000.00 | | | | |
| | H | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN LAWMAN CLEAN FIRE TMJ - 53824. VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE AMERICAN EAGLE INDOOR RANGE TRAINING - AE9N1, WINCHESTER WINCLEAN - WC92. | SKARZKOIRED LEGION MUNITIONS NR 1/19 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$820.00 | 800,000 | \$656,000.00 | | | | |
| | I | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC9NT3, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE LAWMAN RHT - 53365, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA9SF. | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM9-FRA | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,070.00 | 2,000 | \$2,140.00 | | | | |
| | J | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 X 45MM) FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5A, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA223SF. | RED LEGION MUNITIONS RLM556-FRA | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,100.00 | 5,000 | \$5,500.00 | | | | |
| | K | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2 3/4" 1OZ SLUG WINCHESTER RANGER SEGMENTED RIFLED SLUG - RA12RS15S, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE - FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LEB127 LRS, FEDERAL CARTRIDGES LE127 RS. | FIOCCHI 12LRS LUG | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$5,000.00 | 10,000 | \$50,000.00 | | | | |

| BIDDER | ITEM # | ITEM DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER & PART # | UOM | UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES) | ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE | ITEM TOTAL | GRAND TOTAL | LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? |
|---|--------|--|-----------------------|------------------|---|------------------------|--------------|--------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|
| KEISLER POLICE SUPPLY, INC. (JEFFERSON, IN) | A | CARTRIDGES, RIFLE .308 CALIBER, 168 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE308TT2 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL LE308TT2 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,479.50 | 8,000 | \$11,836.00 | \$305,605.30 | N/A | NO | NO |
| | B | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 55 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - AE223 (PREFERRED). MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER CARTRIDGES - USA223R1K | FEDERAL AE223 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$407.00 | 185,000 | \$75,295.00 | | | | |
| | C | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 62 GRAIN SPEER GOLD DOT SOFT POINT #24445SP MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER 64 GRAIN (5.56MM) CARTRIDGES - RA556B | SPEER 24445SP | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$503.80 | 15,000 | \$7,557.00 | | | | |
| | D | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4", 2-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE132-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL LE13200 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$594.00 | 45,000 | \$26,730.00 | | | | |
| | E | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4, 3-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE127-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL LE12700 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$594.00 | 6,000 | \$3,564.00 | | | | |
| | F | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN + P SPEER GOLD DOT 124GR+P - PART #53617 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | SPEER 53617 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$339.90 | 15,000 | \$5,098.50 | | | | |
| | G | CARTRIDGES, 9MM MARKING ROUNDS, 7 GRAIN SPEER FORCE -ON-FORCE MARKING CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTE) | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 15,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | H | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN LAWMAN CLEAN FIRE TMJ - 53824. VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE AMERICAN EAGLE INDOOR RANGE TRAINING - AE9N1, WINCHESTER WINCLEAN - WC92. | SPEER 53824 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$214.50 | 800,000 | \$171,600.00 | | | | |
| | I | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC9NT3, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE LAWMAN RHT - 53365, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA9SF. | SPEER 53365 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$405.90 | 2,000 | \$811.80 | | | | |
| | J | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 X 45MM) FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5A, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA223SF. | FEDERAL BC223NT5 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$622.60 | 5,000 | \$3,113.00 | | | | |
| | K | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2 3/4" 1OZ SLUG WINCHESTER RANGER SEGMENTED RIFLED SLUG - RA12RS15S, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE - FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LEB127 LRS, FEDERAL CARTRIDGES LE127 RS. | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 10,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |

| BIDDER | ITEM # | ITEM DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER & PART # | UOM | UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES) | ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE | ITEM TOTAL | GRAND TOTAL | LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? |
|--------------------------------|--------|--|--|------------------|---|------------------------|--------------|--------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|
| STREICHER'S, INC. (BUTLER, WI) | A | CARTRIDGES, RIFLE .308 CALIBER, 168 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE308TT2 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL CARTRIDGE LE308TT2 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$1,180.60 | 8,000 | \$9,444.80 | \$318,840.12 | N/A | NO | NO |
| | B | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 55 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - AE223 (PREFERRED). MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER CARTRIDGES - USA223R1K | FEDERAL CARTRIDGE AE223 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$405.96 | 185,000 | \$75,102.60 | | | | |
| | C | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 62 GRAIN SPEER GOLD DOT SOFT POINT #24445SP MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER 64 GRAIN (5.56MM) CARTRIDGES - RA556B | CCI SPEER 24445SP | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$502.50 | 15,000 | \$7,537.50 | | | | |
| | D | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4", 2-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE132-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL CARTRIDGE LE132-00 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$592.48 | 45,000 | \$26,661.60 | | | | |
| | E | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4, 3-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE127-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FEDERAL CARTRIDGE LE127-00 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$592.48 | 6,000 | \$3,554.88 | | | | |
| | F | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN + P SPEER GOLD DOT 124GR+P - PART #53617 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | CCI SPEER 53617 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$339.04 | 15,000 | \$5,085.60 | | | | |
| | G | CARTRIDGES, 9MM MARKING ROUNDS, 7 GRAIN SPEER FORCE -ON-FORCE MARKING CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTE) | FORCE ON FORCE 9MM NOW OWNED BY | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$638.82 | 15,000 | \$9,582.30 | | | | |
| | H | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN LAWMAN CLEAN FIRE TMJ - 53824. VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE AMERICAN EAGLE INDOOR RANGE TRAINING - AE9N1, WINCHESTER WINCLEAN - WC92. | 1)CCI SPEER 53814 2)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$213.95 | 800,000 | \$171,160.00 | | | | |
| | I | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC9NT3, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE LAWMAN RHT - 53365, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA9SF. | 1)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE BC9NT3 2)CCI SPEER | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$404.87 | 2,000 | \$809.74 | | | | |
| | J | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 X 45MM) FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5A, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE BALLISTIC CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA223SF. | 1)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE BC223NT5A 2)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$621.02 | 5,000 | \$3,105.10 | | | | |
| | K | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2 3/4" 1OZ SLUG WINCHESTER RANGER SEGMENTED RIFLED SLUG - RA12RS15S, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE - FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LEB127 LRS, FEDERAL CARTRIDGES LE127 RS. | 1)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE LEB127 2)FEDERAL CARTRIDGE | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$679.60 | 10,000 | \$6,796.00 | | | | |

BID TABULATION #18452VENDOR CONTRACT FOR AMMUNITION
OPENED 10/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CSTPURCHASING AGENT: DIANA HERREJON
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3716
EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

| BIDDER | ITEM # | ITEM DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER & PART # | UOM | UNIT PRICE (PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES) | ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE | ITEM TOTAL | GRAND TOTAL | LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? | SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED? |
|--|--------|---|-----------------------|---------------------|---|------------------------|--------------|--------------|--------------------------|---|--------------------------|
| RAY O'HERRON CO., INC (DANVILLE, IL) | A | CARTRIDGES, RIFLE .308 CALIBER, 168 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE308TT2 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 8,000 | \$0.00 | \$253,810.00 | N/A | NO | NO |
| | B | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 55 GRAIN FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - AE223 (PREFERRED), MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER CARTRIDGES - USA223R1K. | WINCHESTER USA223R1K | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$352.00 | 185,000 | \$65,120.00 | | | | |
| | C | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 x 45MM) CALIBER, 62 GRAIN SPEER GOLD DOT SOFT POINT #24445SP MAY SUBSTITUTE WINCHESTER 64 GRAIN (5.56MM) CARTRIDGES - RA656B | WINCHESTER RA556B | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$750.00 | 15,000 | \$11,250.00 | | | | |
| | D | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4", 2-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE132-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 45,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | E | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-3/4, 3-3/4 FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LE127-00 WITH FLIGHT-CONTROL WAD (NO SUBSTITUTE) | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 6,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | F | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN + P SPEER GOLD DOT 124GR+P - PART #53617 (NO SUBSTITUTE) | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 15,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | G | CARTRIDGES, 9MM MARKING ROUNDS, 7 GRAIN SPEER FORCE -ON-FORCE MARKING CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTE). | NO BID | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$0.00 | 15,000 | \$0.00 | | | | |
| | H | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, 124 GRAIN LAWMAN CLEAN FIRE TMJ - 53824, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE AMERICAN EAGLE INDOOR RANGE TRAINING - AE9N1, WINCHESTER WINCLEAN - WC92. | WINCHESTER WC92 | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$210.00 | 800,000 | \$168,000.00 | | | | |
| | I | CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER, FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC/CLEAN RHT - BC9NT3, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE LAWMAN RHT - 53365, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA9SF. | WINCHESTER RA9SF | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$395.00 | 2,000 | \$790.00 | | | | |
| | J | CARTRIDGES, .223 REMINGTON (5.56 X 45MM) FRANGIBLE BALLISTIC/CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5A, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE BALLISTIC/CLEAN RHT - BC223NT5, WINCHESTER RANGER FRANGIBLE SF - RA223SF. | WINCHESTER RA223SF | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$630.00 | 5,000 | \$3,150.00 | | | | |
| | K | SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2 3/4" 1OZ SLUG WINCHESTER RANGER SEGMENTED RIFLED SLUG - RA12RS1S, VENDOR MAY SUBSTITUTE - FEDERAL CARTRIDGES - LEB127 LRS, FEDERAL CARTRIDGES LE127 RS. | WINCHESTER RA12RS1S | 1,000 CARTRIDGES | \$550.00 | 10,000 | \$5,500.00 | | | | |

AWARD WILL BE MADE IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY THE GRAND TOTAL OF ALL ITEMS BID. THE GRAND TOTAL IS DETERMINED BY THE SUM OF THE ITEM TOTALS. ITEM TOTALS FOR EACH ITEM BID WILL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES BY THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE DIVIDED BY 1,000.

(PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES X ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE) ÷ 1,000 = ITEM TOTAL

SUM OF ITEM TOTALS = GRAND TOTAL

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S OFFICE OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

- THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
- THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM. IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% or \$25,000. IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE AN AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% or \$25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCEN
3. SRC BID INCENTIVE