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BID TABULATION # 17961 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR BRASS FITTINGS AND MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716

OPENED 01/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

LBE 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / 

AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

N/A YES, AMERICAN YES

GROUP ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION COMMODITY
ANNUAL 

USAGE

UNIT PRICE 

(EACH)
MANUFACTURER & PART # ITEM TOTAL GROUP TOTAL GRAND TOTAL 

1 1/2 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015739 20 $23.00 FORD METER (LFC2-13-NL) $460.00

2 5/8 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015740 20 $25.60 FORD METER (LFC2-23-NL) $512.00

3 3/4 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3000126 100 $27.50 FORD METER (LFSC2-33-NL) $2,750.00

4 1 THRD X 1 FLARE 3000127 100 $39.40 FORD METER (LFC2-44-NL) $3,940.00

1 5/8XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000128 50 $21.30 FORD METER (Q22-23-NL) $1,065.00

2 1/2XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000129 20 $24.30 FORD METER (Q22-13-NL, C24-33-NL) $486.00

3 3/4XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000130 300 $32.10 FORD METER (Q22-33-NL) $9,630.00

4 3/4XS  X  1 FLARE NON-INV 300 $38.50 FORD METER (Q22-34-NL) $11,550.00

5 3/4XXS X 1" FLARE NON-INV 300 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

6 1XS  X  1 FLARE 3000131 300 $33.90 FORD METER (Q22-44-NL) $10,170.00

7 1XS  X 3/4 FLARE 3000132 20 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

8 11/4XS X 1 FLARE 3000133 20 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

9 1 1/4XS X 1 1/4 FLARE 3000134 20 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

10 1 XXS X 1 FLARE 3000135 200 $42.80 FORD METER (Q32-44-NL) $8,560.00

11 3/4 XXS X 3/4 FLARE 3000137 200 $31.80 FORD METER (Q32-33-NL) $6,360.00

12 2 XS X 2 FLARE 3000140 20 $131.00 FORD METER (Q28-77-NL & C21-77 NL) $2,620.00

1 3/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012302 100 $38.10 FORD METER (FB600-3-NL) $3,810.00

2 1 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012304 1000 $49.00 FORD METER (FB600-4-NL) $49,000.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012305 20 $110.70 FORD METER (FB600-5-NL) $2,214.00

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012306 100 $116.00 FORD METER (FB600-6-NL) $11,600.00

5 2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012308 50 $202.60 FORD METER (FB600-7-NL) $10,130.00

1 3/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013014 200 $54.60 FORD METER (B22-333-NL) $10,920.00

2 1 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013016 600 $75.40 FORD METER (B22-444-NL) $45,240.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013018 30 $128.30 FORD METER (B22-555-NL) $3,849.00

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013020 30 $183.10 FORD METER (B22-666-NL) $5,493.00

5 2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013022 50 $299.80 FORD METER (B22-777-NL) $14,990.00

1 3/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084014 100 $13.70 FORD METER (C22-33-NL) $1,370.00

2 3/4 X 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084015 10 $20.20 FORD METER (C22-34-NL) $202.00

3 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084016 100 $23.95 FORD METER (C22-44-NL) $2,395.00

4 1 1/2 FLARE X FLARE 3084018 30 $72.00 FORD METER (C22-66-NL) $2,160.00

5 1 X 1 1/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084019 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

6 2 FLARE X FLARE 3084020 20 $117.50 FORD METER (C22-77-NL) $2,350.00

1 4"  W/ 1"        CC TAP THREAD 3090817 5 $74.00 FORD METER (202B-540-CC4) $370.00

2 4"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090821 5 $86.30 FORD METER (202B-540-CC6) $431.50

3 6"  W/ 3/4       CC TAP THREAD 3090822 5 $87.20 FORD METER (202B-750-CC3) $436.00

4 6"  W/1"          CC TAP THREAD 3090824 20 $87.20 FORD METER (202B-750-CC4) $1,744.00

5 6"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090825 35 $99.70 FORD METER (202B-750-CC6) $3,489.50

6 6"  W/2"         CC TAP THREAD 3090827 5 $109.50 FORD METER (202B-750-CC7) $547.50

7 8   W/1"         CC TAP THREAD 3090830 20 $107.90 FORD METER (202B-962-CC4) $2,158.00

8 8"  W / 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090832 50 $113.60 FORD METER (202B-962-CC6) $5,680.00

9 8"  W / 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090839 15 $123.70 FORD METER (202B-962-CC7) $1,855.50

10 12" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090833 15 $176.50 FORD METER (202B-1438-CC6) $2,647.50

11 12" W/ 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090834 5 $179.70 FORD METER (202B-1438-CC7) $898.50

12 16" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090835 20 $406.70 FORD METER (202B-1840-CC6) $8,134.00

13 16" W/2"        CC TAP THREAD 3090836 5 $449.40 FORD METER (202B-1840-CC7) $2,247.00

1 3/4 "     SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $26.30 FORD METER (SI-3-NL) $2,630.00

2 1 "        SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 300 $38.70 FORD METER (SI-4-NL) $11,610.00

3 1 1/4 "  SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 25 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

4 1 1/2  " SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $87.00 FORD METER (SI-6-NL) $8,700.00

5 2"         SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $151.30 FORD METER (SI-7-NL) $15,130.00

6 1" FEMFLARE X 3/4            MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 50 $16.20 FORD METER (CO2-43-NL) $810.00

7 1" FEM FLARE X 1 1/4        MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $35.20 FORD METER (CO2-45-NL) $352.00

8 1" FEM FLARE X  2"           MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $69.80 FORD METER (CO2-74-NL) $698.00

9 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 1 1/2   MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $56.90 FORD METER (CO2-65-NL) $569.00

10 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE      "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $84.80 FORD METER (CO2-75-NL) $848.00

11 1 1/2 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $91.80 FORD METER (CO2-76-NL) $918.00

12 3/4" FEM FLARE X 3/4 XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $8.80 FORD METER (CO1-44-NL) $132.00

13 1" FEM FLARE X 1" XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 25 $14.90 FORD METER (CO1-33-NL) $372.50

14 2" FEM FLARE X 2"XS  MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $54.50 FORD METER (CO1-77-NL) $817.50

15 PLUG BRASS 3/4   CC THREAD 3072175 20 $7.40 FORD METER (CSP-3-A-NL) $148.00

16 PLUG BRASS 5/8"  CC THREAD 3072218 20 $12.20 FORD METER (CSP-2-A-NL) $244.00

17 PLUG BRASS 1/2"  CC THREAD 3072223 20 $12.20 FORD METER (CSP-1-A-NL) $244.00

18 PLUG BRASS 1"     CC THREAD 3072225 20 $10.80 FORD METER (CSP-4-A-NL) $216.00

19 PLUG BRASS 1 1/2  CC THREAD 3072227 20 $29.30 FORD METER (CSP-6-A-NL) $586.00

20 PLUG BRASS 2"      CC THREAD 3072228 20 $50.20 FORD METER (CSP-7-A-NL) $1,004.00

21 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1" CC THRD 3073375 20 $11.70 FORD METER (BBAA-43-NL) $234.00

22 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073377 20 $31.60 FORD METER (BBAA-63-NL) $632.00

23 RED BUSHING 1 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073387 20 $31.70 FORD METER (BBAA-64-NL) $634.00

24 RED BUSHING 1 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $51.70 FORD METER (BBAA-74-NL) $1,034.00

25 RED BUSHING 1 1/2 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $38.60 FORD METER (BBAA-76-NL) $772.00

26 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 2" HD 3096432 10 $134.45 MATCO-NORCA (DB-LX9008LF) $1,344.50

27 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1" HD 3096431 10 $30.35 MATCO-NORCA (DB-LX9005LF) $303.50

28 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $80.75 MATCO-NORCA (DB-LX9007LF) $807.50

29 ELBOW STREET 1" HD 3096471 10 $72.15 MATCO-NORCA (DB-LSTX9005LF) $721.50

30 ELBOW STREET 2" HD 3096472 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

31 ELBOW STREET 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $146.85 MATCO-NORCA (DB-LSTX9007LF) $1,468.50

32 CAP 1" HD 3096441 10 $34.00 MATCO-NORCA (DB-CAX05LF) $340.00

33 CAP 2" HD 3096442 10 $99.50 MATCO-NORCA (DB-CAX08LF) $995.00

34 CAP 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $85.15 MATCO-NORCA (DB-CAX07LF) $851.50

35 NIPPLE 1"      CLOSE HD 3096451 10 $5.81 MERIT BRASS (2216-001) $58.10

36 NIPPLE 1 1/2  CLOSE HD NON-INV 10 $11.40 MERIT BRASS (2224-001) $114.00

37 NIPPLE 2"      CLOSE HD 3096452 10 $17.40 MERIT BRASS (2232-001) $174.00

38 NIPPLE 1 X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $12.55 MERIT BRASS (2216-400) $125.50

39 NIPPLE 1 X 6    LNG HD NON-INV 10 $18.50 MERIT BRASS (2216-600) $185.00

40 NIPPLE 1 X 12  LNG HD NON-INV 10 $36.35 MERIT BRASS (2216-1200) $363.50

41 NIPPLE 2" X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $28.35 MERIT BRASS (2232-400) $283.50

42 NIPPLE 2" X 6   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $41.80 MERIT BRASS (2232-600) $418.00

$313,177.10

$7,662.00

$76,754.00

$58,712.10

$50,441.00

$80,492.00

$8,477.00

$30,639.00

GROUP 7 - MISC:

BIDDER: 

CORE & MAIN LP (NEW BERLIN, WI)

GROUP 1 - 

COUPLING, CORP 

STOP 

GROUP 5 - THREE 

PART UNION 

STRAIGHT CPLNG

GROUP 6 - BRONZE 

SADDLES W/AWWA 

THREAD

GROUP 2 - 

COUPLING, LEAD PAK

GROUP 3 - 

CORPORATION STOP 

300 PSI

GROUP 4 - CURB 

STOP 300 PSI
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BID TABULATION # 17961 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR BRASS FITTINGS AND MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716

OPENED 01/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

43 NIPPLE 2" X 12 LNG HD NON-INV 10 $82.35 MERIT BRASS (2232-1200) $823.50

44 STOP & DRAIN 1"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096401 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

45 STOP & DRAIN 2"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096402 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

46 STOP & DRAIN 1 1/2  W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS NON-INV 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

LBE 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / 

AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

N/A NO NO

GROUP ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION COMMODITY
ANNUAL 

USAGE

UNIT PRICE 

(EACH)
MANUFACTURER & PART # ITEM TOTAL GROUP TOTAL GRAND TOTAL 

1 1/2 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015739 20 $12.15 MUELLER 15480 163N $243.00

2 5/8 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015740 20 $14.85 MUELLER 15480 203N $297.00

3 3/4 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3000126 100 $14.10 MUELLER 15480 250N $1,410.00

4 1 THRD X 1 FLARE 3000127 100 $16.55 MUELLER 15480 330N $1,655.00

1 5/8XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000128 50 $26.15 FORD METER BOX Q22-33-NL $1,307.50

2 1/2XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000129 20 $19.80 FORD METER BOX C24-33-NL-Q22-13-NL $396.00

3 3/4XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000130 300 $26.15 FORD METER BOX Q22-33-NL $7,845.00

4 3/4XS  X  1 FLARE NON-INV 300 $37.40 FORD METER BOX Q22-34-NL $11,220.00

5 3/4XXS X 1" FLARE NON-INV 300 $41.60 FORD METER BOX $12,480.00

6 1XS  X  1 FLARE 3000131 300 $32.90 FORD METER BOX Q22-44-NL $9,870.00

7 1XS  X 3/4 FLARE 3000132 20 $41.60 FORD METER BOX $832.00

8 11/4XS X 1 FLARE 3000133 20 $41.60 FORD METER BOX $832.00

9 1 1/4XS X 1 1/4 FLARE 3000134 20 $41.60 FORD METER BOX $832.00

10 1 XXS X 1 FLARE 3000135 200 $41.60 FORD METER BOX Q32-44-NL $8,320.00

11 3/4 XXS X 3/4 FLARE 3000137 200 $30.85 FORD METER BOX Q32-33-NL $6,170.00

12 2 XS X 2 FLARE 3000140 20 $41.60 FORD METER BOX $832.00

1 3/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012302 100 $36.90 MUELLER 25000 250N $3,690.00

2 1 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012304 1000 $47.35 MUELLER 25000 330N $47,350.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012305 20 $107.35 FORD METER BOX FB600-5-NL $2,147.00

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012306 100 $112.85 MUELLER 25000 500N $11,285.00

5 2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012308 50 $197.15 MUELLER 25000 550N $9,857.50

1 3/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013014 200 $50.15 MUELLER 25204 250N $10,030.00

2 1 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013016 600 $69.30 MUELLER 25204 330N $41,580.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013018 30 $124.40 FORD METER BOX B22-555-NL $3,732.00

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013020 30 $169.50 MUELLER 25204 500M $5,085.00

5 2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013022 50 $277.50 MUELLER 25204 550N $13,875.00

1 3/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084014 100 $13.55 MUELLER 15400 250N $1,355.00

2 3/4 X 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084015 10 $20.05 MUELLER 15400 254N $200.50

3 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084016 100 $23.65 MUELLER 15400 330N $2,365.00

4 1 1/2 FLARE X FLARE 3084018 30 $71.60 MUELLER 15400 500N $2,148.00

5 1 X 1 1/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084019 10 $51.25 MUELLER 15400 422N $512.50

6 2 FLARE X FLARE 3084020 20 $78.60 MUELLER 15400 550N $1,572.00

1 4"  W/ 1"        CC TAP THREAD 3090817 5 $68.80 MUELLER BR2B0474CC100 $344.00

2 4"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090821 5 $80.05 MUELLER BR2B0474CC150 $400.25

3 6"  W/ 3/4       CC TAP THREAD 3090822 5 $81.00 MUELLER BR2B0684CC075 $405.00

4 6"  W/1"          CC TAP THREAD 3090824 20 $81.00 MUELLER BR2B0684CC100 $1,620.00

5 6"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090825 35 $92.65 MUELLER BR2B0684CC150 $3,242.75

6 6"  W/2"         CC TAP THREAD 3090827 5 $101.80 MUELLER BR2B0684CC200 $509.00

7 8   W/1"         CC TAP THREAD 3090830 20 $100.30 MUELLER BR2B0899CC100 $2,006.00

8 8"  W / 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090832 50 $105.60 MUELLER BR2B0899CC150 $5,280.00

9 8"  W / 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090839 15 $115.10 MUELLER BR2B0899CC200 $1,726.50

10 12" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090833 15 $164.10 MUELLER BR2B1314CC150 $2,461.50

11 12" W/ 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090834 5 $167.05 MUELLER BR2B1314CC200 $835.25

12 16" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090835 20 $391.35 MUELLER BR2B1732CC150 $7,827.00

13 16" W/2"        CC TAP THREAD 3090836 5 $432.50 MUELLER BR2B1732CC200 $2,162.50

1 3/4 "     SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $30.50 FORD METER BOX SI-3-NL $3,050.00

2 1 "        SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 300 $44.75 FORD METER BOX SI-4-NL $13,425.00

3 1 1/4 "  SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 25 $175.70 FORD METER BOX SI-5-NL $4,392.50

4 1 1/2  " SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $100.45 FORD METER BOX SI-6-NL $10,045.00

5 2"         SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $175.70 FORD METER BOX SI-7-NL $17,570.00

6 1" FEMFLARE X 3/4            MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 50 $18.75 FORD METER BOX C02-43-NL $937.50

7 1" FEM FLARE X 1 1/4        MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $40.70 FORD METER BOX C02-45-NL $407.00

8 1" FEM FLARE X  2"           MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $80.65 FORD METER BOX C02-74-NL $806.50

9 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 1 1/2   MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $65.75 FORD METER BOX C02-65-NL $657.50

10 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE      "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $97.90 FORD METER BOX C02-75-NL $979.00

11 1 1/2 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $106.00 FORD METER BOX C02-76-NL $1,060.00

12 3/4" FEM FLARE X 3/4 XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $10.25 FORD METER BOX C01-33-NL $153.75

13 1" FEM FLARE X 1" XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 25 $17.30 FORD METER BOX C01-44-NL $432.50

14 2" FEM FLARE X 2"XS  MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $63.00 FORD METER BOX C01-77-NL $945.00

15 PLUG BRASS 3/4   CC THREAD 3072175 20 $10.20 MUELLER 10033 250N $204.00

16 PLUG BRASS 5/8"  CC THREAD 3072218 20 $12.00 MUELLER 10033 200N $240.00

17 PLUG BRASS 1/2"  CC THREAD 3072223 20 $11.85 MUELLER 10033 160N $237.00

18 PLUG BRASS 1"     CC THREAD 3072225 20 $10.80 MUELLER 10033 330N $216.00

19 PLUG BRASS 1 1/2  CC THREAD 3072227 20 $19.20 MUELLER 10033 500N $384.00

20 PLUG BRASS 2"      CC THREAD 3072228 20 $24.90 MUELLER 10033 550N $498.00

21 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1" CC THRD 3073375 20 $11.35 FORD METER BOX BBAA-43-NL $227.00

22 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073377 20 $30.65 FORD METER BOX BBAA-63-NL $613.00

23 RED BUSHING 1 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073387 20 $30.75 FORD METER BOX BBAA-64-NL $615.00

24 RED BUSHING 1 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $50.15 FORD METER BOX BBAA-74-NL $1,003.00

25 RED BUSHING 1 1/2 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $37.40 FORD METER BOX BBAA-76-NL $748.00

26 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 2" HD 3096432 10 $16.85 LEGEND BRASS $168.50

27 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1" HD 3096431 10 $5.20 LEGEND BRASS $52.00

28 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $10.35 LEGEND BRASS $103.50

29 ELBOW STREET 1" HD 3096471 10 $7.25 LEGEND BRASS $72.50

30 ELBOW STREET 2" HD 3096472 10 $24.60 LEGEND BRASS $246.00

31 ELBOW STREET 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $14.50 LEGEND BRASS $145.00

32 CAP 1" HD 3096441 10 $3.40 LEGEND BRASS $34.00

33 CAP 2" HD 3096442 10 $11.90 LEGEND BRASS $119.00

34 CAP 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $7.00 LEGEND BRASS $70.00

35 NIPPLE 1"      CLOSE HD 3096451 10 $2.00 LEGEND BRASS $20.00

36 NIPPLE 1 1/2  CLOSE HD NON-INV 10 $3.90 LEGEND BRASS $39.00

37 NIPPLE 2"      CLOSE HD 3096452 10 $6.00 LEGEND BRASS $60.00

38 NIPPLE 1 X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $4.30 LEGEND BRASS $43.00

39 NIPPLE 1 X 6    LNG HD NON-INV 10 $6.35 LEGEND BRASS $63.50

40 NIPPLE 1 X 12  LNG HD NON-INV 10 $12.55 LEGEND BRASS $125.50

$313,177.10

$58,712.10

ETNA DISTRIBUTORS, LLC DBA ETNA SUPPLY COMPANY (GRAND RAPIDS, MI)

GROUP 1 - 

COUPLING, CORP 

STOP 

$3,605.00

GROUP 7 - MISC:

BIDDER: 

$316,424.00

GROUP 2 - 

COUPLING, LEAD PAK
$60,936.50

GROUP 3 - 

CORPORATION STOP 

300 PSI

$74,329.50

GROUP 4 - CURB 

STOP 300 PSI
$74,302.00

GROUP 5 - THREE 

PART UNION 

STRAIGHT CPLNG

$8,153.00

GROUP 6 - BRONZE 

SADDLES W/AWWA 

THREAD

$28,819.75

GROUP 7 - MISC: $66,278.25
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BID TABULATION # 17961 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR BRASS FITTINGS AND MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716

OPENED 01/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

41 NIPPLE 2" X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $9.75 LEGEND BRASS $97.50

42 NIPPLE 2" X 6   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $14.40 LEGEND BRASS $144.00

43 NIPPLE 2" X 12 LNG HD NON-INV 10 $28.40 LEGEND BRASS $284.00

44 STOP & DRAIN 1"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096401 10 $73.50 FORD METER BOX B11-444SW-NL $735.00

45 STOP & DRAIN 2"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096402 10 $220.35 FORD METER BOX B11-777SW-NL $2,203.50

46 STOP & DRAIN 1 1/2  W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS NON-INV 10 $160.65 FORD METER BOX B11-666SW-NL $1,606.50

LBE 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / 

AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

SRC AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

YES YES, AMERICAN YES

GROUP ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION COMMODITY
ANNUAL 

USAGE

UNIT PRICE 

(EACH)
MANUFACTURER & PART # ITEM TOTAL GROUP TOTAL GRAND TOTAL 

1 1/2 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015739 20 $14.70 AY MCDONALD M74742 $294.00

2 5/8 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3015740 20 $15.90 AY MCDONALD M74742 $318.00

3 3/4 THRD X 3/4 FLARE 3000126 100 $15.30 AY MCDONALD M74742 $1,530.00

4 1 THRD X 1 FLARE 3000127 100 $25.60 AY MCDONALD M74742 $2,560.00

1 5/8XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000128 50 $21.82 AY MCDONALD M74758C-67 $1,091.00

2 1/2XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000129 20 $22.58 AY MCDONALD M74758C-67 $451.60

3 3/4XS X 3/4 FLARE 3000130 300 $29.10 AY MCDONALD M74758C-67 $8,730.00

4 3/4XS  X  1 FLARE NON-INV 300 $40.63 AY MCDONALD M74758C-67 $12,189.00

5 3/4XXS X 1" FLARE NON-INV 300 $40.63 AY MCDONALD M74758C-68 $12,189.00

6 1XS  X  1 FLARE 3000131 300 $37.45 AY MCDONALD M74758C-67 $11,235.00

7 1XS  X 3/4 FLARE 3000132 20 $50.38 AY MCDONALD M74753C-67/M74754 $1,007.60

8 11/4XS X 1 FLARE 3000133 20 $62.30 AY MCDONALD M74753C-67/M74754 $1,246.00

9 1 1/4XS X 1 1/4 FLARE 3000134 20 $71.63 AY MCDONALD M74753C-67/M74754 $1,432.60

10 1 XXS X 1 FLARE 3000135 200 $47.86 AY MCDONALD M74758C-68 $9,572.00

11 3/4 XXS X 3/4 FLARE 3000137 200 $34.31 AY MCDONALD M74758C-68 $6,862.00

12 2 XS X 2 FLARE 3000140 20 $209.00 AY MCDONALD M74753C-67/M74754 $4,180.00

1 3/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012302 100 $42.16 AY MCDONALD M74701B $4,216.00

2 1 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012304 1000 $49.92 AY MCDONALD M74701B $49,920.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012305 20 $116.75 AY MCDONALD M74701B $2,335.00

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012306 100 $125.05 AY MCDONALD M74701B $12,505.00

5 2 BALL STYLE CC X FLARE 3012308 50 $218.70 AY MCDONALD M74701B $10,935.00

1 3/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013014 200 $57.53 AY MCDONALD M76100 $11,506.00

2 1 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013016 600 $77.94 AY MCDONALD M76100 $46,764.00

3 1 1/4 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013018 30 $132.57 AY MCDONALD M76100 $3,977.10

4 1 1/2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013020 30 $197.68 AY MCDONALD M76100 $5,930.40

5 2 BALL STYLE FLARE X FLARE 3013022 50 $315.89 AY MCDONALD M76100 $15,794.50

1 3/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084014 100 $14.94 AY MCDONALD M74758 $1,494.00

2 3/4 X 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084015 10 $21.90 AY MCDONALD M74758 $219.00

3 1 FLARE X FLARE 3084016 100 $26.71 AY MCDONALD M74758 $2,671.00

4 1 1/2 FLARE X FLARE 3084018 30 $80.45 AY MCDONALD M74758 $2,413.50

5 1 X 1 1/4 FLARE X FLARE 3084019 10 $54.78 AY MCDONALD M74753/M74754 $547.80

6 2 FLARE X FLARE 3084020 20 $129.77 AY MCDONALD M74758 $2,595.40

1 4"  W/ 1"        CC TAP THREAD 3090817 5 $80.14 AY MCDONALD M3825 $400.70

2 4"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090821 5 $94.05 AY MCDONALD M3825 $470.25

3 6"  W/ 3/4       CC TAP THREAD 3090822 5 $94.61 AY MCDONALD M3825 $473.05

4 6"  W/1"          CC TAP THREAD 3090824 20 $94.61 AY MCDONALD M3825 $1,892.20

5 6"  W/ 1 1/2    CC TAP THREAD 3090825 35 $110.73 AY MCDONALD M3825 $3,875.55

6 6"  W/2"         CC TAP THREAD 3090827 5 $121.53 AY MCDONALD M3825 $607.65

7 8   W/1"         CC TAP THREAD 3090830 20 $119.61 AY MCDONALD M3825 $2,392.20

8 8"  W / 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090832 50 $122.09 AY MCDONALD M3825 $6,104.50

9 8"  W / 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090839 15 $137.42 AY MCDONALD M3825 $2,061.30

10 12" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090833 15 $195.35 AY MCDONALD M3825 $2,930.25

11 12" W/ 2"       CC TAP THREAD 3090834 5 $198.76 AY MCDONALD M3825 $993.80

12 16" W/ 1 1/2   CC TAP THREAD 3090835 20 $436.11 AY MCDONALD M3825 $8,722.20

13 16" W/2"        CC TAP THREAD 3090836 5 $499.71 AY MCDONALD M3825 $2,498.55

1 3/4 "     SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $29.47 AY MCDONALD M74755DBL $2,947.00

2 1 "        SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 300 $41.74 AY MCDONALD M74755DBL $12,522.00

3 1 1/4 "  SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 25 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

4 1 1/2  " SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $94.61 AY MCDONALD M74755DBL $9,461.00

5 2"         SERVICE NUT INSULATOR W/COPPER GASKET NON-INV 100 $159.44 AY MCDONALD M74755DBL $15,944.00

6 1" FEMFLARE X 3/4            MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 50 $18.25 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $912.50

7 1" FEM FLARE X 1 1/4        MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $35.50 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $355.00

8 1" FEM FLARE X  2"           MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $83.75 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $837.50

9 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 1 1/2   MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $71.50 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $715.00

10 1 1/4 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE      "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $106.00 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $1,060.00

11 1 1/2 FEM FLARE X 2"       MALE FLARE     "PIGGY BACK" NON-INV 10 $114.00 AY MCDONDALD M74755 $1,140.00

12 3/4" FEM FLARE X 3/4 XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $7.79 AY MCDONALD M74755M $116.85

13 1" FEM FLARE X 1" XS MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 25 $13.55 AY MCDONALD M74755M $338.75

14 2" FEM FLARE X 2"XS  MALE FLARE STRAIGHT COUPLING NON-INV 15 $49.95 AY MCDONALD M74755M $749.25

15 PLUG BRASS 3/4   CC THREAD 3072175 20 $7.15 AY MCDONALD M73206 $143.00

16 PLUG BRASS 5/8"  CC THREAD 3072218 20 $14.75 AY MCDONALD M73206 $295.00

17 PLUG BRASS 1/2"  CC THREAD 3072223 20 $14.53 AY MCDONALD M73206 $290.60

18 PLUG BRASS 1"     CC THREAD 3072225 20 $10.42 AY MCDONALD M73206 $208.40

19 PLUG BRASS 1 1/2  CC THREAD 3072227 20 $23.36 AY MCDONALD M73206 $467.20

20 PLUG BRASS 2"      CC THREAD 3072228 20 $30.30 AY MCDONALD M73206 $606.00

21 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1" CC THRD 3073375 20 $11.75 AY MCDONALD M747011 $235.00

22 RED BUSHING 3/4 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073377 20 $33.90 AY MCDONALD M747011 $678.00

23 RED BUSHING 1 X 1 1/2" CC THRD 3073387 20 $33.95 AY MCDONALD M747011 $679.00

24 RED BUSHING 1 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $51.85 AY MCDONALD M747011 $1,037.00

25 RED BUSHING 1 1/2 X 2" CC THRD NON-INV 20 $38.66 AY MCDONALD M747011 $773.20

26 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 2" HD 3096432 10 $141.92 MERIT BRASS NL 150-32 $1,419.20

27 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1" HD 3096431 10 $32.00 MERIT BRASS NL 150-16 $320.00

28 90 DEG BRASS ELBOW 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $85.22 MERIT BRASS NL 150-24 $852.20

29 ELBOW STREET 1" HD 3096471 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

30 ELBOW STREET 2" HD 3096472 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

31 ELBOW STREET 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $155.00 MERIT BRASS NL 160-24 $1,550.00

32 CAP 1" HD 3096441 10 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

33 CAP 2" HD 3096442 10 $105.00 MERIT BRASS NL158-32 $1,050.00

34 CAP 1 1/2 HD NON-INV 10 $89.87 SPEC6 MERIT BRASS $898.70

35 NIPPLE 1"      CLOSE HD 3096451 10 $6.59 MERIT BRASS 2216-001 $65.90

36 NIPPLE 1 1/2  CLOSE HD NON-INV 10 $12.92 MERIT BRASS 2224-001 $129.20

37 NIPPLE 2"      CLOSE HD 3096452 10 $19.68 MERIT BRASS 2232-001 $196.80

38 NIPPLE 1 X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $14.22 MERIT BRASS 2216-400 $142.20

$66,855.35

$316,424.00

GROUP 7 - MISC: $66,278.25

BIDDER: 

WAYNE HAMPTON DBA PRICE AND SONS, INC. (MILWUAKEE, WI)

GROUP 1 - 

COUPLING, CORP 

STOP 

$4,702.00

$348,989.05

GROUP 2 - 

COUPLING, LEAD PAK
$70,185.80

GROUP 3 - 

CORPORATION STOP 

300 PSI

$79,911.00

GROUP 4 - CURB 

STOP 300 PSI
$83,972.00

GROUP 5 - THREE 

PART UNION 

STRAIGHT CPLNG

$9,940.70

GROUP 6 - BRONZE 

SADDLES W/AWWA 

THREAD

$33,422.20

GROUP 7 - MISC:
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BID TABULATION # 17961 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR BRASS FITTINGS AND MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716

OPENED 01/12/2021 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

39 NIPPLE 1 X 6    LNG HD NON-INV 10 $20.93 MERIT BRASS 2216-600 $209.30

40 NIPPLE 1 X 12  LNG HD NON-INV 10 $41.21 MERIT BRASS 2216-1200 $412.10

41 NIPPLE 2" X 4   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $32.09 MERIT BRASS 2232-400 $320.90

42 NIPPLE 2" X 6   LNG HD NON-INV 10 $47.37 MERIT BRASS 2232-600 $473.70

43 NIPPLE 2" X 12 LNG HD NON-INV 10 $93.34 MERIT BRASS 2232-1200 $933.40

44 STOP & DRAIN 1"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096401 10 $86.85 AY MCDONALD M7600 $868.50

45 STOP & DRAIN 2"      W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS 3096402 10 $260.40 AY MCDONALD M7600 $2,604.00

46 STOP & DRAIN 1 1/2  W/FEM IRON PIPE ENDS NON-INV 10 $189.80 AY MCDONALD M7600 $1,898.00

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY GROUP OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE 

CITY.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE 

DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.  EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE’S OFFICE OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE 

AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

●THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND

●THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or $25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS 

NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% or $25,000.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-

MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE AN AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% OR $25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED 

THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF 

THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1.  A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE 

PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1.  SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS 

DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE

2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE

3. SRC BID INCENTIVE

$66,855.35

$348,989.05

GROUP 7 - MISC:


