
BID TABULATION #17612 PURCHASING AGENT:  ANN PATZ

DNC VEHICLE AND VAN RENTAL (SHORT TERM) TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588

OPENED 7/30/2020 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: ANNPAT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER ITEM #
ITEM

DESCRIPTION

MANUFACTURER & 

PART #
UOM

UNIT

PRICE
QTY TOTAL GRAND TOTAL

LBE AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN 

AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

SRC 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

1

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PREMIUM 

SUV

NO BID EA $0.00 0 $0.00

2

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) STANDARD 

UTILITY VEHICLE 

(STANDARD)

NO BID EA $0.00 0 $0.00

3

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) STANDARD 

UTILITY VEHICLE 

(FULL SIZE)

NO BID EA $0.00 0 $0.00

4

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PASSENGER 

VAN

NO BID EA $0.00 0 $0.00

5

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PASSENGER 

MINIVAN

FORD T350 (12 

PERSON-PASSENGER 

VAN

EA $863.00 5 $4,315.00

1

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PREMIUM 

SUV

CADILLAC ESCALADE 

ESV  & LINCOLN 

NAVIGATOR 

EXTENDED

EA $2,400.00 2 $4,800.00

2

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) STANDARD 

UTILITY VEHICLE 

(STANDARD)

FORD EXPEDITION 

EXTENDED OR CHEVY
EA $2,200.00 2 $4,400.00

3

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) STANDARD 

UTILITY VEHICLE 

(FULL SIZE)

FORD EXP EA $2,080.00 2 $4,160.00

4

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PASSENGER 

VAN

FORD TRANSIT EA $2,800.00 7 $19,600.00

5

VEHICLE AND VAN 

RENTAL (SHORT 

TERM) PASSENGER 

MINIVAN

FORD TRANSIT EA $2,600.00 1 $2,600.00

NO$4,315.00

A-LIST LIMOUSINE & TRANSIT 

SERVICES, LTD

(PLEASANT PRAIRIE, WI)

$35,560.00 N/A NO NO

HERC RENTALS, INC.

(OAK CREEK, WI)
N/A NO

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, 

WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.
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2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE

3. SRC BID INCENTIVE

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE 

THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.  EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE’S OFFICE 

OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED 

$30,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM.  

IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% 

or $25,000.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE AN AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT 

INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% OR $25,000.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT 

ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1.  A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL 

FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1.  SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN 

AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY 

FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
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