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BID TABULATION # 17311 PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANA HERREJON 

VC FOR WATER FILTRATION DEVICES TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3716

OPENED 04/02/2020 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: DIHERRE@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER
GROUP 

#

ITEM 

#

ITEM

DESCRIPTION
MANUFACTURER & PART #

PASS 

THROUGH 

VOLUME PER 

FILTER (IN 

GALLONS)

UOM
UNIT

PRICE
QTY TOTAL

GROUP 

TOTAL

GRAND 

TOTAL

LBE AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

BUY 

MILWAUKEE / 

AMERICAN 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

SRC 

AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

1 PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT

PUR-PPT111

PUR ULTIMATE 11 CUP PITCHER WITH LED & LEAD REDUCTION 

FILTER 

N/A EA $25.19 4,000 $100,760.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: 

PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT

PUR-PPF951K3 *SHIPPED IN CASES OF 3 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

PUR ULTIMATE LEAD REDUCTION PITCHER REPLACEMENT FILTER
40 EA $7.09 4,000 $28,360.00

1 FAUCET MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT
PUR-FM3333BV2

PUR WHITE VERTICAL FAUCET MOUNT WITH 1 BASIC FILTER
N/A EA $14.79 4,000 $59,160.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: FAUCET 

MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT

PUR-RF99993 * SHIPPED IN CASES OF 3 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

PUR FAUCET MOUNT MINERAL CLEAR REPLACEMENT FILTER
100 EA $8.69 4,000 $34,760.00

1 PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT WTP200 - PART #25CA59 (10 CUP) N/A EA $16.00 4,000 $64,000.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: 

PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT
WFPTC 100N - PART #25CA60 40 EA $5.00 4,000 $20,000.00

1 FAUCET MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT WFFM 200W - PART #25CA47 N/A EA $16.00 4,000 $64,000.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: FAUCET 

MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT

WFFMC3030 - PART # 25CA56

$31.00 FOR 3/PK
200 EA $10.33 4,000 $41,320.00

1 PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT
ZERO WATER #ZR-0810-4-N; PACK INCLUDES ONE 10 CUP ROUND 

PITCHER AND ONE FILTER. MINIMUM ORDER QTY: 500 PACKS
N/A EA $21.12 4,000 $84,480.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: 

PITCHER TYPE FILTER UNIT

ZERO WATER #ZR-006;PACK OF 4 FILTERS; MINUMUM ORDER 

QUANTITY:500 PACKS. $35.68 PER PACK OF 4. 
20 EA $8.92 4,000 $35,680.00

1 FAUCET MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT NO BID N/A EA NO BID 4,000 $0.00

2
REPLACEMENT FILTER FOR: FAUCET 

MOUNT TYPE FILTER UNIT
NO BID NO EA NO BID 4,000 $0.00

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.  

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE’S OFFICE OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST 

BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $30,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL 

THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% or $25,000.  IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE AN 

AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% OR $25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER 

THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1.  A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1.  SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO 

QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR 

A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

$223,040.00 N/A NO NO

W.W. GRAINGER, INC. 

DBA GRAINGER

MILWAUKEE, WI

NO

2 $105,320.00

ARROWHEAD REALTY 

CORPORATION 

DBA CROWN CORPORATE 

HOUSING 

FRANKLIN, TN

1

2

1

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE

2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE

3. SRC BID INCENTIVE

●THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or $25,000.

●THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND 

$84,000.00

$189,320.00 NO NO

$129,120.00

$93,920.00

YES** NO

2 N/A

AWARD STATEMENT

AWARDS WILL BE MADE TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER AS FOLLOWS:

GROUP 1: PITCHER TYPE FILTERS AND REPLACEMENT CARTRIDGES

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

GROUP 2: FAUCET MOUNTED FILTERS AND REPLACEMENT CARTRIDGES

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

UP TO TWO CONTRACTS WILL BE AWARDED (ONE FOR EACH GROUP) BASED ON THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND SUBMISSION OF ALL REQUIRED DOCUMENTS FOR EACH TYPE OF WATER FILTER UNIT.

SAFEWARE, INC. 

LANHAM, MD

1 $120,160.00
$120,160.00 

BID ON 

GROUP 1 

ONLY

N/A

**SAFEWARE, INC. (LANHAM, MD) SUBMITTED AFFIDAVIT OF COMPLIANCE FOR AMERICAN MADE GOODS HOWEVER, INCENTIVE DOES NOT APPLY AS GOODS ARE MANUFACTURED IN JUAREZ, MEXICO. 


