

BIDDER	EQUIPMENT NAME	MANUFACTURE	PART #	UNIT COST	GRAND TOTAL	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
	Rifle Mount	BlacRac	GK0069M	NO BID					
	Wire Harness	911 Circuits	CH27-0BPA-MPD	NO BID					
	Magnetic Mics	Mag Mic	MMSU-1	NO BID					
	Console	Havis	C-VS-1012-INUT	\$	358.59				
	Console	Havis	C-2410	\$	328.72				
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-109	\$	99.55				
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-124	\$	133.77				
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-109	\$	99.55				
	CF-31 Dock	Havis	DS-PAN-112	\$	527.23				
	Power Supply For Laptop	Havis	LPS-104	\$	135.77				
	Cup Holders	Havis	C-CUP2-1001	\$	44.83				
	Mic Clip Bracket	Havis	C-MCB	\$	10.68				
	Faceplate- Sound-Off	Havis	C-EB35-S38-1P	\$	23.67				
	Faceplate- Carbide	Havis	C-EB40-CCS-1P	\$	23.67				
	Faceplate- Harris	Havis	C-EB30-CH7-1P	\$	23.67				
	Faceplate - 2955LSA6	Havis	C-EB40-CCS-1P	\$	23.67				
	MDC Arm	HINT	TA-2505-UNIB with Adapter Plate AP-UNIV	\$	460.81				
	Transit Tunnel	Havis	C-TMW-TRNST-01	\$	152.11				
	Arm Rest	Havis	C-ARM-102	\$	52.67				
	Fold Up Equipment Tray	Havis	C-TTP-INUT-4	\$	224.47				
	Raised Equipment Floor	Havis	C-TTP-INUT-1201	\$	608.19				
	Push Bumper	Pro-Gard	P847UNT20HD	NO BID					
	Prisoner Cage	Jotto Desk	475-0063	NO BID					
	Rear Cargo/Seat, Poly Window	Prisoner Transport	PY-04	NO BID					
	Window Bars	Setina	WK0514ITU20	NO BID					
	Door Panels	Setina	DK0100ITU20	NO BID					
	Skid Plate	ProGard	SK47UNT20	NO BID					
	Shot Gun Mount	ProGard	G5000UT-K	NO BID					
	Blue Print Central Controller	Sound-Off	SOUENGC01243	NO BID					
	Blue Print Link	Sound-Off	SOUENGLNK02	NO BID					
	Blue Print Remote Node	Sound-Off	SOUENGM0101	NO BID					
	Custom Node Under Hood Bracket	General Fire	INS-B1006	NO BID					
	Blue Print Sync	Sound-Off	SOUENGSYMD01	NO BID					
	Blue Print Siren Amp	Sound-Off	SOUENGS07152	NO BID					
	Blue Print Control Head	Sound-Off	SOUENGC18001	NO BID					
	100 Watt Speaker	Sound-Off	SOUETS100N	NO BID					
	Bumper Mount Speaker BKT	Sound-Off	SOUETSSVBK01	NO BID					
	Aftershock Low Frequency Siren	Sound-Off	SOUETSLFK200	NO BID					
	Howler Speaker Bracket, DS	Sound Off	SOUETSLFVBK09	NO BID					
	Howler Speaker Bracket, PS	Sound Off	SOUETSLFVBK07	NO BID					
	Aftershock Speaker Brkt, DS	Sound-Off	SOUETSLFVBK09	NO BID					
	Aftershock Speaker Brkt, PS	Sound-Off	SOUETSLFVBK07	NO BID					
	54" Lightbar	Sound-Off	SOUENFWS03R-OBG	NO BID					
	Windshield LightBar	Sound-Off	SOUENFW8000A1	NO BID					
TKX ELECTRONICS (MILWAUKEE, WI)	EQUIPMENT NAME	MANUFACTURE	PART #	UNIT COST	\$22,451.02	YES	YES / BUY AMERICAN	YES	
	Headlight Flasher	Sound-Off	SOUETHFS-SP-ISO	NO BID					
	Upper Rear LED Warning Light	Sound-Off	ENFDGS2RB	NO BID					
	Upper Rear LED Load Light	Tecniq	D30WB00-1	NO BID					
	Rear Warning, Red	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25T53-R	NO BID					
	Rear Warning, Blue	Sound Off	SOUEMPS25T53-B	NO BID					
	Intersectors, Side PB DS	Sound-Off	SOUENT3B3-D	NO BID					
	Intersectors, Side PB PS	Sound-Off	SOUENT3B3-E	NO BID					
	Grill Mt Light, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS1QMS3-D	NO BID					
	Grill Mt Light, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS1QMS3-E	NO BID					
	Front Grill, DS	Sound Off	SOUEMPS25T54-D	NO BID					
	Front Grill, PS	Sound Off	SOUEMPS25T54-B	NO BID					
	Grill Brackets For Above	Sound Off	SOUIMP28KDGAI	NO BID					
	Under Mirror Mt, DS	Sound-Off	SOUENT3B3-D	NO BID					
	Bracket For Above	Sound-Off	SOUIMP28KUMB3-D	NO BID					
	Under Mirror Mt, PS	Sound-Off	SOUENT3B3-E	NO BID					
	Bracket For Above	Sound-Off	SOUIMP28KUMB3-P	NO BID					
	Side Rear Window Light, DS	Sound-Off	SOUENFGS2-R	NO BID					
	Side Rear Window Light, PS	Sound-Off	SOUENFGS2-B	NO BID					
	License Plate Area, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS2QMS4-D	NO BID					
	License Plate Area, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS2QMS4-B	NO BID					
	Tucked Under Rear Hatch, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-R	NO BID					
	Tucked Under Rear Hatch, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-B	NO BID					
	Switches - Red	Carling	V1D2E208-03-000	NO BID					
	Reverse LED bulbs	Liftfilter	White High Powered	NO BID					
	mPower, Red/White	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-D	NO BID					
	mPower, Blue/White	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-E	NO BID					
	mPower Bracket	Sound-Off	SOUIMP28KDGAI	NO BID					
	Red/White Surface Mount Dome	Tecniq	TECE20-WCOR-1	NO BID					
	3 Way Switch For Hatch	Del-City	7500030	NO BID					
	Prisoner Light, White	8 EVP	STX3-W	NO BID					
	Prisoner Light, Red	8 EVP	STX3-R	NO BID					
	Carbon Monoxide Meter	Ray Allen	260-CO	NO BID					
	Carbon Dioxide Detector	Ray Allen	F69	NO BID					
	K9, Insert, INUT, 13-17 Dog Cage	Havis	K9-F28	\$					2,346.19
	K9, ACSY, HTRM, HTPOP	Havis	K9-A-201	\$					1,875.52
	K9, Pager	Havis	K9-A-303	\$					469.24
	K9, Air Circulation Fan	Havis	K9-A-102	\$					144.45
	K9, 10" Window Fan	Havis	K9-A-104	\$					361.53
	K9, H2O Bowl	Havis	K9-A-103	\$					55.11
	Fold Up Equipment Tray	Havis	C-TTP-INUT-4	\$					224.47
	1 Compartment Trans Unit 15+LR	Havis	PT-F03-80-1	\$					11,224.01
	Vent Adaptor Kit	Havis	PT-A-503	\$					470.71
	Power Vent Option	Havis	PT-A-903	\$					449.35
	Sound Deadening Option	Havis	PT-A-904	\$					987.74
	Flip Down Step	Havis	PT-A-902	\$					511.09

BIDDER	EQUIPMENT NAME	MANUFACTURE	PART #	UNIT COST	GRAND TOTAL	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
	Rifle Mount	BlacRac	GK0069M	\$	498.75			
	Wire Harness	911 Circuits	CH27-0BPA-MPD	\$	790.00			
	Magnetic Mics	Mag Mic	MMSU-1	\$	29.33			
	Console	Havis	C-VS-1012-INUT	\$	322.73			
	Console	Havis	C-2410	\$	335.30			
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-109	\$	103.06			
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-124	\$	138.49			
	Printer Box	Havis	C-PM-109	\$	103.06			
	CF-31 Dock	Havis	DS-PAN-112	\$	135.68			
	Power Supply For Laptop	Havis	LPS-104	\$	140.57			
	Cup Holders	Havis	C-CUP2-1001	\$	40.34			
	Mic Clip Bracket	Havis	C-MCB	\$	7.03			
	Faceplate- Sound Off	Havis	C-EB35-S38-1P	INCLUDE W/ CONSOLE				
	Faceplate- Carbide	Havis	C-EB40-CCS-1P	INCLUDE W/ CONSOLE				
	Faceplate- Harris	Havis	C-EB30-CH7-1P	INCLUDE W/ CONSOLE				
	Faceplate - 2955LSA6	Havis	C-EB40-CCS-1P	INCLUDE W/ CONSOLE				
	MDC Arm	HINT	TA-2505-UNIB with Adapter Plate AP-UNIV	\$	580.09			
	Transit Tunnel	Havis	C-TMW-TRNST-01	\$	128.79			
	Arm Rest	Havis	C-ARM-102	\$	47.11			
	Fold Up Equipment Tray	Havis	C-TTP-INUT-4	\$	192.13			
	Raised Equipment Floor	Havis	C-TTP-INUT-1201	\$	536.57			
	Push Bumper	Pro-Gard	P847UNT20HD	\$	424.23			
	Prisoner Cage	Jotto Desk	475-0063	\$	727.80			
	Rear Cargo/Seat, Poly Window	Prisoner Transport	PY-04	\$	1,275.33			
	Window Bars	Setina	WK0514ITU20	\$	231.32			
	Door Panels	Setina	DK0100ITU20	\$	212.57			
	Skid Plate	ProGard	SK47UNT20	\$	211.10			
	Shot Gun Mount	ProGard	G5000UT-K	\$	287.63			
	Blue Print Central Controller	Sound-Off	SOUENGC01243	\$	318.50			
	Blue Print Link	Sound-Off	SOUENGLNK02	\$	296.00			
	Blue Print Remote Node	Sound-Off	SOUENGM0101	\$	179.00			
	Custom Node Under Hood Bracket	General Fire	INS-B1006	\$	20.00			
	Blue Print Sync	Sound-Off	SOUENGSYMD01	\$	250.00			
	Blue Print Siren Amp	Sound-Off	SOUENGS07152	\$	397.00			
	Blue Print Control Head	Sound-Off	SOUENGC18001	\$	142.50			
	100 Watt Speaker	Sound-Off	SOUETS100N	\$	173.50			
	Bumper Mount Speaker BKT	Sound-Off	SOUETSSVBK01	\$	40.00			

EQUIPMENT NAME	MANUFACTURE	PART #	UNIT COST				
Aftershock Low Frequency Siren	Sound-Off	SOUETSKLF200	\$	500.00			
Howler Speaker Bracket, DS	Sound-Off	SOUETSSLFVBK09	\$	22.50			
Howler Speaker Bracket, PS	Sound-Off	SOUETSSLFVBK07	\$	22.50			
Aftershock Speaker Brkt, DS	Sound-Off	SOUETSSLFVBK09	\$	22.50			
Aftershock Speaker Brkt, PS	Sound-Off	SOUETSSLFVBK07	\$	22.50			
54" Lightbar	Sound-Off	SOUENFLB0053R-OBG	\$	1,858.82			
Windshield LightBar	Sound-Off	SOUENFWB000A1	\$	817.50			
EQUIPMENT NAME	MANUFACTURE	PART #		UNIT COST	\$33,097.14		
Headlight Flasher	Sound-Off	SOUEHFSS-SP-ISO	\$	42.00			
Upper Rear LED Warning Light	Sound-Off	ENFDG52RB	\$	200.50			
Upper Rear LED Load Light	Techniq	D30WR00-1	\$	80.60			
Rear Warning, Red	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-R	\$	91.50			
Rear Warning, Blue	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-B	\$	91.50			
Intersectors, Side PB DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-B	\$	149.00			
Intersectors, Side PB PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-B	\$	149.00			
Grill Mt Light, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS1QM53-D	\$	87.50			
Grill Mt Light, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS1QM53-E	\$	87.50			
Front Grill, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-D	\$	98.00			
Front Grill, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-E	\$	98.00			
Grill Brackets For Above	Sound-Off	SOUPMP2BKOGAJ	\$	6.00			
Under Mirror Mt, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-D	\$	149.00			
Bracket For Above	Sound-Off	SOUPMP2BKUM83-D	\$	12.50			
Under Mirror Mt, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-E	\$	149.00			
Bracket For Above	Sound-Off	SOUPMP2BKUM83-P	\$	12.50			
Side Rear Window Light, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-D	\$	102.00			
Side Rear Window Light, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25TS3-E	\$	102.00			
License Plate Area, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS2QM54-D	\$	98.00			
License Plate Area, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS2QM54-E	\$	108.50			
Tucked Under Rear Hatch, DS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-R	\$	91.50			
Tucked Under Rear Hatch, PS	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-B	\$	91.50			
Switches - Red	Carling	V1D2BT0B-CMC00-000	\$	16.30			
Reverse LED bulbs	Upfitter	White High Powered	\$	35.00			
mPower, Red/White	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-D	\$	91.50			
mPower, Blue/White	Sound-Off	SOUEMPS25MS3-E	\$	91.50			
mPower Bracket	Sound-Off	SOUPMP2BKOGAJ	\$	6.00			
Red/White Surface Mount Dome	Techniq	TECE20-WCOR-1	\$	71.90			
3 Way Switch For Hatch	Del-City	7500030	\$	6.00			
Prisoner Light, White	8 EVP	STX3-W	\$	16.00			
Prisoner Light, Red	8 EVP	STX3-R	\$	26.00			
Carbon Monoxide Meter	Ray Allen	260-CO	\$	150.00			
Carbon Dioxide Detector	Ray Allen	F69	\$	97.49			
K9, Insert, INUT, 13-17 Dog Cage	Havis	K9-F28	\$	2,190.75			
K9, ACSY, HTLRM, HTPOD	Havis	K9-A-201	\$	1,751.27			
K9, Pager	Havis	K9-A-303	\$	421.93			
K9, Air Circulation Fan	Havis	K9-A-102	\$	139.87			
K9, 10" Window Fan	Havis	K9-A-104	\$	350.08			
K9, H2O Bowl	Havis	K9-A-103	\$	53.36			
Fold Up Equipment Tray	Havis	C-TPP-INUT-4	\$	192.12			
1 Compartment Trans Unit 15+LR	Havis	PT-F03-80-1	\$	10,457.04			
Vent Adaptor Kit	Havis	PT-A-503	\$	438.54			
Power Vent Option	Havis	PT-A-903	\$	418.65			
Sound Deadening Option	Havis	PT-A-904	\$	920.25			
Flip Down Step	Havis	PT-A-902	\$	476.16			

NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:
 EMERGENCY LIGHTING & ELECTRONICS, INC. (WAUKESHA, WI) - EXCEPTION TO DELIVERY REQUIREMENT

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S OFFICE OF SMALL BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:
 •THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
 •THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% OR \$25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE
3. SRC BID INCENTIVE