BID TABULATION # 14872
VC FOR LIGHT FIXTURES
OPENED 11/29/2016 @ 2:00 PM-CST
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PURCHASING AGENT: MASON LAVEY

TELEPHONE NO.

: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MLAVEY @MILWAUKEE.GOV

BUY MILWAUKEE

BIDDER ITEM #| GROUP ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE| QTY TOTAL CROUP CGRAND LBE AFFIDAVIT AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT
TOTAL TOTAL SUBMITTED?
SUBMITTED?
1 250 WATT COBRA LUMINAIRE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 115 25S CA 240 R3 DG 48 NR SS HK RG $115.26 900 | $103,734.00
2 GROUP 1(150 WATT COBRA LUMINAIRE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 115 15S CA 240 R3 DG 48 NR SS HK RG $109.14 700 $76,398.00 | $180,132.00
PRICE AND SONS, INC. 3 ITEM REMOVED VIA ADDENDUM: NO BID REQUIRED NO BID $0.00 0 $0.00 $215,832.00 NO YES - AMERICAN MADE
MILWAUKEE, WI 53217 4 70 WATT ALLEY LIGHT HEAD FIXTURE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM |HOLOPHANE - 11 07S RN 120 RO LO OB H2 $35.70 100 $3,570.00
5 GROUP 2100 WATT HEAD SPLIT FIT MOUNT: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 11 10S XN 240 RO LO NR OB H2 $45.90 600 $27,540.00 | $35,700.00
6 HEAD SPLIT FIT MOUNT: STYLE 4 HOLOPHANE - 11 XX XX XXX RO LO NR H2 RFD 158390 $30.60 150 $4,590.00
1 250 WATT COBRA LUMINAIRE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 115 25S CA 240 R3 DG 48 NR SS HK RG $112.25 900 | $101,025.00
2 GROUP 1(150 WATT COBRA LUMINAIRE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 115 15S CA 240 R3 DG 48 NR SS HK RG $106.00 700 $74,200.00 | $175,225.00
NEHER ELECTRICAL SUPPLY 3 ITEM REMOVED VIA ADDENDUM: NO BID REQUIRED NO BID $0.00 0 $0.00 $209,840.00 YES YES - AMERICAN MADE
MILWAUKEE, WI 53206 4 70 WATT ALLEY LIGHT HEAD FIXTURE: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM |HOLOPHANE - 11 07S RN 120 RO LO OB H2 $34.30 100 $3,430.00
5 GROUP 2 (100 WATT HEAD SPLIT FIT MOUNT: HIGH PRESSURE SODIUM HOLOPHANE - 11 10S XN 240 RO LO NR OB H2 $44.70 600 $26,820.00 | $34,615.00
6 HEAD SPLIT FIT MOUNT: STYLE 4 HOLOPHANE - 11 XX XX XXX RO LO NR H2 RFD 158390 $29.10 150 $4,365.00

NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:

STUART C. IRBY: (DID NOT INCLUDE ALL REQUIRED SIGNATURES AND DID NOT INCLUDE SBE COMPLIANCE PLAN (FORM A)

AWARD WILL BE MADE IN TOTAL OR BY GROUP TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICES BY THE ESTIMATED QUANTITY AND ADDING EACH TOTAL TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE
DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

oTHE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
oTHE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12%.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS UNDER ORDINANCE 310-18.9 SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE PROGRAM. IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE,
THE CITY SHALL THEN PURCHASE A MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12%. IF A MILWAUKEE-MADE OR MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE GOOD IS NOT AVAILABLE, THE CITY SHALL
THEN PURCHASE AN AMERICAN-MADE GOOD, PROVIDED THE PURCHASE DOES NOT INCREASE THE COST BY MORE THAN 12% OR $25,000.




