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BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART #
UNIT 

PRICE

QUANTITY 

(GALLONS)
TOTAL GRAND TOTAL

LBE AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
D-A LUBRICANT: PRESURFLO 32 - #55092 4.63$      27500.00 127,325.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
D-A LUBRICANT: PRESURFLO 32 - #55091 4.01$      30000.00 120,300.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        27500.00 -$                  

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        30000.00 -$                  

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
CHEVRON: RANDO HD ISO 32 - 273260 4.08$      27500.00 112,200.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
CHEVRON: RANDO HD ISO 32 - 273260 4.08$      30000.00 122,400.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        27500.00 -$                  

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        30000.00 -$                  

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
CITGO: HYDRAULIC ISO 32-46 6.00$      27500.00 165,000.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
CITGO: HYDRAULIC ISO 32-46 4.67$      30000.00 140,100.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

CITGO: HYDRAULIC ISO 32-46 5.72$      27500.00 157,300.00$     

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

CITGO: HYDRAULIC ISO 32-46 4.25$      30000.00 127,500.00$     

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
RED DRUM: ISO 32 5.75$      27500.00 158,125.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
RED DRUM: ISO 32 4.30$      30000.00 129,000.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

RED DRUM: ISO 32 5.50$      27500.00 151,250.00$     

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

RED DRUM: ISO 32 4.05$      30000.00 121,500.00$     

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
MOORE OIL: MOORE FLO - HYDRAULIC 32 3.45$      27500.00 94,875.00$       

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
MOORE OIL: MOORE FLO - HYDRAULIC 32 3.25$      30000.00 97,500.00$       

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        27500.00 -$                  

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        30000.00 -$                  

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
LUBRI-LOY: PPHF-032 8.802$    27500.00 242,055.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
LUBRI-LOY: PPHF-032B 6.140$    30000.00 184,200.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        27500.00 -$                  

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        30000.00 -$                  

EMAIL: MLAVEY@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PURCHASING AGENT: MASON LAVEY

N/A

$0.00

$192,375.00

INTEK TECHNOLOGY, INC.

CHICAGO, IL

$305,100.00

N/A

$284,800.00

BID TABULATION #14819

INTEK TECHNOLOGY, INC. 

CHICAGO, IL 

(ALTERNATE BID)

D-A LUBRICANT CO.                        

     LEBANON, IN 

N/A

$272,750.00

$287,125.00

$247,625.00

N/A

$0.00

$234,600.00

LUBE-TECH & PARTNERS                 

   MILWAUKEE, WI 

MOTION INDUSTRIES

 WEST ALLIS, WI 

EDWARD H. WOLF & SONS, INC. 

SLINGER, WI 

TELEPHONE NO: 414-286-3588

OPENED 10/18/2016 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VC FOR HYDRAULIC OIL 

$426,255.00

N/A

$0.00

YES

$0.00
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EMAIL: MLAVEY@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PURCHASING AGENT: MASON LAVEYBID TABULATION #14819

TELEPHONE NO: 414-286-3588

OPENED 10/18/2016 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VC FOR HYDRAULIC OIL 

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
SERVICE PRO: #SPAW32-55 3.62$      27500.00 99,550.00$       

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
SERVICE PRO: #SPAW32-BOIL 3.27$      30000.00 98,100.00$       

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        27500.00 -$                  

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

NO BID -$        30000.00 -$                  

1
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

 55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)
PHILLIPS 66: MEGAFLOW AW HYD 32 - CPH1074916 5.25$      27500.00 144,375.00$     

2
HYDRAULIC OIL: ISO-32 GRADE

BULK (DELIVERED)
PHILLIPS 66: MEGAFLOW AW HYD 32 - CPH1055926 4.74$      30000.00 142,200.00$     

3

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

55 GALLON DRUMS (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

KLEEN PERFORMANCE PRODUCTS: SAFETY KLEEN AW HYD 32

MEDHYDAW32 - DRUM 

* MARKETED AS MEDALLION PLUS

3.78$      27500.00 103,950.00$     

4

HYDRAULIC OIL (RE-REFINED): ISO-32 GRADE 

BULK (DELIVERED)

OPTIONAL BID

KLEEN PERFORMANCE PRODUCTS: SAFETY KLEEN AW HYD 32

MEDHYDAW32 - BULK 

* MARKETED AS MEDALLION PLUS

3.28$      30000.00 98,400.00$       

COREY OIL, LTD. (HARTLAND, WI) - DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

HARTLAND LUBRICANT & CHEMICALS (SPARTA, WI) - DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS

PERKINS OIL COMPANY                                 

MADISON, WI 
N/A

$0.00

$197,650.00

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT 

EXCEED $25,000.

NON-COMPLIANT BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:

AWARD WILL BE MADE IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.  BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ITEMS ONE (1) AND TWO (2) TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN 

AWARD. THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE ESTIMATED QUANTITY AND ADDING EACH TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.   

PETROLIANCE, LLC. 

MILWAUKEE, WI                 

$286,575.00

$202,350.00

NO


