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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER FIRST SUPPLY, OAK CREEK, WI N/A

NO

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 1/2 thrd x 3/4 flare 3015739 20 NO BID $0.00

2 5/8 thrd x 3/4 flare 3015740 20 NO BID $0.00

3 3/4 thrd x 3/4 flare 3000126 100 NO BID $0.00

4 1 thrd x 1 flare 3000127 100 NO BID $0.00

Subtotal $0.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 5/8xs x 3/4 flare 3000128 50 $23.20 $1,160.00 AYM 74758C-67

2 1/2xs x 3/4 flare 3000129 20 $22.15 $443.00 AYM 74758C-67

3 3/4xs x 3/4 flare 3000130 300 $29.25 $8,775.00 AYM 74758C-67

4 1xs  x  1 flare 3000131 300 $36.75 $11,025.00 AYM 74758C-67

5 1xs  x 3/4 flare 3000132 20 NO BID $0.00

6 11/4xs x 1 flare 3000133 20 NO BID $0.00

7 1 1/4xs x 1 1/4 flare 3000134 20 NO BID $0.00

8 1 xxs X 1 flare 3000135 200 $46.50 $9,300.00 AYM 74758C-68

9 3/4 xxs X 3/4 flare 3000137 200 $34.50 $6,900.00 AYM 74758C-68

10 2 x 2 flare 3000140 20

Subtotal $37,603.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4      ball style cc x flare 3012302 100 $34.75 $3,475.00 MUELLER B-25000N

2 1                   " 3012304 1000 $44.55 $44,550.00 MUELLER B-25000N

3 1 1/4              " 3012305 20 NO BID $0.00

4 1 1/2              " 3012306 100 $106.25 $10,625.00 MUELLER B-25000N

5 2                   " 3012308 50 $185.65 $9,282.50 MUELLER B-25000N

Subtotal $67,932.50

Group 1 - Coupling, Corp Stop

Group 2 -  Coupling, Lead Pak

Group 3 - Corporation Stop 300psi

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4     ball style flare x flare 3013014 200 $51.35 $10,270.00 MUELLER B-25204N

2 1                     " 3013016 300 $70.95 $21,285.00 MUELLER B-25204N

3 1 1/4                " 3013018 30 NO BID $0.00

4 1 1/2                " 3013020 30 $173.45 $5,203.50 MUELLER B-25204N

5 2                     " 3013022 50 $284.05 $14,202.50 MUELLER B-25204N

Subtotal $50,961.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4        flare x flare 3084014 100 $12.75 $1,275.00 MUELLER H-15400N

2 3/4 x 1         " 3084015 20 $18.90 $378.00 MUELLER H-15400N

3 1                 " 3084016 100 $22.30 $2,230.00 MUEH-15400N

4 1 1/2            " 3084018 30 $67.40 $2,022.00 MUEH-15400N

5 1 x 1 1/4      "   3084019 10 $48.25 $482.50 MUEH-15400N

6 2                 " 3084020 20 $74.05 $1,481.00 MUEH-15400N

Subtotal $7,868.50

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 4"  w/ 1"        cc tap thread 3090817 5 $71.15 $355.75 MUELLER BR2B0474

2 4"  w/ 1 1/2    cc tap thread 3090821 5 $83.00 $415.00 MUELLER BR2B0474

3 6"  w/ 3/4       cc tap thread 3090822 5 $83.80 $419.00 MUELLER BR2B0684

4 6"  w/ 1          cc tap thread 3090824 20 $83.80 $1,676.00 MUELLER BR2B0684

5 6"  w/ 1 1/2    cc tap thread 3090825 35 $95.80 $3,353.00 MUELLER BR2B0684

6 6"  w/  2"       cc tap thread 3090827 5 $105.35 $526.75 MUELLER BR2B0684

7 8"  w / 1 "      cc tap thread 3090830 20 $103.75 $2,075.00 MUELLER BR2B0899

8 8"  w / 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090832 50 $109.20 $5,460.00 MUELLER BR2B0899

9 12" w/ 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090833 15 $169.70 $2,545.50 MUELLER BR2B1314

10 12" w/    2"    cc tap thread 3090834 5 $172.80 $864.00 MUELLER BR2B1314

11 16" w/ 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090835 20 $404.90 $8,098.00 MUELLER BR2B1732

12 16" w/    2"    cc tap thread 3090836 5 $447.40 $2,237.00 MUELLER BR2B1732

13 8"  w /  2"      cc tap thread 3090839 15 $119.05 $1,785.75 MUELLER BR2B0899

Subtotal $29,810.75

Group 6 - Bronze Saddles w/AWWA thread

Group 4 - Curb Stop  300 psi

Group 5 - Three Part Union Straight Cplng
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 Plug Brass 3/4 cc 3072175 20 $9.65 $193.00 MUELLER H-10033N

2 Plug Brass 5/8"   cc 3072218 20 $11.30 $226.00 MUELLER H-10033N

3 Plug Brass 1/2"  cc 3072223 20 $11.15 $223.00 MUELLER H-10033N

4 Plug Brass 1"  cc 3072225 20 $10.15 $203.00 MUELLER H-10033N

5 Plug Brass 1 1/2  cc 3072227 20 $18.05 $361.00 MUELLER H-10033N

6 Plug Brass 2" cc 3072228 20 $23.45 $469.00 MUELLER H-10033N

7 Red Bushing 3/4 X 1" cc 3073375 20 $26.70 $534.00 MUELLER H-10036N

8 Red Bushing 3/4 X 1 1/2" cc 3073377 20 NO BID $0.00

9 Red Bushing 1" X 1 1/2" cc 3073387 20 $30.30 $606.00 MUELLER H-10036N

10 90 Deg Brass Elbow 2" HD (heavy uty) 3096432 10 NO BID $0.00

11 90 Deg Brass Elbow 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096431 10 NO BID $0.00

12 90 Deg Brass elbow 1 1/2 HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 NO BID $0.00

13 Elbow Street 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096471 10 NO BID $0.00

14 Elbow Street 2" HD (heavy duty) 3096472 10 NO BID $0.00

15 Elbow Street 1 1/2 HD Heavy duty) non-inv 10 NO BID $0.00

16 Cap 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096441 10 NO BID $0.00

17 Cap 2" HD (heavy Duty) 3096442 10 NO BID $0.00

18 Cap 1 1/2 HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 NO BID $0.00

19 Nipple 1"   close HD (heavy duty) 3096451 10 NO BID $0.00

20 Nipple  2"  close HD (heavy duty) 3096452 10 NO BID $0.00

21 nipple 1 1/2 close HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 NO BID $0.00

22 Stop & Drain 1" 3096401 20 NO BID $0.00

23 Stop & Drain 2" 3096402 20 NO BID $0.00

24 Stop & Drain 1 1/2 non-inv 10 NO BID $0.00

Subtotal $2,815.00

GRAND TOTAL $196,990.75

Group 7 -  Miscellaneous
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PRICE & SONS - MILWAUKEE, WI

YES

YES - AMERICAN MADE

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 1/2 thrd x 3/4 flare 3015739 20 $25.00 $500.00 AY McDONALD M74742

2 5/8 thrd x 3/4 flare 3015740 20 $15.60 $312.00 AY McDONALD M74742

3 3/4 thrd x 3/4 flare 3000126 100 $14.75 $1,475.00 AY McDONALD M74742

4 1 thrd x 1 flare 3000127 100 $25.10 $2,510.00 AY McDONALD M74742

Subtotal $4,797.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 5/8xs x 3/4 flare 3000128 50 $22.10 $1,105.00 AY McDONALD M74758C-67

2 1/2xs x 3/4 flare 3000129 20 $21.20 $424.00 AY McDONALD M74758c-67

3 3/4xs x 3/4 flare 3000130 300 $28.00 $8,400.00 AY McDONALD M74758C-67

4 1xs  x  1 flare 3000131 300 $35.10 $10,530.00 AY McDONALD M74758C-67

5 1xs  x 3/4 flare 3000132 20 $48.40 $968.00 AY McDONALD M74753-67/M747

6 11/4xs x 1 flare 3000133 20 $59.90 $1,198.00 AY McDONALD M74753-67/M74

7 1 1/4xs x 1 1/4 flare 3000134 20 $68.80 $1,376.00 AY McDONALD M74753-67/M74

8 1 xxs X 1 flare 3000135 200 $44.50 $8,900.00 AY McDONALD M74758C-68

9 3/4 xxs X 3/4 flare 3000137 200 $33.00 $6,600.00 AY McDONALD M74758C-68

10 2 x 2 flare 3000140 20 $201.00 $4,020.00 AY McDONALD M74753-67/M74

Subtotal $43,521.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4      ball style cc x flare 3012302 100 $37.20 $3,720.00 AY McDONALD M74701B

2 1                   " 3012304 1000 $45.15 $45,150.00 AY McDONALD M74701B

3 1 1/4              " 3012305 20 $108.00 $2,160.00 AY McDONALD M74701B

4 1 1/2              " 3012306 100 $112.00 $11,200.00 AY McDONALD M74701B

5 2                   " 3012308 50 $172.00 $8,600.00 AY McDONALD M74701B

Subtotal $70,830.00

Group 1 - Coupling, Corp Stop

Group 2 -  Coupling, Lead Pak

Group 3 - Corporation Stop 300psi

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

BIDDER

BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4     ball style flare x flare 3013014 200 $52.00 $10,400.00 AY McDONALD M76100

2 1                     " 3013016 300 $71.00 $21,300.00 AY McDONALD M76100

3 1 1/4                " 3013018 30 $123.00 $3,690.00 AY McDONALD M76100

4 1 1/2                " 3013020 30 $175.00 $5,250.00 AY McDONALD M76100

5 2                     " 3013022 50 $250.00 $12,500.00 AY McDONALD M76100

Subtotal $53,140.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 3/4        flare x flare 3084014 100 $14.15 $1,415.00 AY McDONALD M74758

2 3/4 x 1         " 3084015 20 $21.00 $420.00 AY McDONALD M74758

3 1                 " 3084016 100 $25.00 $2,500.00 AY McDONALD M74758

4 1 1/2            " 3084018 30 $74.00 $2,220.00 AY McDONALD M74758

5 1 x 1 1/4      "   3084019 10 $55.00 $550.00 AY McDONALD M74758

6 2                 " 3084020 20 $120.00 $2,400.00 AY McDONALD M74758

Subtotal $9,505.00

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 4"  w/ 1"        cc tap thread 3090817 5 $74.10 $370.50 AY McDONALD M3825

2 4"  w/ 1 1/2    cc tap thread 3090821 5 $86.45 $432.25 AY McDONALD M3825

3 6"  w/ 3/4       cc tap thread 3090822 5 $87.25 $436.25 AY McDONALD M3825

4 6"  w/ 1          cc tap thread 3090824 20 $87.25 $1,745.00 AY McDONALD M3825

5 6"  w/ 1 1/2    cc tap thread 3090825 35 $100.00 $3,500.00 AY McDONALD M3825

6 6"  w/  2"       cc tap thread 3090827 5 $110.00 $550.00 AY McDONALD M3825

7 8"  w / 1 "      cc tap thread 3090830 20 $110.00 $2,200.00 AY McDONALD M3825

8 8"  w / 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090832 50 $113.00 $5,650.00 AY McDONALD M3825

9 12" w/ 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090833 15 $175.00 $2,625.00 AY McDONALD M3825

10 12" w/    2"    cc tap thread 3090834 5 $180.00 $900.00 AY McDONALD M3825

11 16" w/ 1 1/2   cc tap thread 3090835 20 $360.00 $7,200.00 AY McDONALD M3825

12 16" w/    2"    cc tap thread 3090836 5 $420.00 $2,100.00 AY McDONALD M3825

13 8"  w /  2"      cc tap thread 3090839 15 $122.00 $1,830.00 AY McDONALD M3825

Subtotal $29,539.00

Group 6 - Bronze Saddles w/AWWA thread

Group 4 - Curb Stop  300 psi

Group 5 - Three Part Union Straight Cplng
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Item # Item Description

Commodity 

Code

Estimated Annual 

Usage Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer &  Part #

1 Plug Brass 3/4 cc 3072175 20 $8.25 $165.00 AY McDONALD M73206

2 Plug Brass 5/8"   cc 3072218 20 $17.00 $340.00 AY McDONALD M73206

3 Plug Brass 1/2"  cc 3072223 20 $16.75 $335.00 AY McDONALD M73206

4 Plug Brass 1"  cc 3072225 20 $12.00 $240.00 AY McDONALD M73206

5 Plug Brass 1 1/2  cc 3072227 20 $27.00 $540.00 AY McDONALD M73206

6 Plug Brass 2" cc 3072228 20 $35.00 $700.00 AY McDONALD M73206

7 Red Bushing 3/4 X 1" cc 3073375 20 $13.50 $270.00 AY McDONALD M747011

8 Red Bushing 3/4 X 1 1/2" cc 3073377 20 $36.25 $725.00 AY McDONALD M747011

9 Red Bushing 1" X 1 1/2" cc 3073387 20 $36.50 $730.00 AY McDONALD M747011

10 90 Deg Brass Elbow 2" HD (heavy uty) 3096432 10 $170.00 $1,700.00 NL 150-32.MERIT BRASS

11 90 Deg Brass Elbow 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096431 10 $38.00 $380.00 NL 150-16 MERIT BRASS

12 90 Deg Brass elbow 1 1/2 HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 $101.50 $1,015.00 NL 150-24 MERIT BRASS

13 Elbow Street 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096471 10 $160.00 $1,600.00 SPEC6 MERIT BRASS

14 Elbow Street 2" HD (heavy duty) 3096472 10 $170.00 $1,700.00 N1150-32 MERIT BRASS

15 Elbow Street 1 1/2 HD Heavy duty) non-inv 10 $175.00 $1,750.00 SPEC6 MERIT BRASS

16 Cap 1" HD (heavy duty) 3096441 10 $42.75 $427.50 SPEC6 MERIT BRASS

17 Cap 2" HD (heavy Duty) 3096442 10 $125.00 $1,250.00 N1158-32 MERIT BRASS

18 Cap 1 1/2 HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 $85.30 $853.00 SPEC6 MERIT BRASS

19 Nipple 1"   close HD (heavy duty) 3096451 10 $8.00 $80.00 2216-001 MERIT BRASS

20 Nipple  2"  close HD (heavy duty) 3096452 10 $23.50 $235.00 2232-001 MERIT BRASS

21 nipple 1 1/2 close HD (heavy duty) non-inv 10 $16.00 $160.00 2224-001 MERIT BRASS

22 Stop & Drain 1" 3096401 20 $81.00 $1,620.00 AY McDONALD M7600

23 Stop & Drain 2" 3096402 20 $235.00 $4,700.00 AY McDONALD M7601

24 Stop & Drain 1 1/2 non-inv 10 $175.00 $1,750.00 AY McDONALD M7602

Subtotal $23,265.50

GRAND TOTAL $234,597.50

Group 7 -  Miscellaneous
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BID TABULATION #13513 PURCHASING AGENT:  TYKESHA WHITE

VENDOR CONTRACT BRASS FITTINGS & MISCELLANEOUS DISTRIBUTION REPAIR ITEMS TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2394

OPENED 11/4/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

The low bidder shall be determined by multiplying the quoted unit price by the estimated annual quantity to obtain the grand total.

         The bidder submits an affidavit with their bid indicating they meet the requirements of the Ordinance, and 

         The bid does not exceed the lowest bid by more than 12% or $25,000.

Any bidder proposing to supply goods under Ordinance 310-18.9 shall not also receive the benefit of the bid award provided under the Local Business Enterprise 

program.  If a Milwaukee-made good is not available, the city shall then purchase a Milwaukee county-made good, provided the purchase does not increase the cost 

by more than 12% or $25,000.  If a Milwaukee-made or Milwaukee county-made good is not available, the city shall then purchase an American-made good, provided 

the purchase does not increase the cost by more than 12% or $25,000.

Award will be made by group or in total to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder complying with the bid specifications and delivery requirements, whichever is in 

the best interests of the City.  

If a Local Business Enterprise (LBE) is a responsive and responsible bidder, the LBE shall be awarded the contract provided its bid does not exceed the lowest bid by 

more than 5% and the difference does not exceed $25,000.

Contracts shall be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder who qualifies for the City of Milwaukee-Made, Milwaukee County-Made or American-Made program 

(Ordinance 310-18.9) if:


