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BID TABULATION #13299
SAND, STONE, AND GRAVEL
OPENED 7/8/2014 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PURCHASING AGENT: TYKESHA WHITE
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2394
EMAIL: TYWHIT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

HALQUIST STONE COMPANY, INC MILWAUKEE MATERIALS LLC PAYNE & DOLAN AGGREGATES
SUSSEX. WI MILWAUKEE. WI AKA FRANKLIN AGGREGATES
' ' MILWAUKEE, WI
BIDDER
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED NO NO NO
ESAE'\NASZII_ED TOTAL FOR TOTAL FOR TOTAL FOR
ITEM # ITEM USAGE PRICE ESTIMATED PRICE ESTIMATED PRICE ESTIMATED
ANNUAL USAGE ANNUAL USAGE ANNUAL USAGE
(TONS)
1 MASON SAND 1,000 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
2 PEA GRAVEL 250 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
3 1 1/2 INCH MACADAM STONE 2,000 $13.35 $26,700.00 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
4 3/8 INCH STONE CHIPS 40,000 $14.75 $590,000.00 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
5 1/4 INCH WASHED STONE 15,000 $15.25 $228,750.00 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
6 3/8 INCH LIMESTONE CHIPS 5,000 $14.75 $73,750.00 NO BID N/A $19.75 $98,750.00
7 3/4 INCH CRUSHED STONE 1,000 $13.75 $13,750.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $14.00 $14,000.00
8 3/8 INCH CRUSHED, WASHED LIMESTONE CHIPS 20,000 $14.75 $295,000.00 NO BID N/A NO BID N/A
9 1 1/4 INCH DENSE GRADED RECYCLED CONCRETE 1,000 $13.25 $13,250.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $14.00 $14,000.00

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS,
WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

THE LOW BIDDER SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE TOTAL COST PER TON MULTIPLIED BY THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR A
TOTAL AWARD.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST
BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.




