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BID TABULATION #12485 PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
VC FOR DIESEL FUEL TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
OPENED 05/23/2013 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Transport Load
$0.02065
$0.05303
$0.01831
$0.01330
$0.00828
$0.00516

Delivery Address
Split Load 

Delivery Fee

$120.00

$120.00

$120.00

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.5727
$3.5465
$4.2300 25,000 $105,750.00
$0.01979 1,140,000 $22,558.70
$120.00 32 $3,840.00

Tank Wagon
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
-
-
- - -

Tank Wagon
$0.25000
$0.04000
$0.04000

Cost Total
$3.2462
$0.11000

$4,101,106.06

$4,101,102.70

$3,968,954.00

#1 Diesel
- -

100 N. 64th Street
2901 N. Teutonia Avenue
2647 N. Bartlett Avenue (Single Wall)
4927 W. Fiebrantz Avenue
2130 W. Oklahoma Avenue
8814 W. Lisbon Avenue
2050 N. Palmer Street
4653 S. 13th Street
10320 W. Fond du Lac Avenue
2901 N. 30th Street

4141 W. Mill Road

Delivery Address

3174 S. Chase Avenue

#2 ULS Off-Road Diesel
Average Tank Wagon

GRAND TOTAL

$3.3562

Average Tank Wagon

Delivery Address

3000 N. Lincoln Memorial Drive

5585 N. 69th Street

755 N James Lovell Street

6680 N. Teutonia Avenue
8025 W. Bradley Road

Off Road Diesel - Water Department (Water)

1311 E. Chambers Street

8525 W. Florist Avenue

-

BIDDER: EDWARD H. WOLF & SONS, INC. - SLINGER, WI
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?:  N/A

#2 Diesel
1,115,000

#2 Diesel

Department of Public Works (DPW)

Milwaukee Fire Department (MFD)

1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue & 
5230 W. State Street

2142 W. Canal Street & 
5230 W. State Street

2142 W. Canal Street & 
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue

5230 W. State Street
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
6710 W. Industrial Road
3025 W. Ruby Avenue
3921 W. Lincoln Avenue
2142 W. Canal Street
Delivery Address

1400 S. 9th Street
5600 W. Oklahoma Avenue

Average Split-Load Delivery Fee
Average Transport Load
Bio-Diesel

#1 Diesel



PAGE 2 OF 5

BID TABULATION #12485 PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
VC FOR DIESEL FUEL TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
OPENED 05/23/2013 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Transport Load
$0.03820
$0.03820
$0.03820
$0.03820
$0.03820
$0.03820

Delivery Address
Split Load 

Delivery Fee

$90.00

$90.00

$90.00

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.6471
$3.5673
$5.2319 25,000 $130,797.50
$0.03820 1,140,000 $43,548.00
$90.00 32 $2,880.00

Tank Wagon
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.24000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.18000
$0.24000

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.6471
$3.5673
$0.18667 166,548 $31,088.96

Tank Wagon
$0.14750
$0.14750
$0.14750

Cost Total
$3.2671
$0.14750

$4,831,117.82

2142 W. Canal Street & 
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
2142 W. Canal Street & 
5230 W. State Street
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue & 
5230 W. State Street

#1 Diesel

3921 W. Lincoln Avenue
3025 W. Ruby Avenue
6710 W. Industrial Road
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
5230 W. State Street

Milwaukee Fire Department (MFD)

Delivery Address

BIDDER: LAKESIDE OIL - FOX POINT, WI
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?:  N/A

Department of Public Works (DPW)

Delivery Address
2142 W. Canal Street

755 N James Lovell Street
3174 S. Chase Avenue
5585 N. 69th Street

1,115,000 $4,022,028.00

$4,199,253.50
#2 Diesel
Bio-Diesel
Average Transport Load
Average Split-Load Delivery Fee

4653 S. 13th Street
2050 N. Palmer Street
8814 W. Lisbon Avenue
2130 W. Oklahoma Avenue
4927 W. Fiebrantz Avenue

4141 W. Mill Road
5600 W. Oklahoma Avenue
1400 S. 9th Street
2901 N. 30th Street
10320 W. Fond du Lac Avenue

#1 Diesel
166,548 $600,771.95

$631,860.91#2 Diesel
Average Tank Wagon

2647 N. Bartlett Avenue (Single Wall)
2901 N. Teutonia Avenue
100 N. 64th Street
8025 W. Bradley Road
6680 N. Teutonia Avenue

#2 ULS Off-Road Diesel $3.4146
Average Tank Wagon

GRAND TOTAL

Off Road Diesel - Water Department (Water)

Delivery Address
1311 E. Chambers Street
3000 N. Lincoln Memorial Drive
8525 W. Florist Avenue
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BID TABULATION #12485 PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
VC FOR DIESEL FUEL TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
OPENED 05/23/2013 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Transport Load
$0.02900
$0.02600
$0.03500
$0.03500
$0.04100
$0.04300

Delivery Address
Split Load 

Delivery Fee

$35.00

$35.00

$35.00

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.8186
$3.2758
$5.0545 25,000 $126,362.50
$0.03483 1,140,000 $39,710.00
$35.00 32 $1,120.00

Tank Wagon
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250
$0.26250

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.8186
$3.2758
$0.26250 166,548 $43,718.85

Tank Wagon
$0.24500
$0.24500
$0.24500

Cost Total
$3.266

$0.24500

$4,756,821.93

*DTN value is incorrect

BIDDER: MANSFIELD OIL - GAINESVILLE, GA
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?:  N/A

Department of Public Works (DPW)

Delivery Address
2142 W. Canal Street
3921 W. Lincoln Avenue
3025 W. Ruby Avenue
6710 W. Industrial Road
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue

#1 Diesel*

#2 ULS Off-Road Diesel* $3.5110
Average Tank Wagon

GRAND TOTAL

5230 W. State Street

2142 W. Canal Street & 
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
2142 W. Canal Street & 
5230 W. State Street
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue & 
5230 W. State Street

Off Road Diesel - Water Department (Water)

Delivery Address
1311 E. Chambers Street
3000 N. Lincoln Memorial Drive
8525 W. Florist Avenue

Milwaukee Fire Department (MFD)

Delivery Address
755 N James Lovell Street
3174 S. Chase Avenue
5585 N. 69th Street

#1 Diesel* 1,115,000 $3,955,128.00

4927 W. Fiebrantz Avenue

166,548

$4,122,320.50
#2 Diesel*
Bio-Diesel*
Average Transport Load
Average Split-Load Delivery Fee

4653 S. 13th Street
2050 N. Palmer Street
8814 W. Lisbon Avenue
2130 W. Oklahoma Avenue

4141 W. Mill Road
5600 W. Oklahoma Avenue
1400 S. 9th Street
2901 N. 30th Street
10320 W. Fond du Lac Avenue

$590,779.07
$634,497.92#2 Diesel*

Average Tank Wagon

2647 N. Bartlett Avenue (Single Wall)
2901 N. Teutonia Avenue
100 N. 64th Street
8025 W. Bradley Road
6680 N. Teutonia Avenue
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BID TABULATION #12485 PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
VC FOR DIESEL FUEL TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
OPENED 05/23/2013 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Transport Load
$0.03690
$0.03690
$0.03690
$0.03690
$0.03690
$0.03690

Delivery Address
Split Load 

Delivery Fee

$40.00

$40.00

$40.00

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.7372
$3.5430
$5.2300 25,000 $130,750.00
$0.03690 1,140,000 $42,066.00
$40.00 32 $1,280.00

Tank Wagon
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000

Cost Estimated Gallons Subtotal Total
$3.7372
$3.5430
$0.17000 166,548 $28,313.16

Tank Wagon
$0.17000
$0.17000
$0.17000

Cost Total
$3.2482
$0.17000

$4,867,375.45

$634,564.53#2 Diesel
Average Tank Wagon

Milwaukee Fire Department (MFD)

Delivery Address
755 N James Lovell Street
3174 S. Chase Avenue
5585 N. 69th Street
4141 W. Mill Road
5600 W. Oklahoma Avenue
1400 S. 9th Street
2901 N. 30th Street
10320 W. Fond du Lac Avenue

#1 Diesel 1,115,000 4058711.5

$4,232,807.50
#2 Diesel
Bio-Diesel
Average Transport Load
Average Split-Load Delivery Fee

#2 ULS Off-Road Diesel $3.4182
Average Tank Wagon

GRAND TOTAL

Off Road Diesel - Water Department (Water)

Delivery Address
1311 E. Chambers Street
3000 N. Lincoln Memorial Drive
8525 W. Florist Avenue

#1 Diesel
166,548 $606,251.37

1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue & 
5230 W. State Street

4653 S. 13th Street
2050 N. Palmer Street
8814 W. Lisbon Avenue
2130 W. Oklahoma Avenue
4927 W. Fiebrantz Avenue

2142 W. Canal Street
3921 W. Lincoln Avenue
3025 W. Ruby Avenue
6710 W. Industrial Road
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
5230 W. State Street

2142 W. Canal Street & 
1313 W. Mt. Vernon Avenue
2142 W. Canal Street & 
5230 W. State Street

2647 N. Bartlett Avenue (Single Wall)
2901 N. Teutonia Avenue
100 N. 64th Street
8025 W. Bradley Road
6680 N. Teutonia Avenue

BIDDER: PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION - FORT WAYNE, IN
LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?:  N/A

Department of Public Works (DPW)

Delivery Address
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BID TABULATION #12485 PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
VC FOR DIESEL FUEL TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
OPENED 05/23/2013 @ 2:00 PM-CST EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:
AUTUMN TRUCKING INC (DID NOT BID ON B100 BIO-DIESEL)

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE 
AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE 
DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

THE LOW TOTAL BIDDER FOR #1 AND #2 DIESEL FUEL, B100 BIODIESEL AND OFF-ROAD DIESEL SHALL BE 
DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL COST OF THE INDIVIDUAL BIDS FOR DPW, MFD, AND WATER DETAILED 
ABOVE.

LOW BIDDER FOR OFF-ROAD DIESEL FOR WATER SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE QUOTED TOTAL COST PER 
GALLON (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) PLUS THE AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TANK WAGON DELIVERY COST TO 
LINNWOOD, RIVERSIDE, AND FLORIST.

LOW BIDDER FOR #1 AND #2 DIESEL FUEL FOR MFD SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE AVERAGE OF QUOTED TOTAL 
COST PER GALLON FOR #1 AND #2 (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) MULTIPLIED BY MFD’S ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE 
OF 166,548 GALLONS PLUS THE AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TANK WAGON DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 166,548 
GALLONS. MFD DOES NOT ORDER SPLIT LOADS.

LOW BIDDER FOR #1 AND #2 DIESEL FUEL AND B100 BIO-DIESEL FUEL FOR DPW SHALL BE DETERMINED FROM THE 
AVERAGE OF THE QUOTED TOTAL COST PER GALLON FOR #1 AND #2 DIESEL FUEL (EXCLUDING DELIVERY COSTS) 
MULTIPLIED BY DPW’S ESTIMATED USAGE OF 1,115,000 GALLONS PLUS THE TOTAL COST PER GALLON FOR B100 BIO-
DIESEL FUEL MULTIPLIED BY DPW’S ESTIMATED MINIMUM USAGE OF 25,000 GALLONS PLUS THE AVERAGE THE 
QUOTED TRANSPORT DELIVERY COST MULTIPLIED BY 1,140,000 GALLONS, AND THE QUOTED SPLIT LOAD DELIVERY 
COST MULTIPLIED BY 32.

FOR A TOTAL AWARD, BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE QUOTES FOR ALL USER DEPARTMENTS AND THEIR LOCATIONS 
LISTED IN THIS BID AND/OR SPECIFICATION TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR A TOTAL AWARD. 

FOR AN INDIVIDUAL DEPARTMENT AWARD, BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE QUOTES FOR ALL OF THE LOCATIONS LISTED IN 
THIS BID AND/OR SPECIFICATION FOR AN INDIVIDUAL DEPARTMENT TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN INDIVIDUAL 
DEPARTMENT AWARD.

AWARD WILL BE MADE INDIVIDUALLY BY DEPARTMENT (DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS (DPW), MILWAUKEE FIRE 
DEPARTMENT (MFD), AND WATER, OR IN TOTAL (ALL DEPARTMENTS) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND 
RESPONSIVE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS 
WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.


