BID TABULATION #2512
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR MOTORCRAFT & FORD OEM PARTS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE M. PETTIGREW
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640
EMAIL: APETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PAGE 1 OF 6

OPENED 3/1/2012 @ 2:00 PM-CST

DISCOUNT
BIDDER ITEM # PART # DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER & PART # PRICE LBE AFFIDAVIT
EACH SUBMITTED?
MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "A"
1 ASH-701 SHOCK ABSORBER MOTORCRAFT ASH-701 $113.44
MOTORCRAFT BRAB278
2 BRAB-179 SPEED SENSOR (SUPERCEDED PART #) $53.27
3 BT-68 TENSIONER MOTORCRAFT BT68 $31.47
4 MM-929 BLOWER MOTOR MOTORCRAFT MM929 $37.02
5 MCSOE-37 CONTROL ARM MOTORCRAFT MCSOE-37 $80.25
6 PW-464 WATER PUMP MOTORCRAFT PW464 $64.57
7 RF-272 FAN MOTOR WITH SHROUD MOTORCRAFT RF272 $170.98
8 STP-93-RM PS PUMP MOTORCRAFT STP93RM $72.68
CHICAGO PARTS & SOUND, LLC 9 SW-6524 SWITCH MOTORCRAFT SW6524 $94.87
10 [WG-301 WSW PUMP MOTORCRAFT WG301 $15.33 N/A
11  |WLR-3 REGULATOR MOTORCRAFT WLR-3 $55.99
ELK GROVE VILLAGE, IL 12 [XY-75W140-QL REAR AXLE LUBE MOTORCRAFT XY75W140QL $15.42
13 |YCC-151 AC COMPRESSOR MOTORCRAFT YCC-151 $375.29
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "A"| $1,180.58
FORD OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "B"
1 3W7Z-6A715-AA HOSE NO BID
2 5L17-14529-AA SWITCH NO BID
3 5W1Z-3B676-AA SHAFT NO BID
4 6W72-17682-AACP MIRROR NO BID
5 8W1Z-4264-B LINKAGE NO BID
6 8W7Z-13C788-C MODULE NO BID
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "B"
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DISCOUNT
BIDDER ITEM # PART # DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER & PART # PRICE LBE AFFIDAVIT
EACH SUBMITTED?
MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "A"
1 ASH-701 SHOCK ABSORBER MOTORCRAFT ASH-701 $103.92
2 BRAB-179 SPEED SENSOR MOTORCRAFT BRAB-179 $32.64
3 BT-68 TENSIONER MOTORCRAFT BT68 $28.92
4 MM-929 BLOWER MOTOR MOTORCRAFT MM929 $33.48
5 MCSOE-37 CONTROL ARM MOTORCRAFT MCSOE-37 $73.51
6 PW-464 WATER PUMP MOTORCRAFT PW464 $58.73
7 RF-272 FAN MOTOR WITH SHROUD MOTORCRAFT RF272 $154.62
8 STP-93-RM PS PUMP MOTORCRAFT STP-93-RM $66.58
9 SW-6524 SWITCH MOTORCRAFT SW6524 $85.79
GORDIE BOUCHER LINCOLN 10 |WG-301 WSW PUMP MOTORCRAFT WG301 $13.95
11  |WLR-3 REGULATOR MOTORCRAFT WLR-3 $51.29 N/A
WEST ALLIS, WI 12 [XY-75W140-QL REAR AXLE LUBE MOTORCRAFT XY-75W140-QL $14.12
13 |YCC-151 AC COMPRESSOR MOTORCRAFT YCC-151 $341.36
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "A"| $1,058.91
FORD OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "B"
1 3W7Z-6A715-AA HOSE FORD 3W7Z-6A715-AA $82.12
2 5L17-14529-AA SWITCH FORD 5LI1Z-14529-AA $52.53
3 5W1Z-3B676-AA SHAFT FORD 5W1Z-3B676-AA $118.81
4 6W7Z-17682-AACP MIRROR FORD CRASH PART 627Z-17682-AACP $74.61
5 8W1Z-4264-B LINKAGE FORD 8W1Z7-4264-B $85.66
6 8W7Z-13C788-C MODULE FORD 8W72-13C788-C $257.71

TOTAL ATTACHMENT "B"

$671.44
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DISCOUNT
BIDDER ITEM # PART # DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER & PART # PRICE LBE AFFIDAVIT
EACH SUBMITTED?
MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "A"
1 ASH-701 SHOCK ABSORBER MOTORCRAFT ASH-701 $103.92
2 BRAB-179 SPEED SENSOR MOTORCRAFT BRAB-179 $32.44
3 BT-68 TENSIONER MOTORCRAFT BT68 $28.76
4 MM-929 BLOWER MOTOR MOTORCRAFT MM929 $33.29
5 MCSOE-37 CONTROL ARM MOTORCRAFT MCSOE-37 $73.08
6 PW-464 WATER PUMP MOTORCRAFT PW464 $58.39
7 RF-272 FAN MOTOR WITH SHROUD MOTORCRAFT RF272 $153.71
8 STP-93-RM PS PUMP MOTORCRAFT STP-93-RM $66.19
9 SW-6524 SWITCH MOTORCRAFT SW-6524 $85.29
GORDIE BOUC';IZTLOSF MENOMONEE 10 [WG-301 WSW PUMP MOTORCRAFT WG-301 $13.86
11 |WLR-3 REGULATOR MOTORCRAFT WLR-3 $50.99 N/A
MENOMONEE FALLS, WI 12 [XY-75W140-QL REAR AXLE LUBE MOTORCRAFT XY-75W140-QL $14.04
13 |YCC-151 AC COMPRESSOR MOTORCRAFT YCC-151 $339.36
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "A"| $1,053.32
FORD OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "B"
1 3W7Z-6A715-AA HOSE FORD 3W7Z-6A715-AA $81.69
2 5L17-14529-AA SWITCH FORD 5LI1Z-14529-AA $52.26
3 5W1Z-3B676-AA SHAFT FORD 5W1Z-3B676-AA $118.19
4 6W72-17682-AACP MIRROR FORD CRASH PART 627WZ-17682-AACP $73.15
5 8W17-4264-B LINKAGE FORD 8W1Z7-4264-B $85.22
6 8W7Z-13C788-C MODULE FORD 8W77-13C788-C $255.76

TOTAL ATTACHMENT "B"

$666.27
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DISCOUNT
BIDDER ITEM # PART # DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER & PART # price | -BEAFFIDAVIT
SUBMITTED?
EACH
MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "A"

1 [AsH-701 SHOCK ABSORBER MOTORCRAFT ASH-701 $81.03

2 |BRAB-179 SPEED SENSOR MOTORCRAFT R/B BRAB-278 $40.98

3 |BT-68 TENSIONER MOTORCRAFT BT-68 $31.47

4 |MM-929 BLOWER MOTOR MOTORCRAFT MM-929 $28.48

5 |MCSOE-37 CONTROL ARM MOTORCRAFT MCSOE-37 $57.32

6 |PW-464 WATER PUMP MOTORCRAFT PW-464 $54.96
7 |RF-272 FAN MOTOR WITH SHROUD MOTORCRAFT RF272 $131.52

8 [STP-93-RM PS PUMP MOTORCRAFT STP-93-RM $41.54

9 [sw-6524 SWITCH MOTORCRAFT SW-6524 $72.98

HILLER FORD INC. 10 [wG-301 WSW PUMP MOTORCRAFT WG-301 $13.05

11 |WLR-3 REGULATOR MOTORCRAFT WLR-3 $40.00 N/A
FRANKLIN, WI 12 [XY-75W140-QL REAR AXLE LUBE MOTORCRAFT XY-75W140-QL $8.82
13 |ycc-151 AC COMPRESSOR MOTORCRAFT YCC-151 $319.40
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "A  $921.55
FORD OEM PARTS ATTACHMENT "B"*

1 [3w7z-6A715-AA HOSE FORD 3W7Z-6A715-AA $84.71

2 |5L12-14529-AA SWITCH FORD 5LIZ-14529-AA $54.74
3 |5W1z-3B676-AA SHAFT FORD 5W1Z-3B676-AA $123.79

4 |6W72-17682-AACP MIRROR FORD 6W7Z-17682-AACP $72.79

5 |8w1z-4264-B LINKAGE FORD 8W1Z-4264-B $89.26
6 [8W7z-13C788-C MODULE FORD 8W7Z-13C788-C $267.88
TOTAL ATTACHMENT "B"[  $693.17

* HILLER FORD LISTED PRICE EACH DID NOT LIST DISCOUNT PRICE
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NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING.:
BRAEGER FORD - DID NOT RETURN ATTACHMENT A AND/OR B DATED FEBRUARY 17, 2012
EWALD'S VENUS FORD - DID NOT RETURN ATTACHMENT A AND/OR B DATED FEBRUARY 17, 2012

*** AWARD STATEMENT***

AWARD WILL BE MADE TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, SPECIFIED DELIVERY
REQUIREMENTS, AND COMPLETION OF PRICING SHEET ATTACHMENT “A” FOR MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTSAND/OR “B” FOR FORD OEM PARTS.

THIS IS A MULTIPLE AWARD CONTRACT TO BE DETERMINED AS FOLLOWS:
*** AWARD STATEMENT FOR MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS ***

AWARD OF MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE LOW AGGREGATE TOTAL OF THE DISCOUNTED UNIT PRICES OF ALL ITEMS 1
THROUGH 13 LISTED IN ATTACHMENT "A" FOR MOTORCRAFT.

BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL OF THE ITEMS LISTED IN THE ATTACHMENT ‘A” TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD. FAILURE TO PROVIDE ANY OF THE
INFORMATION REQUESTED IN ATTACHMENT "A" MAY RESULT IN BID REJECTION.

THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, AND COMPLETION
OF PRICING SHEET ATTACHMENT “A” FOR MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS WILL BE CONSIDERED THE PRIME VENDOR FOR THIS CONTRACT AND AWARDED 60%
OF THE CONTRACT

THE SECOND LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, AND
COMPLETION OF PRICING SHEET ATTACHMENT “A” FOR MOTORCRAFT OEM PARTS WILL BE CONSIDERED THE BACK-UP VENDOR AND AWARDED 40% OF
THE CONTRACT.
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*** AWARD STATEMENT FOR FORD OEM PARTS ***

AWARD OF FORD OEM PARTS WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE LOW AGGREGATE TOTAL OF THE DISCOUNTED UNIT PRICES OF ALL ITEMS 1 THROUGH 6
LISTED IN ATTACHMENT "B" FOR FORD OEM PARTS.

BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL OF THE ITEMS LISTED IN THE ATTACHMENT ‘B” TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD. FAILURE TO PROVIDE ANY OF THE
INFORMATION REQUESTED IN ATTACHMENT "B" MAY RESULT IN BID REJECTION.

THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, AND COMPLETION
OF PRICING SHEET ATTACHMENT “B” FOR FORD OEM PARTS WILL BE CONSIDERED THE PRIME VENDOR FOR THIS CONTRACT AND AWARDED 85% OF THE
CONTRACT.

THE SECOND LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, AND
COMPLETION OF PRICING SHEET ATTACHMENT “B” FOR FORD OEM PARTS WILL BE CONSIDERED THE BACK-UP VENDOR FOR THIS CONTRACT AND
AWARDED 15% OF THE CONTRACT.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID
DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.



