

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

SUMMARY OF BIDS								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	BURTON & MAYER	LACROSSE GRAPHICS	LITHO-CRAFT	MAREK GROUP	TMC MAIL CO.	UNITED PRESS GRAPHICS	VICTORIA GRAPHICS
1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 943.00	\$ 557.04	\$ 848.00	\$ 566.00	NO BID	\$ 856.00	\$ 978.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 410.00	\$ 440.80	\$ 594.00	\$ 337.00	NO BID	\$ 446.00	\$ 490.00
2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,316.00	\$ 855.99	\$ 968.00	\$ 903.00	NO BID	\$ 983.00	\$ 1,080.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 390.00	\$ 440.80	\$ 616.00	\$ 352.00	NO BID	\$ 456.00	\$ 540.00
3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,335.00	\$ 726.10	\$ 1,146.00	\$ 731.00	NO BID	\$ 1,279.00	\$ 1,285.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 699.00	\$ 731.78	\$ 824.00	\$ 626.00	NO BID	\$ 876.00	\$ 805.00
4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,619.00	\$ 1,172.78	\$ 1,242.00	\$ 1,177.00	NO BID	\$ 1,507.00	\$ 1,790.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 732.00	\$ 731.78	\$ 845.00	\$ 640.00	NO BID	\$ 891.00	\$ 890.00
5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,701.00	\$ 928.14	\$ 1,638.00	\$ 966.00	NO BID	\$ 1,275.00	\$ 1,595.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 701.00	\$ 835.00	\$ 1,149.00	\$ 659.00	NO BID	\$ 872.00	\$ 990.00
6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,971.00	\$ 1,366.17	\$ 1,896.00	\$ 1,429.00	NO BID	\$ 1,492.00	\$ 2,240.00
	70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 731.00	\$ 835.00	\$ 1,178.00	\$ 674.00	NO BID	\$ 882.00	\$ 996.00
ADD'L AUTH. ALTERATIONS - EST. 25 HOURS		\$ 2,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 960.00	\$ 1,375.00	NO BID	\$ 2,125.00	\$ 1,500.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES		\$ 14,548.00	\$ 11,121.38	\$ 13,904.00	\$ 10,435.00	NO BID	\$ 13,940.00	\$ 15,179.00
A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 895.00	NO BID	\$ 412.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 721.00	NO BID
B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 895.00	NO BID	\$ 412.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 721.00	NO BID
C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 1,328.00	NO BID	\$ 565.00	\$ 927.00	\$ 772.00	NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2		\$ 3,180.00	\$ 3,118.00	NO BID	\$ 1,389.00	\$ 1,707.00	\$ 2,214.00	NO BID

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
BURTON & MAYER MENOMONEE FALLS, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS			N/A	
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 943.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 410.00		
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,316.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 390.00		
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,335.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 699.00		
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,619.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 732.00		
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,701.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 701.00		
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,971.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 731.00		
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$80 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 2,000.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 14,548.00		
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00		
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00		
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,060.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	\$ 3,180.00		

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
LACROSSE GRAPHICS INC. LA CROSSE, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				N/A
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 557.04		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 440.80		
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 855.99		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 440.80		
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 726.10		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 731.78		
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,172.78		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 731.78		
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 928.14		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 835.00		
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,366.17		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 835.00		
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$60 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 1,500.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 11,121.38		
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 895.00		
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 895.00		
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,328.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	\$ 3,118.00		

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?		
LITHO-CRAFT CO., INC. GERMANTOWN, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				N/A	
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 848.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 594.00			
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 968.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 616.00			
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,146.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 824.00			
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,242.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 845.00			
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,638.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,149.00			
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,896.00			
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,178.00			
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$38 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 960.00			
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 13,904.00			
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS					
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID			
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID			
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID			
	TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	NO BID				

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
THE MAREK GROUP WAUKESHA, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				N/A
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 566.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 337.00		
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 903.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 352.00		
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 731.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 626.00		
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,177.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 640.00		
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 966.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 659.00		
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,429.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 674.00		
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$55 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 1,375.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 10,435.00		
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 412.00		
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 412.00		
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 565.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	\$ 1,389.00		

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
TMC MAIL COMPANY MILWAUKEE, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS			NO	
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$N/A FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	NO BID		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	NO BID		
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 390.00		
B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 390.00			
C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 927.00			
	TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	\$ 1,707.00			

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?		
UNITED PRESS GRAPHICS HARTLAND, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				N/A	
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 856.00			
			\$ 446.00			
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 983.00			
			\$ 456.00			
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,279.00			
			\$ 876.00			
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,507.00			
			\$ 891.00			
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE, 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,275.00			
			\$ 872.00			
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE, 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS 70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,492.00			
			\$ 882.00			
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$85 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 2,125.00			
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 13,940.00			
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS					
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 721.00			
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 721.00			
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 772.00			
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	\$ 2,214.00			

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW
 TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640
 EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	LOT PRICE	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	
VICTORIA GRAPHICS, INC. GREENFIELD, WI	LINE ITEM #1 PRINTING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	1	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 978.00	N/A	
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 490.00		
	2	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 4-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,080.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 540.00		
	3	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,285.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 805.00		
	4	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 6-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,790.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 890.00		
	5	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 2-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 1,595.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 990.00		
	6	PRODUCTION COSTS FOR 17,000 8-PAGE , 4-COLOR NEWSLETTERS	\$ 2,240.00		
		70# RECYCLED PAPER FOR 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	\$ 996.00		
		AUTHORIZED ADD'L ALTERATIONS - HOURLY RATE OF \$60 FOR ESTIMATED 25 HOURS	\$ 1,500.00		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #1 - PRINTING SERVICES	\$ 15,179.00		
	LINE ITEM #2 ADDRESSING & MAILING OF ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS				
	A	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 4-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	B	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 6-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
	C	ADDRESSING, TABBING, AND BULK MAILING 17,000 8-PAGE NEWSLETTERS	NO BID		
		TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM #2 - ADDRESSING & MAILING SERVICES	NO BID		

BID TABULATION #2446

OPENED 03/10/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VSC FOR PRINTING ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS

PURCHASING AGENT: ANGELIQUE PETTIGREW

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2640

EMAIL: A.PETTI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

AWARD OF BID

THIS BID WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM 1-PRINTING SERVICES AND LINE ITEM 2-ADDRESSING AND MAILING SERVICES TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS, THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS AND COMPLETION OF ATTACHMENT A.-REQUIREMENTS FOR ALDERMANIC NEWSLETTERS THAT IS DEEMED IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY.

***AWARD OF LINE ITEM 1-PRINTING SERVICES -- WILL BE AWARDED IN TOTAL TO ONE BIDDER AND BIDDER MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS (1-6) TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD. LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE LOW AGGREGATE TOTAL OF THE PRICES QUOTED FROM ITEMS 1 THROUGH 6, PLUS AUTHORIZED ADDITIONAL ALTERATIONS COSTS.

***AWARD OF LINE ITEM 2-ADDRESSING AND MAILING SERVICES -- WILL BE AWARDED IN TOTAL TO ONE BIDDER AND BIDDER MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS (A-C) TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD. LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE LOW AGGREGATE TOTAL OF THE PRICES QUOTED FROM ITEMS A THROUGH C.

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY AND ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR LINE ITEM 1 AND/OR LINE ITEM 2.