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BID TABULATION #2521 OPENED 10/18/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS & BODIES, DUMP & CHIP BOX

PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE QTY TOTAL GRAND TOTAL LBE AFFIDAVIT 
SUBMITTED?

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY NO BID - - -

2 DUMP BODY NO BID - - -

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY NO BID - - -

4 CHIP BOX BODY ALTEC AF1472 $23,391.00 2 $46,782.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY NO BID - - -

2 DUMP BODY SWENSON 12 FT DB $75,354.47 4 $301,417.88

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY NO BID - - -

4 CHIP BOX BODY NO BID - - -

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY NO BID - - -

2 DUMP BODY HENDERSON MARK E $83,333.00 4 $333,332.00

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY NO BID - - -

4 CHIP BOX BODY KNAPHEIDE KFB171725A $20,406.00 2 $40,812.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY INTERNATIONAL/7300 $74,175.00 4 $296,700.00

2 DUMP BODY NO BID - - -

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY INTERNATIONAL/4300 $72,675.00 2 $145,350.00

4 CHIP BOX BODY NO BID - - -

ALTEC INDUSTRIES, INC.
BIRMINGHAM, AL N/A$46,782.00

BADGER TRUCK CENTER
MILWAUKEE, WI $301,417.88 NO

CASPER'S TRUCK EQUIPMENT
APPLETON, WI $374,144.00 N/A

LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS, 
LLC

MILWAUKEE, WI
$442,050.00 NO
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1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY NO BID - - -

2 DUMP BODY CRYSTEEL ECON 12' $87,627.00 4 $350,508.00

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY NO BID - - -

4 CHIP BOX BODY KNAPHEIDE KFB171725A $26,774.00 2 $53,548.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY NO BID - - -

2 DUMP BODY CRYSTEEL SELECT $75,780.00 4 $303,120.00

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY NO BID - - -

4 CHIP BOX BODY NO BID - - -

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY

FREIGHTLINER M2106 (NON CNG)
M2112V (CNG) $78,101.00 4 $312,404.00

2 DUMP BODY NO BID - - -

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY FREIGHTLINER M2106  $75,245.00 2 $150,490.00

4 CHIP BOX BODY NO BID - - -

1 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 HEAVY DUTY

KENWORTH T470 
TRUCK CHASSIS $89,897.00 4 $359,588.00

2 DUMP BODY NO BID - - -

3 TRUCK CHASSIS
4X2 MEDIUM DUTY

KENWORTH T370 
TRUCK CHASSIS $74,175.00 2 $148,350.00

4 CHIP BOX BODY NO BID - - -

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS 1 - 4) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE 
SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS WITH OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS LISTED HEREIN.

VENDORS MUST BID ON ALL LINE ITEMS IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED FOR A TOTAL AWARD.

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL WITH OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS LISTED, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES 
NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

MADISON TRUCK EQUIPMENT INC.
FRANKSVILLE, WI $404,056.00

WISCONSIN KENWORTH LLC
OAK CREEK, WI $507,938.00 N/A

N/A

MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
DEPERE, WI $303,120.00 N/A

TRUCK COUNTRY
OAK CREEK, WI $462,894.00 N/A


