

**BID TABULATION #2490**

OPENED 7/12/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VC FOR SAND, STONE &amp; GRAVEL AND CRUSHED GRAVEL

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MICHAEL.DRZEWIECKI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

Page 1

BIDDER		HALQUIST STONE COMPANY INC SUSSEX, WI		LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
ITEM	ESTIMATED USAGE FOR THE THREE-YEAR TERM OF THE CONTRACT IN TONS	AVERAGE PRICE PER TON	TOTAL FOR ESTIMATED USAGE	N/A
A. MASON SAND	2,000	NO BID	NO BID	
B. PEA GRAVEL	750	NO BID	NO BID	
C. 1-1/2 INCH MACADAM STONE	6,000	\$10.85	\$65,100.00	
D. 3/8 INCH STONE CHIPS	120,000	\$11.74	\$1,408,800.00	
E. 1/4 INCH WASHED STONE	45,000	\$18.18	\$818,100.00	
F. 3/8 INCH LIMESTONE CHIPS	16,000	\$11.74	\$187,840.00	
G. 3/4 INCH GRADED CRUSHED GRAVEL*	12,000	NO BID	NO BID	
H. 3/4 INCH CRUSHED STONE	5,000	\$9.35	\$46,750.00	
I. 3/8 INCH CRUSHED, WASHED LIMESTONE CHIPS	60,000	\$11.74	\$704,400.00	
<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>			<b>\$3,230,990.00</b>	

BIDDER		HERITAGE LOGISTICS WARRENVILLE, IL		LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
ITEM	ESTIMATED USAGE FOR THE THREE-YEAR TERM OF THE CONTRACT IN TONS	AVERAGE PRICE PER TON	TOTAL FOR ESTIMATED USAGE	N/A
A. MASON SAND	2,000	\$17.80	\$35,600.00	
B. PEA GRAVEL	750	NO BID	NO BID	
C. 1-1/2 INCH MACADAM STONE	6,000	NO BID	NO BID	
D. 3/8 INCH STONE CHIPS	120,000	\$11.64	\$1,396,800.00	
E. 1/4 INCH WASHED STONE	45,000	NO BID	NO BID	
F. 3/8 INCH LIMESTONE CHIPS	16,000	\$11.64	\$186,240.00	
G. 3/4 INCH GRADED CRUSHED GRAVEL*	12,000	NO BID	NO BID	
H. 3/4 INCH CRUSHED STONE	5,000	\$11.10	\$55,500.00	
I. 3/8 INCH CRUSHED, WASHED LIMESTONE CHIPS	60,000	\$11.64	\$698,400.00	
<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>			<b>\$2,372,540.00</b>	

**BID TABULATION #2490**

OPENED 7/12/2011 @ 2:00 PM-CST

VC FOR SAND, STONE &amp; GRAVEL AND CRUSHED GRAVEL

Page 2

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MICHAEL.DRZEWIECKI@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER		PRICE & SONS, INC. MILWAUKEE, WI		LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
ITEM	ESTIMATED USAGE FOR THE THREE-YEAR TERM OF THE CONTRACT IN TONS	AVERAGE PRICE PER TON	TOTAL FOR ESTIMATED USAGE	YES
A. MASON SAND	2,000	NO BID	NO BID	
B. PEA GRAVEL	750	NO BID	NO BID	
C. 1-1/2 INCH MACADAM STONE	6,000	\$13.00	\$78,000.00	
D. 3/8 INCH STONE CHIPS	120,000	\$13.94	\$1,672,800.00	
E. 1/4 INCH WASHED STONE	45,000	\$20.77	\$934,650.00	
F. 3/8 INCH LIMESTONE CHIPS	16,000	\$18.18	\$290,880.00	
G. 3/4 INCH GRADED CRUSHED GRAVEL*	12,000	NO BID	NO BID	
H. 3/4 INCH CRUSHED STONE	5,000	\$11.41	\$57,050.00	
I. 3/8 INCH CRUSHED, WASHED LIMESTONE CHIPS	60,000	\$12.88	\$772,800.00	
<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>			<b>\$3,806,180.00</b>	

\* Addendum No. 1 - Delete Item G from Attachment A

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS A THROUGH I) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

LOW TOTAL BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF THE AVERAGE COST OF THE PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY TO THE NORTH SIDE AND SOUTH SIDE DELIVERY TIMES THE ESTIMATED USAGE FOR ITEMS A THROUGH I. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE A PER TON DELIVERED PRICE FOR BOTH NORTH SIDE AND SOUTH SIDE FOR ITEM A THROUGH I IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED FOR A TOTAL AWARD.

LOW LINE ITEM BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE AVERAGE OF THE PER TON DELIVERED PRICE TO THE NORTH SIDE AND SOUTH SIDE FOR A LINE ITEM TIMES THE ESTIMATED USAGE.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.