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BID TABULATION #2365 OPENED 2/11/2010 @ 2:00 PM-CST
BODIES, PLATFORM & UTILITY
PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE QTY TOTAL GRAND 
TOTAL

LBE 
AFFIDAVIT 

SUBMITTED?

1 PLATFORM BODY OMAHA STANDARD PHD6 $10,829.35 1 $10,829.35

2 UTILITY BODY OMAHA STANDARD SBD132D54H $32,354.33 2 $64,708.66

1 PLATFORM BODY KNAPHEIDE PVMX-103C $11,464.00 1 $11,464.00

2 UTILITY BODY KNAPHEIDE 5132D54J, VAN AIR 050447 
MULTI-DRIVE, GENAIR 6KW $36,697.00 2 $73,394.00

1 PLATFORM BODY READING BODY, MODEL H-10-W $18,915.00 1 $18,915.00

2 UTILITY BODY READING, MODEL UR-132B DW $40,811.00 2 $81,622.00

1 PLATFORM BODY KNAPHEIDE PVMX-1036 $12,884.00 1 $12,884.00

2 UTILITY BODY NO BID NO BID 2 N/A

1 PLATFORM BODY MONROE / ANTHONY $12,692.00 1 $12,692.00

2 UTILITY BODY NO BID NO BID 2 N/A

1 PLATFORM BODY OMAHA STD. HEAVY DUTY PLATFORM - 
OSHO 106096 $10,904.00 1 $10,904.00

2 UTILITY BODY NO BID NO BID 2 N/A

1 PLATFORM BODY NO BID NO BID 1 N/A

2 UTILITY BODY KNAPHEIDE #5132D54J $46,733.00 2 $93,466.00

DUECO, INC
WAUKESHA, WI $100,537.00 N/A

BADGER TRUCK CENTER
MILWAUKEE, WI $75,538.01 YES

CASPER'S TRUCK EQUIPMENT
APPLETON, WI $84,858.00 N/A

MADISON TRUCK EQUIPMENT
OAK CREEK, WI $12,884.00 N/A

MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
DEPERE, WI $12,692.00 N/A

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (BOTH LINE ITEMS) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS 
AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

LOW TOTAL BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF THE UNIT PRICES MULTIPLIED BY THE QUANTITY. THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD BY 
LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT 
EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

NORTHLAND EQUIPMENT CO., INC.
JANESVILLE, WI $10,904.00 N/A

UTILITY SALES AND SERVICE, INC.
APPLETON, WI $93,466.00 N/A


