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BID TABULATION #2320
TRUCK CHASSIS, 29,000 POUND & DUMP BODY

PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395
EMAIL: DIANE.BERNDT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTUERER & PART # UNIT PRICE QTY TOTAL

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD TRUCK ENGINEERING CS125 $14,134.56 5 $70,672.80

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD HENDERSON MARK II 9' $18,217.00 5 $91,085.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NOT PROVIDED $64,175.00 5 $320,875.00

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NOT PROVIDED $65,675.00 5 $328,375.00

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NOT PROVIDED $71,675.00 5 $358,375.00

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD DURACLASS MODEL SL316 $23,152.00 5 $115,760.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD CRYSTEEL / MONROE $16,312.00 5 $81,560.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD CRYSTEEL / MONROE $16,812.00 5 $84,060.00

1 TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID

2 DUMP BODY - 5 YARD SWENSON DB 926 $17,889.00 5 $89,445.00

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE 
SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT 
PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

BADGER TRUCK
WEST ALLIS, WI

CASPER'S TRUCK EQUIPMENT
APPLETON, WI

LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
MILWAUKEE, WI

(IF PURCHASED BY 12/31/2009)

LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
MILWAUKEE, WI

(IF BUILT AFTER 12/31/2009, PRE-EMISSION, 
2011 MODEL TRUCK)

LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
MILWAUKEE, WI

(IF BUILT AFTER 12/31/2009, WITH 2010 
EMISSION ENGINE, 2011 MODEL TRUCK)

MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
DEPERPE, WI

(WITH POWDER COAT DUMP BODY)

OLSON TRAILER & BODY LLC

MADISON TRUCK EQUIPMENT
OAK CREEK, WI

MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
DEPERPE, WI


