
BID TABULATION #2274                     CLOSED 6/2/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
VC BATTERIES
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395
EMAIL: DIANE.BERNDT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER A B C D E TOTAL A B C D E TOTAL A B C D E TOTAL
ADVANCED INDUSERVE 
SUPPLY
BUTLER, WI $0.240 $0.240 $0.480 $0.690 $0.870 $2.520 $0.410 $0.410 $0.740 $0.760 $1.360 $3.680 $0.240 $0.240 $0.460 $0.690 $0.980 $2.610
APPLIED INDUSTRIAL 
TECHNOLOGIES-
MAINLINE, INC.
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.260 $0.260 $0.490 $0.640 $0.890 $2.540
ALPHA SOURCE INC.
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.380 $0.380 $0.660 $0.750 $1.130 $3.300 $0.410 $0.390 $0.800 $0.940 $1.470 $4.010
BATTERY PRODUCTS INC.
HARTLAND, WI $0.240 $0.240 $0.450 $0.650 $0.810 $2.390
BATTLE & BATTLE 
DISTRIBUTORS INC
DECATUR, GA $0.260 $0.260 $0.510 $0.700 $0.880 $2.610 $0.270 $0.260 $0.620 $0.750 $1.050 $2.950 $0.240 $0.230 $0.460 $0.650 $0.890 $2.470
CRESCENT ELECTRIC 
SUPPLY
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.240 $0.240 $0.490 $0.710 $0.890 $2.570 $0.320 $0.300 $0.620 $0.700 $1.020 $2.960 $0.210 $0.210 $0.420 $0.610 $0.880 $2.330
E.R. ABERNATHY 
INDUSTRIAL, INC.
SUSSEX, WI $0.400 $0.400 $0.710 $0.850 $1.300 $3.660 $0.540 $0.550 $0.770 $0.870 $1.510 $4.240
GRAYBAR ELECTRIC 
COMPANY, INC.
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.230 $0.210 $0.450 $0.650 $0.940 $2.480
KAESTNER AUTO 
ELECTRIC
WAUKESHA, WI $0.220 $0.230 $0.460 $0.660 $0.950 $2.520
LONG'S ELECTRONICS, 
INC.
IRONDALE, AL $0.470 $0.570 $1.080 $1.090 $1.610 $4.820
NEHER ELECTRIC SUPPLY
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.230 $0.230 $0.460 $0.660 $0.830 $2.410 $0.300 $0.280 $0.580 $0.650 $1.040 $2.850 $0.200 $0.190 $0.390 $0.570 $0.820 $2.170
REMY BATTERY CO., INC.
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.390 $0.380 $0.710 $0.850 $1.260 $3.590 $0.200 $0.200 $0.400 $0.560 $0.830 $2.190
STAPLES
OAK CREEK, WI $0.500 $0.500 $1.010 $1.150 $2.030 $5.190 $0.570 $0.580 $1.210 $1.160 $2.390 $5.910 $0.290 $0.270 $1.040 $1.050 $2.000 $4.650
USA BLUE BOOK
WAUKEGAN, IL $0.233 $0.223 $0.633 $0.666 $0.945 $2.700 $0.223 $0.133 $0.456 $0.289 $0.389 $1.490

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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AWARD WILL BE MADE BY GROUP TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY 
REQUIREMENTS.  LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED BY THE GRAND TOTAL OF THE PRICE PER BATTERY FOR EACH GROUP OF BATTERIES LISTED (GROUPS 1-3).  BIDDERS 
MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS IN A GROUP TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD FOR THAT GROUP.

GROUP 1 - Energizer GROUP 2 - Duracell GROUP 3 - Rayovac
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