BID TABULATION #2252

VALVES, CURB BOX, COUPLINGS & COPPER COILS

PURCHASING AGENT: DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2395

EMAIL: DIANE.BERNDT@MILWAUKEE.GOV

CLOSED 4/21/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PAGE 1 OF 2

CAMBRIDGE BRASS
CAMBRIDGE, ONTARIO, CANADA

DAVIES WATER A DIVISION OF FERGUSON
WATERWORKS SUSSEX, WI

ITEM QTY
MFG & PART # PRICE EACH TOTOA_II:YFOR MFG & PART # PRICE EACH TOTOA_II:YFOR
1 [ MINNEAPOLIS 1"FLR X FLR 20 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 262-3434 $45.21 $904.20 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6104 $50.15 $1,003.00
2 | MINNEAPOLIS 1 1/4 FLR X FLR 48 [INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 6104 $76.50 $3,672.00
3 [ MINNEAPOLIS 1 1/2" FLR X FLR 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 262-C6C6 $97.15 $2,331.60 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6104 $107.80 $2,587.20
4 | MINNEAPOLIS 2" FLR X FLR 10 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 262-C7C7 $157.18 $1,571.80 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6104 $174.35 $1,743.50
5 | MINNEAPOLIS 3/4" FIP X FIP 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 262-F3F3 $26.97 $647.28 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6101 $26.15 $627.60
6 [1"FIP XFIP 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 262-F4F4 $40.32 $967.68 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6101 $40.65 $975.60
7 111/4"X11/2" X11/4" FIP X FIP 48 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 202-F5F5 $48.40 $2,323.20 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6101 $60.55 $2,906.40
8 111/2"FIP XFIP 18 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 202-F6F6 $70.15 $1,262.70 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6101 $76.05 $1,368.90
9 [2"FIP XFIP 12 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 202-F7F7 $102.59 $1,231.08 |A.Y. MCDONALD 6101 $111.25 $1,335.00
10 |8FT CURB BOX 24 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 5623 $43.15 $1,035.60
11 |7 1/2FT CURB BOX 36 _[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 5623 $41.90 $1,508.40
12 |7FT CURB BOX 24 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 5623 $40.50 $972.00
13 148" CURB BOX ROD 84 [INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 5674 $8.60 $722.40
14 |3/4" CTS X MIP 50 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 117/H3M3 $7.02 $351.00 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4753Q $7.60 $380.00
15 |1"CTS X MIP 50 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 117-H4M4 $8.32 $416.00 |A.Y. MCDONALD 47530 $9.05 $452.50
16 |1 1/4" CTS X MIP 50 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 117-H5M5 $14.54 $727.00 _|A.Y. MCDONALD 4753Q $15.80 $790.00
17 111/2" CTS X MIP 50 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 117-H6M6 $20.83 $1,041.50 |A.Y. MCDONALD 47530 $22.60 $1,130.00
18 |2" CTS X MIP 50 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 117-H7M7 $30.36 $1,518.00 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4753Q $32.90 $1,645.00
19 ]11/2" X1 1/4"CTS X MIP 12 INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 47530 $20.50 $246.00
20 [11/4"X1"CTS X MIP 30 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 47530 $14.70 $441.00
21 [3'4" BRONZE CAP 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2201 $1.45 $17.40
22 [3/4" FLR X FLR 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 118-C3CE $7.88 $189.12 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758 $8.55 $205.20
23 [1"FLRXFLR 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 118-C4C4 $13.82 $331.68 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758 $15.00 $360.00
24 [11/4"FLR XFLR 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 118-C5C5 $25.92 $622.08 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758 $28.10 $674.40
25 |11/2" FLR X FLR 12 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 118-C6C6 $37.91 $454.92 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758 $41.10 $493.20
26 [2"FLR XFLR 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 118-C7C7 $61.87 $1,484.88 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758 $67.10 $1,610.40
27 |3/4" CTS X CTS 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 119-H3H3 $8.55 $205.20 |A.Y. MCDONALD 47580 $9.30 $223.20
28 [1"CTS XCTS 36 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 119-H4H4 $9.79 $352.44 |A.Y. MCDONALD 4758Q $10.60 $381.60
29 111/4"CTS XCTS 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 119-H5H5 $15.44 $370.56__|A.Y. MCDONALD 47580 $16.75 $402.00
30 [11/2"CTS XCTS 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 119-H6H6 $29.93 $718.32__|A.Y. MCDONALD 4758Q $32.45 $778.80
31 [2"CTS XCTS 24 |CAMBRIDGE BRASS 119-H7H7 $40.41 $969.84 |A.Y. MCDONALD 47580 $43.80 $1,051.20
32 [3/4" FIP X FIP X FIP 36 _[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $2.40 $86.40
33 [1"FIP X FIP X FIP 36 _[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $4.30 $154.80
34 [114"FIP X FIP X FIP 36 _[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $6.00 $216.00
35 |1 1/2" FIP X FIP X FIP 24 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $8.25 $198.00
36_[2" FIP X FIP X FIP 12 INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $13.50 $162.00
37 111/4" X 1"FIP X FIP X FIP 24 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2230 $7.45 $178.80
38 [3/4" BRONZE PLUG 50 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2203 $1.60 $80.00
39 [1"BRONZE PLUG 50 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2203 $2.70 $135.00
40 11 1/2" BRONZE PLUG 50 |NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2203 $6.25 $312.50
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ITEM QTY CAMBRIDGE, ONTARIO, CANADA WATERWORKS SUSSEX, WI
MFG & PART # PRICE EACH TOTQ_II:YFOR MFG & PART # PRICE EACH TOTQ_II:YFOR
41 |2 "BRONZE PLUG 50 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2203 $9.90 $495.00
42 |1" BRONZE CAP 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2201 $2.10 $25.20
43 11 1/4" BRONZE CAP 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2201 $3.20 $38.40
44 |1 1/2" BRONZE CAP 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2201 $4.30 $51.60
45 12" BRONZE CAP 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2201 $7.30 $87.60
46 |1" X 3/4" BRONZE BUSHINGS 18 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2206 $1.70 $30.60
47 11 1/4" X 1" BRONZE BUSHINGS 36 _[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2206 $2.85 $102.60
48 |1 1/2" X 1" BRONZE BUSHINGS 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2206 $3.65 $43.80
49 111/2" X1 1/4" BRONZE BUSHINGS 24 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2206 $3.65 $87.60
50 |3/4" X CLOSE RED BRASS NIPPLES 100 |[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $1.20 $120.00
51 [1" X CLOSE RED BRASS NIPPLES 50 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $1.85 $92.50
52 |1 1/4" X CLOSE RED BRASS NIPPLES 100 |[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $2.60 $260.00
53 [11/2" X CLOSE RED BRASS NIPPLES 20 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $3.40 $68.00
54 [2" X CLOSE RED BRASS NIPPLES 20 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $5.15 $103.00
55 [3/4" X 2" RED BRASS NIPPLES 25 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $1.50 $37.50
56 [1" X 2" RED BRASS NIPPLES 25 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $2.15 $53.75
57 [11/4" X 2" RED BRASS NIPPLES 50 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $3.00 $150.00
58 |1 1/2" X 2" RED BRASS NIPPLES 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $3.65 $43.80
59 [2"X 2 1/2" RED BRASS NIPPLES 12 |INO BID $0.00 $0.00 A.Y. MCDONALD 2200 $5.60 $67.20
60 |3/4" X 60' TYPE K SOFT COPPER PIPE 180 |[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 MUELLER STREAMLINE $2.65 $477.00
61 [1" X 60' TYPE K SODT COPPER PIPE 600 [NO BID $0.00 $0.00 MUELLER STREAMLINE $3.45 $2,070.00
62 |1 1/4" X 60' TYPE K SOFT COPPER PIPE | 600 |[NO BID $0.00 $0.00 MUELLER STREAMLINE $4.40 $2,640.00
GRAND TOTALS 39 ITEMS NOT BID $920.56 $20,992.08 $1,386.65 $40,408.15

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL, WHICHEVER IS DEEMED TO BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY, TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND
RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS. BIDDERS ARE STRONGLY CAUTIONED TO
QUOTE ALL ITEMS LISTED TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.
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