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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

CUMBERLAND SERVICENTER, BID #1 OF 5

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $206,649.00

MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): CRANE CARRIER LET-2

MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): HEIL PT COMMERCIAL/25
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $4,400.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,800.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX $700.00
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK $45.00

SUBTOTAL $720,275.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,273,139.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $7,923,025.00

UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE

PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $206,649.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $4,400.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,800.00
SUBTOTAL $719,530.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,446,543.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $5,036,710.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,719,682.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $12,959,735.00
2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD

RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

I
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

CUMBERLAND SERVICENTER, BID #2 OF 5

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $216,049.00

MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): CRANE CARRIER LET-2

MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): MCNEILUS MODEL 2513
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $2,752.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $750.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX $0.00
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK $0.00

SUBTOTAL $726,232.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,376,539.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $7,988,552.00

UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE

PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $216,049.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $2,752.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $750.00
SUBTOTAL $726,232.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,512,343.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $5,083,624.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,888,882.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $13,072,176.00
2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD
RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09

OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
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OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

CUMBERLAND SERVICENTER, BID #3 OF 5

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $207,071.00
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): CRANE CARRIER LET-2
MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): LEACH 2 R IlI

OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $5,742.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $825.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX $0.00
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK $0.00
SUBTOTAL $720,319.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,277,781.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $7,923,509.00
UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE
PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $207,071.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $5,742.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $825.00
SUBTOTAL $720,319.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,449,497.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $5,042,233.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,727,278.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $12,965,742.00

2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID

OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD
RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
I
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

CUMBERLAND SERVICENTER, BID #4 OF 5

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $198,281.00

MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): CRANE CARRIER LET-2

MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): LOAD MASTER EXCEL "S" 25
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $3,100.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,500.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX $500.00
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK $250.00

SUBTOTAL $710,312.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,181,091.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $7,813,432.00

UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE

PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $198,281.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $3,100.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,500.00
SUBTOTAL $709,562.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,387,967.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $4,966,934.00

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,569,058.00
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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $12,780,366.00

2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD

RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
I
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

CUMBERLAND SERVICENTER, BID #5 OF 5
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM NO BID
OPTIONAL STRIPES NO BID
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX NO BID
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE
PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR NO BID
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
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OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM NO BID
OPTIONAL STRIPES NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY $245,089.00
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) CRANE CARRIER LET-2
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): G&H R-90 25
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY $300.00
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
SUBTOTAL $752,070.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,470,534.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS $4,512,420.00
UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD
RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE $245,089.00
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO CHARGE
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY $300.00
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM $446,778.00
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM $59,903.00
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK $101/HR + T&E FOR TRAVEL
SUBTOTAL $752,070.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,715,623.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $5,264,490.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS $490,178.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS $9,776,910.00

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 1 NOT BID

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 1 NOT BID

MILWAUKEE MACK SALES BID #1 OF 3

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $198,200.00
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): MACK LEU 613
MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): LEACH 2R-lll

OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $5,742.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $825.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX NO BID
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK NO BID
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SUBTOTAL $204,767.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,180,200.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $2,252,437.00
UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE
PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $198,200.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $5,742.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $825.00
SUBTOTAL $204,767.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS

$1,387,400.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS

$1,433,369.00

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,567,600.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $3,685,806.00
2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY $247,670.00
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) MACK LEU 613

MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): G&H R90
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY $1,500.00
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID

SUBTOTAL $249,170.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS

$1,486,020.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS

$1,495,020.00

UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD

RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE $247,670.00
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY $1,500.00
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL $249,170.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS

$1,733,690.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS

$1,744,190.00

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS $495,340.00

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS $3,239,210.00
I

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS $4,062,940.00

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS $4,734,230.00

MILWAUKEE MACK SALES BID #2 OF 3

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

$205,200.00

MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS):

MACK LEU 613
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TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY
PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY):

HEIL PT COMMERCIAL

OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $4,732.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,800.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX $700.00
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK $4,500.00
SUBTOTAL $216,932.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,257,200.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $2,386,252.00
UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE
PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $205,200.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $4,732.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $1,800.00
SUBTOTAL $211,732.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS

$1,436,400.00

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS

$1,482,124.00

TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,693,600.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $3,868,376.00
2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID
UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD
RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS

LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID
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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

MILWAUKEE MACK SALES BID #3 OF 3

1 |TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY $207,834.00
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS): MACK LEU 613
MFG & MODEL # (REFUSE BODY): MCNEILUS 2513

OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM $2,752.00
OPTIONAL STRIPES $750.00
OPTION TO DELETE STORAGE BOX NO BID
OPTION TO DELETE TIRE STORAGE HOOK NO BID
SUBTOTAL $211,336.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $2,286,174.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 11 OF LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $2,324,696.00
UNIT PRICE FOR EA. OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS & 25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE
PACKER BODY UNITS TO BE PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09 WITH OR $207,834.00
WITHOUT OPTIONS
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED TRUCK W/CNG SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL CONTAINER LIFT MECHANISM NO BID
OPTIONAL STRIPES NO BID
SUBTOTAL $207,834.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS $1,454,838.00
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS $1,454,838.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITHOUT OPTIONS $3,741,012.00
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 1 WITH OPTIONS $3,779,534.00

2 |TRUCK, CHASSIS AND 25 CUBIC YARD RECYCLER PACKER BODY NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (TRUCK CHASSIS) NO BID
MFG & MODEL # (RECYCLER BODY): NO BID

OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
SUBTOTAL NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 6 OF LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

UNIT PRICE FOR EA, OF 7 ADD'L TRUCK CHASSIS/25 CUBIC YARD

RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH OR WITHOUT OPTIONS TO BE NO BID
PURCHASED ON OR BEFORE 2/28/09
OPTIONAL TILT-STEERING COLUMN NO BID
OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR RECYCLER BODY NO BID
OPTIONAL HYBRID DRIVE SYSTEM NO BID
OPTIONAL COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS (CNG) SYSTEM NO BID

OPTIONAL MAINTENANCE OF COMPLETED CNG SYSTEM TRUCK NO BID
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BID TABULATION #2214 OPENED 1/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS AND 25-CUBIC-YARD REFUSE PACKER BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO: (414) 286-3588

EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE GOV

SUBTOTAL NO BID

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID

NET TOTAL FOR QUANTITY 7 ADDITIONAL UNITS WITH OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITHOUT OPTIONS NO BID
TOTAL FOR LINE ITEM 2 WITH OPTIONS NO BID

I
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITHOUT OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID
GRAND TOTAL, LINE ITEMS 1 & 2, WITH OPTIONS LINE ITEM 2 NOT BID

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM WITH OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS 1 AND 2) WITH
OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE
SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS. LOW LINE ITEM BIDDER WILL BE
DETERMINED FROM THE TOTAL OF THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE FOR THE TRUCK CHASSIS W/25 CUBIC YARD
REFUSE OR RECYCLER PACKER BODY UNITS WITH THE QUOTED PRICE(S) FOR THE SELECTED OPTIONS
MULTIPLIED BY THE QUANTITY FOR 2008 AND 2009. LOW TOTAL BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE
GRAND TOTAL OF THE QUOTED UNIT PRICES FOR THE TRUCK CHASSIS W/25 CUBIC YARD REFUSE AND
RECYCLERPACKER BODY UNITS WITH THE SELECTED OPTION(S) MULTIPLIED BY THE QUANTITY FOR 2008 AND
2009. THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL WITH OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS
WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.



