

BID TABULATION #19592

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR VALVE AND SERVICE BOX PARTS
 OPENED 07/11/2023 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PURCHASING AGENT: MARKIESHA HENDERSON
 TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3612
 EMAIL: MAHEND@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER	ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	COMMODITY CODE	MANUFACTURERS PART #	UOM	UNIT PRICE	QUANTITY REQUIRED	TOTAL	GROUP TOTAL	GRAND TOTAL	LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	BUY MILWAUKEE / AMERICAN AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?	SRC AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?
BINGHAM & TAYLOR CORPORATION (CULPEPER, VA)	GROUP 1 VALVE BOX PARTS	1	BASE	3090171	CUL5BA6	EACH	\$ 98.07	600	\$58,842.00	\$542,065.50			
		2	COVER STANDARD (VB-2)	3090175	CCO5LVB2	EACH	\$ 33.13	1700	\$56,321.00				
		3	COVER SMALL (VB-9)	3090176	CUL4LVB9	EACH	\$ 35.16	1000	\$35,160.00				
		4	EXTENSION 18" (VB-5)	3090177	CUL5M61-58B	EACH	\$ 54.72	500	\$27,360.00				
		5	EXTENSION 24" (VB-4)	3090178	CUL5M62-59B	EACH	\$ 70.49	250	\$17,622.50				
		6	1" ADJUSTING RING (VB-10)	3090179	CUL5AVB10	EACH	\$ 35.82	100	\$3,582.00				
		7	2" ADJUSTING RING (VB-11)	3090055	CUL5AVB11	EACH	\$ 50.14	100	\$5,014.00				
		8	3" ADJUSTING RING (VB-7)	3090057	GRE5A3RD	EACH	\$ 36.53	50	\$1,826.50				
		9	D-MID SECTION 30" (VB-4)	3090181	GRE5M63-60B	EACH	\$ 91.91	250	\$22,977.50				
		10	DD-MID SECTION 36" (VB-4)	3090183	GRE5M64-61B	EACH	\$ 127.28	500	\$63,640.00				
		11	TOP SECTION SHORT (VB-3)	3090186	CUL5T55VB3	EACH	\$ 84.40	700	\$59,080.00				
		12	TOP SECTION STD (VB-3)	3090187	CUL5T56VB3	EACH	\$ 115.52	1000	\$115,520.00				
		13	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (THREADED) (VB-12)	0440189	CULAVB12	EACH	\$ 84.70	300	\$25,410.00				
		14	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (THREADED) (VB-8)	NON-INV	CUL5ARH12	EACH	\$ 78.53	300	\$23,559.00				
		15	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (PLAIN) (VB-13)	0440190	CUL5AVB13	EACH	\$ 82.22	150	\$12,333.00				
		16	LOCKING COVER LARGE (VB-2)	NON-INV	I5LBWULB	EACH	\$ 65.34	150	\$9,801.00				
		17	LOCKING COVER SMALL (VB-9)	NON-INV	I4LWULBVB9	EACH	\$ 26.78	150	\$4,017.00				
	GROUP 2 SERVICE BOX PARTS	18	2 1/2' X 7' SERV BOX	3090086	I2B94FW152	EACH	\$ 163.41	600	\$98,046.00	\$169,522.50			
		19	3" X 7' SERV BOX	3090088	I3B2W156	EACH	\$ 95.37	50	\$4,768.50				
		20	2 1/2' BASE - ENLARGED	3090090	CUL2BA14E	EACH	\$ 34.84	50	\$1,742.00				
		21	EXTENSION 2 1/2' X 9" #151	3090112	CUL2E151	EACH	\$ 27.04	800	\$21,632.00				
		22	EXTENSION 2 1/2' X 16" #152	3090116	GRE2E152	EACH	\$ 33.81	300	\$10,143.00				
		23	TOP HALF SHORT	3090130	I2TLDW	EACH	\$ 52.71	500	\$26,355.00				
		24	TOP HALF REG (W/BOLT)	3090131	I2TLFW	EACH	\$ 68.36	100	\$6,836.00				
	GROUP 3 REPAIR COVERS	25	SERV BOX COVER, 2 1/2 IN (RND OUTSIDE)	3090103	I2LBWREP10374	EACH	\$ 33.63	2000	\$67,260.00	\$160,086.00			
		26	SERV BOX COVER, 2 1/2 IN (FLAT)	3090104	I2LBWREPOB	EACH	\$ 33.63	2000	\$67,260.00				
		27	SERV BOX COVER 2 1/2 IN (NO-SKIRT)	NON-INV	I2LBWREPMIL	EACH	\$ 33.63	750	\$25,222.50				
		28	TOWN OF LAKE 1 1/4 MINN STYLE LID	NON-INV	I2LPA1-25W	EACH	\$ 11.45	30	\$343.50				
GROUP 1 VALVE BOX PARTS	1	BASE	3090171	Tyler 10145660	EACH	\$ 92.30	600	\$55,380.00	\$481,160.00				
	2	COVER STANDARD (VB-2)	3090175	Tyler 10145370	EACH	\$ 30.45	1700	\$51,765.00					
	3	COVER SMALL (VB-9)	3090176	Tyler 10145325	EACH	\$ 19.40	1000	\$19,400.00					
	4	EXTENSION 18" (VB-5)	3090177	Tyler 10145158	EACH	\$ 80.30	500	\$40,150.00					
	5	EXTENSION 24" (VB-4)	3090178	Tyler 10145066	EACH	\$ 81.25	250	\$20,312.50					
	6	1" ADJUSTING RING (VB-10)	3090179	Tyler 10533641	EACH	\$ 12.95	100	\$1,295.00					
	7	2" ADJUSTING RING (VB-11)	3090055	Tyler 10533689	EACH	\$ 20.30	100	\$2,030.00					
	8	3" ADJUSTING RING (VB-7)	3090057	Tyler 10533696	EACH	\$ 34.15	50	\$1,707.50					
	9	D-MID SECTION 30" (VB-4)	3090181	Tyler 10145165	EACH	\$ 84.90	250	\$21,225.00					
	10	DD-MID SECTION 36" (VB-4)	3090183	Tyler 10145172	EACH	\$ 99.70	500	\$49,850.00					
	11	TOP SECTION SHORT (VB-3)	3090186	Tyler 10144946	EACH	\$ 71.10	700	\$49,770.00					
	12	TOP SECTION STD (VB-3)	3090187	Tyler 10144953	EACH	\$ 109.85	1000	\$109,850.00					
	13	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (THREADED) (VB-12)	0440189	Tyler 10148197	EACH	\$ 68.30	300	\$20,490.00					

BID TABULATION #19592

VENDOR CONTRACT FOR VALVE AND SERVICE BOX PARTS
 OPENED 07/11/2023 @ 2:00 PM-CST

PURCHASING AGENT: MARKIESHA HENDERSON
 TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3612
 EMAIL: MAHEND@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PRICE AND SONS, INC. (MILWAUKEE, WI)		14	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (THREADED) (VB-8)	NON-INV	Tyler 10148197	EACH	\$ 68.30	300	\$20,490.00	\$643,835.00	YES	YES AMERICAN MADE	YES	
		15	ADJUSTABLE TOP SECTION (PLAIN) (VB-13)	0440190	Tyler 10148241	EACH	\$ 64.60	150	\$9,690.00					
		16	LOCKING COVER LARGE (VB-2)	NON-INV	Tyler 10145462	EACH	\$ 25.85	150	\$3,877.50					
		17	LOCKING COVER SMALL (VB-9)	NON-INV	Tyler 10145462	EACH	\$ 25.85	150	\$3,877.50					
		GROUP 2 SERVICE BOX PARTS	18	2 1/2" X 7' SERV BOX	3090086	Tyler 147459	EACH	\$ 173.50	600	\$104,100.00	\$162,675.00			
			19	3" X 7' SERV BOX	3090088	NO BID	EACH	\$ 0.00	50	\$0.00				
			20	2 1/2" BASE - ENLARGED	3090090	Tyler 144806	EACH	\$ 23.10	50	\$1,155.00				
			21	EXTENSION 2 1/2" X 9" #151	3090112	Tyler 144762	EACH	\$ 20.30	800	\$16,240.00				
			22	EXTENSION 2 1/2" X 16" #152	3090116	Tyler 144779	EACH	\$ 28.60	300	\$8,580.00				
			23	TOP HALF SHORT	3090130	Tyler 147510	EACH	\$ 47.10	500	\$23,550.00				
			24	TOP HALF REG (W/BOLT)	3090131	Tyler 147763	EACH	\$ 90.50	100	\$9,050.00				
		GROUP 3 REPAIR COVERS	25	SERV BOX COVER, 2 1/2 IN (RND OUTSIDE)	3090103	NO BID	EACH	\$ 0.00	2000	\$0.00	\$0.00			
			26	SERV BOX COVER, 2 1/2 IN (FLAT)	3090104	NO BID	EACH	\$ 0.00	2000	\$0.00				
			27	SERV BOX COVER 2 1/2 IN (NO-SKIRT)	NON-INV	NO BID	EACH	\$ 0.00	750	\$0.00				
	28		TOWN OF LAKE 1 1/4 MINN STYLE LID	NON-INV	NO BID	EACH	\$ 0.00	30	\$0.00					

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY GROUP OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY. BIDDERS MUST QUOTE AT LEAST ONE COMPLETE GROUP TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AN AWARD.

THE LOW BIDDER(S) SHALL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE QUOTED UNIT PRICE BY THE QUANTITY TO OBTAIN THE GRAND TOTAL.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000. **EFFECTIVE JANUARY 01, 2017**, IF THE LBE IS CERTIFIED AS A SMALL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (SBE) WITH THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S OFFICE OF EQUITY AND INCLUSION (OEI), THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 10% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$30,000.

CONTRACTS SHALL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER WHO QUALIFIES FOR THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE-MADE, MILWAUKEE COUNTY-MADE OR AMERICAN-MADE PROGRAM (ORDINANCE 310-18.9) IF:

- THE BIDDER SUBMITS AN AFFIDAVIT WITH THEIR BID INDICATING THEY MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE ORDINANCE, AND
- THE BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 12% or \$25,000.

EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 12, 2018, IF A BIDDER IS SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR THE SOCIALLY-RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTORS (SRC) BID INCENTIVE AND IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE "SRC BIDDER" SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED \$25,000.

ANY BIDDER PROPOSING TO SUPPLY GOODS AND/OR SERVICES UNDER ORDINANCE 310-10, AND WHO DEMONSTRATES ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED BY THAT ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT ALSO RECEIVE THE BENEFIT OF THE BID AWARD PROVIDED UNDER THE LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) PROGRAM IN SECTION 365-7-1. A BIDDER MAY APPLY FOR BOTH PREFERENCES, BUT WILL FIRST BE CONSIDERED FOR ENTITLEMENT TO THE PREFERENCE PROVIDED UNDER ORDINANCE 365-7-1. SHOULD A BIDDER SEEK TO QUALIFY FOR ALL THREE BID PREFERENCES (LBE, BUY AMERICAN AND SRC) AND IN A SITUATION WHERE MULTIPLE BIDDERS ARE SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR VARIOUS DIFFERENT BID PREFERENCES, PRECEDENCE SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE BIDDER SEEKING TO QUALIFY FOR A BID INCENTIVE IN THE FOLLOWING DESCENDING ORDER:

1. LBE BID INCENTIVE
2. BUY AMERICAN BID INCENTIVE
3. SRC BID INCENTIVE