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BID 1978
BID TABULATION #1978 CLOSED 6/12/2007
VC-AMMUNITION SPECIFICATION: 45-B-1, DATED 5/22/2007
PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 ALL LINE ITEMS - NO SUBSTITUTES
EMAIL: JWILAN@MILWAUKEE.GOV
BIDDERS:| PRECISION AMMUNITION STREICHER'S
DESCRIPTION/ EST. ANNUAL|  UNIT PRICE PER TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER TOTAL
ITEM # BRAND/PRODUCT # USAGE 1,000 CARTRIDGES coSsT 1,000 CARTRIDGES cosT
CARTRIDGES, RIFLE, .308
A. |CALIBER, 165 GRAIN 1,000 NO BID $ 1,134.00 1,134.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
LE308T1 LE308T1
CARTRIDGES, RIFLE, .308
B. |CALIBER, 168 GRAIN 7,000 NO BID $ 625.00 4,375.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE- FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
GM308M GM308M
CARTRIDGES, RIFLE, .223
REMINGTON CALIBER, 55
GRAIN (FULL METAL
C. |JACKET) 25,000 NO BID $ 292.00 7,300.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE-AE223 AE223
CARTRIDGES, RIFLE, .223
REMINGTON CALIBER, 55
GRAIN (BONDED SOFT
D. |POINT) 5,200 NO BID $ 1,070.00 5,564.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE- FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
LE223T1 LE223T1
SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-
E. |3/4 INCH, 3 DRAM 9,000 NO BID $ 220.00 1,980.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE- FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
T116'8 T116.8
SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-
F. [3/4 INCH, 2-3/4 DRAM 45,000 NO BID $ 300.00 13,500.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE- FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
LE132*00 LE132.00 9-PELLET
SHOTSHELLS, 12 GAUGE, 2-
G. |3/4 INCH, 3-3/4 DRAM 5,000 NO BID $ 300.00 1,500.00
FEDERAL CARTRIDGE-LE127- FEDERAL CARTRIDGE
00 LE127.00 9-PELLET
CARTRIDGES, .40 S&W
H. |CALIBER, 180 GRAIN 100,000 NO BID $ 298.00 29,800.00
SPEER GOLD DOT
SPEER GOLD DOT #53962 453962
CARTRIDGES, 9MM LUGER
I. |CALIBER, 124+ P GRAIN 5,000 NO BID $ 282.00 1,410.00
SPEER GOLD DOT
SPEER GOLD DOT #53617 #53617
CARTRIDGES, 9MM CALIBER,
J. [7GRAIN 10,000 NO BID $ 500.00 5,000.00
SIMUNITION FX MARKING SIMUNITION FX 9MM
CARTRIDGES MARKING CART. 9FX
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BID 1978
BIDDERS:| PRECISION AMMUNITION STREICHER'S
DESCRIPTION/ EST. ANNUAL  UNIT PRICE PER TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER TOTAL
ITEM #{BRAND/PRODUCT # USAGE 1,000 CARTRIDGES cosT 1,000 CARTRIDGES cosT
CARTRIDGES, 9MM CALIBER,
K. |[FRANGIBLE 3,000 $ 266.56 | $ 799.68 || $ 300.00 | $ 900.00
FEDERAL CART.
PRECISION BCONT3 BALLISTICLEAN
AMMUNITION 9CM FRANGIBLE
CARTRIDGES, .40 S&W,
L. |FRANGIBLE 3,000 $ 282.24| ¢ 846.72 || $ 315.00 | $ 945.00
FEDERAL CART.
BC40CT1
PRECISION BALLISTICLEAN
AMMUNITION 40CM FRANGIBLE
CARTRIDGES, .40 S&W
M. |CALIBER, 180 GRAIN 450,000 NO BID $ 163.00 | § 73,350.00
CCI BLAZER CLEAN FIRE CCI BLAZER CLEAN
#3477 FIRE #3477
CARTRIDGES, 9MM CALIBER,
N. [124 GRAIN 56,000 NO BID $ 151.00 | § 8,456.00
LAWMAN CLEANFIRE
LAWMAN CLEAN FIRE #53824 #53824
ONLY 2 ITEMS BID ALL LINE
TOTAL BID BID $  1,646.40 [ITEMS $ 155,214.00

NON-COMPLYING BID RECEIVED FROM:
SHORE GALLERIES

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS A. THROUGH N.) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE
BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

LOW BIDDER BY LINE ITEM WILL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE STATED FOR EACH LINE ITEM
PROPORTIONATELY BY THE UNIT PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES QUOTED FOR THAT LINE ITEM TO OBTAIN THE ANNUAL COST PER
LINE ITEM.

EXAMPLE: ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE = 18,000 CARTRIDGES; UNIT PRICE QUOTED PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES = $175.00. MULTIPLY 18
(ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18,000 DIVIDED BY 1,000) BY $175.00 (COST PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES) = $3,150.00 TO OBTAIN ANNUAL
COST PER LINE ITEM.

IF BID 1978 IS AWARDED IN TOTAL, (LINE ITEMS A. THROUGH N.) LOW TOTAL BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL
OF THE ANNUAL COST FOR EACH LINE ITEM COMPUTED BY MULTIPLYING THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE STATED FOR EACH LINE
ITEM PROPORTIONATELY BY THE UNIT PRICE PER 1,000 CARTRIDGES QUOTED FOR THAT LINE ITEM A. THROUGH N. (SEE ABOVE
EXAMPLE.) BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL LINE ITEMS LISTED TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AN AWARD IN TOTAL.



