BID TABULATION #1752 CLOSED 2/28/2006 @ 2:00 PM-CST

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB W/PUSHER AXLE

DUMP BODY-16 YD, AND DUMP BODY-16 YD FOR SNOW & ICE CONTROL

PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916
EMAIL: jwilan@milwaukee.gov

BIDDER: CASPERS TRUCK EQUIPMENT

SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 10/20/2005

SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 10/31/2005
SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 10/20/2005

MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW 4 NO BID
OPTION: PREP PKG-SNOW PLOW USE 2
OPTION: TRAILER BRAKES 4
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD HENDERSON MARK ONE 2 $ 25,085.00 | $ 50,170.00
OPTION: AIR BRAKE GLADHANDS 2 NO CHARGE $ -
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD-SNOW & ICE
3 |CONTROL HENDERSON MARK ONE 2 3$ 38,345.00 | $ 76,690.00
TOTAL BID $ 126,860.00
UNIT PRICES QUOTED ABOVE WILL REMAIN THE SAME FOR EACH ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASED IN 2006
BIDDER: MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW 4 NO BID
OPTION: PREP PKG-SNOW PLOW USE 2
OPTION: TRAILER BRAKES 4
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD CRYSTAL SLTS 2 $ 24,753.00 | $ 49,506.00
OPTION: AIR BRAKE GLADHANDS 2 3$ 300.00 | $ 600.00
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD-SNOW & ICE
3 |CONTROL CRYSTAL SLTS 2 $ 38,403.00 | $ 76,806.00
TOTAL BID $ 126,912.00
UNIT PRICES QUOTED ABOVE WILL REMAIN THE SAME FOR EACH ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASED IN 2006
BIDDER: RACINE TRUCK SALES
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW MACK CT713 4 $ 101,603.96 | $ 406,415.84
OPTION: PREP PKG-SNOW PLOW USE 2 $ 350.00 | $ 700.00
OPTION: TRAILER BRAKES 4 $ 450.00 | $ 1,800.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD 2 NO BID
OPTION: AIR BRAKE GLADHANDS 2
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD-SNOW & ICE
3 |CONTROL 2 NO BID
TOTAL BID $ 408,915.84

UNIT PRICES QUOTED ABOVE WILL REMAIN THE SAME FOR EACH ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASED IF ORDERED WITHIN

CONTRACT TERMS OF THE BID.
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BID TABULATION #1752 CLOSED 2/28/2006 @ 2:00 PM-CST

TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB W/PUSHER AXLE SPECIFICATION #35-C-65AH, DATED 10/20/2005
DUMP BODY-16 YD, AND DUMP BODY-16 YD FOR SNOW & ICE CONTROL SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
PURCHASING AGENT: JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
TELEPHONE NUMBER: 414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35-D-19s, DATED 10/31/2005
EMAIL: jwilan@milwaukee.gov SPECIFICATION #35-D-22s, DATED 10/20/2005

BIDDER: TRUCK COUNTRY

MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
FREIGHTLINER M2112
NO FRONT FRAME
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW EXTENSION 4 $ 91,227.00 | $ 364,908.00
OPTION: PREP PKG-SNOW PLOW USE 2 NO BID
OPTION: TRAILER BRAKES 4 $ 500.00 | $ 2,000.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD 2 NO BID
OPTION: AIR BRAKE GLADHANDS 2
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD-SNOW & ICE
3 |CONTROL 2 NO BID
TOTAL BID $ 366,908.00

UNIT PRICES QUOTED ABOVE WILL REMAIN THE SAME FOR EACH ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASED IN 2006

BIDDER: TRUCK COUNTRY -- ALTERNATE BID #1
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT
ITEM |DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL
FREIGHTLINER M2112
WITH FRONT FRAME
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 64,000 LB GVW EXTENSION 4 $ 93,332.00 | $ 373,328.00
OPTION: PREP PKG-SNOW PLOW USE 2 INCLUDED IN $ -
TRUCK CHASSIS
UNIT PRICE
OPTION: TRAILER BRAKES 4 $ 500.00 | $ 2,000.00
2 |DUMP BODY, 16 YARD 2 NO BID
OPTION: AIR BRAKE GLADHANDS 2
DUMP BODY, 16 YARD-SNOW & ICE
3 |CONTROL 2 NO BID
TOTAL BID $ 375,328.00

UNIT PRICES QUOTED ABOVE WILL REMAIN THE SAME FOR EACH ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASED IN 2006

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS 1-2-3) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE
BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS THAT IS DEEMED IN THE
BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY.
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