BID 1989 (OPENED 7/5/2007 4:45PM)

DVCAM EQUIPMENT

PURCHASING AGENT: DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE (414) 286-2395

E-MAIL: dbernd@milwaukee.gov

PAGE 1 OF 2

ITEM DESCRIPTION

1ST EAGLE
ASSOCIATES
LLC

ERIN
ELECTRICAL
ENTERPRISES

FOCUS
CAMERA, INC.

LONG'S
ELECTRONICS

ROSCOR
CORPORATION

VIDEO
PRODUCTS,
INC

VISUAL
INTERACTIVE
DYNAMICS

VSA, INC.

WASHINGTON
PROFESSIONA
L SYSTEMS

1. DVCAM EDITING VER. FRAME ACCURATE
EDITING, RS-422 CONTROL, COMPOSITE,
COMPONENT. IEEE-1394 IN/OUT. CAPABLE
OF RECORDING 180 MINUTES ON DVCAM
TAPE. RACKMOUNTABLE. SONY MODEL
DSR-1800A OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$8,950.55

$7,629.95

$7,999.91

$8,060.00

$7,660.63

$6,995.00

$7,200.00

$7,169.72

$7,569.00

2. RACKKIT FOR THE ABOVE VCR FOR
STANDARD 19" EQUIPMENT RACK. FEC
MODEL RKSSUVW OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$235.55

$261.60

$349.99

$220.00

$236.00

$228.00

$185.00

$214.61

$222.00

3. DVCAM CAPABLE OF RECORDING 180
MINUTES ON DVCAM TAPE. RS-422
CONTROL, COMPOSITE, COMPONENT, AND
IEEE-1394 IN/OUT. XLR AUDIO INPUTS.
SONY MODEL DSR-45A OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$4,385.55

$3,727.45

$3,999.89

$3,950.00

$4,299.00

$3,545.00

$3,500.00

$3,512.13

$3,759.00

4. RACKKIT FOR ABOVE VCR FOR STANDARD
19" EQUIPMENT RACK. - 2 EACH

$184.50

$588.00

NO BID

$618.00

$590.00

$508.00

$470.00

$496.88

$598.00

5. HDV/DVCAM/DV COMPACT VTR. CAPABLE
OF RECORDING HDV, DVCAM OR DV VIDEO.
HDMI, COMPONENT NTSC, COMPOSITE
NTSC, S-VIDEO AND IEEE-1394 IN/OUTS.
SONY MODEL HVR-M25U OR EQUAL. 1 EA.

$3,705.95

$3,151.14

$3,299.89

$3,400.00

$3,248.88

$2,895.00

$3,060.00

$3,012.61

$3,355.00

6. 15" NTSC COLOR VIDEO PRODUCTION
MONITOR. 750 LINES, 16:9 AND 4:3 ASPECT
SWITCH. 2 LOOPING COMPOSITE VIDEO
AND AUDIO INPUTS/OUTPUTS.
RACKMOUNTABLE. JVCMODEL TMH-150CGU
OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$505.35

$481.95

$529.95

NO BID

$491.00

$479.00

$495.00

$440.75

$466.00

7. RACKKIT FOR ABOVE FOR 19" STANDARD
EQUIPMENT RACK. JVC MODEL RKC150G
OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$199.25

$174.35

NO BID

NO BID

$79.40

$150.00

$128.00

$137.20

$149.00

8. AUDIO/VIDEO DISTRIBUTION AMPLIFIER. 1 X
5 OUT. COMPOSITE VIDEO (BNC
CONNECTORS). STEREO AUDIO (RCA
CONNECTORS) RACKMOUNTABLE IN
STANDARD 19"RACK. OCEAN MATRIX
MODEL OMX7001 OR EQUAL. 1 EACH

$322.05

$381.45

$399.95

NO BID

$334.00

$299.00

$309.00

$289.31

$305.00

TOTAL

$18,488.75

$16,395.89

$16,579.58

$16,248.00

$16,938.91

$15,099.00

$15,347.00

$15,273.21

$16,423.00
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DELIVERY REQUIREMENT COMPLIANCE YES NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO
RESPONSE RESPONSE

2 BIDS WERE RECEIVED WITHOUT ADDENDUM 1. ONE OF THESE BIDS HAS THE COMPANY NAME "B&H PHOTO-VIDEO-PRO AUDIO" IN THE FAX HEADER, BUT BEYOND THAT IT

IS NOT POSSIBLE TO DETERMINE WHO SUBMITTED THIS BID. THE OTHER BID HAS NO IDENTIFYING BIDDER INFORMATION ON IT AT ALL.

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED

DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

NON=COMPLYING BID - VIDEO MARKETING SYSTEMS - DID NOT PROVIDE DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE WITH BID.




