BID TABULATION #2111

HERBICIDES

PURCHASING AGENT: WINONA MARSHALL
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3612

EMAIL: WINONA.MARSHALL@MILWAUKEE.GOV

OPENED 5/9/2008 @ 4:45 PM-CST

PAGE 1 OF 2

BIDDER: A M LEONARD
LINE ITEM MFG & PART # QTY uom PRICE EACH TOTAL
1 |ROUNDUP DRY PACKS IN 1.5 OZ WATER SOLUBLE PACKS E:g}lg’ MONSANTO-ROUNDUP DRY 50 1.5-0Z PKG $2.10 $105.00
2.5-GAL
2 |ROUNDUP PRO IN 2.5 GALLON CONTAINERS RUG2/MONSANTO-ROUND UP PRO 26 CONTAINER $116.90 $3,039.40
3 |[SNAPSHOT 2.5TG, GRANULAR IN 50 LB BAGS SS50/DOW/SNAPSHOT-50 LB BAG 39 50-LB BAG $92.75 $3,617.25
4 |SAHARA DG, 2 LB BAGS OR EQUAL NO BID
5 |BIO BLOOM 4-6-4 SUSTAIN, 50 LB BAGS OR EQUAL NO BID
6 |[INSECTICIDE BLAST EM WASP SPRAY, 14 OZ CANS NO BID
7 |INSECTICIDE LESCO FLUSH & CONTACT, 17 OZ CANS NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $6,761.65
BIDDER: LESCO
LINE ITEM MFG & PART # QTY UOoM PRICE EACH TOTAL
ROUNDUP QUIKPRO DRY DOSE PAK
1 |ROUNDUP DRY PACKS IN 1.5 OZ WATER SOLUBLE PACKS 1.6 OZX5 4088933 50 1.5-0Z PKG $2.17 $108.50
PROSECUTOR PRO 2.5 GAL./EA 2.5-GAL
2 |ROUNDUP PRO IN 2.5 GALLON CONTAINERS 4089289 26 iy $75.00 $1,950.00
3 |SNAPSHOT 2.5TG, GRANULAR IN 50 LB BAGS SNAPSHOT 2.5TG 50LB/BAG #035012 39 50-LB BAG $88.56 $3,453.84
4 |SAHARA DG, 2 LB BAGS OR EQUAL SAHARA DG HER. 2 LBS/EA. #069219 20 2-LB BAG $30.07 $601.40
4-6-4 SUSTANE LANDSCAPERS
5 |BIO BLOOM 4-6-4 SUSTAIN, 50 LB BAGS OR EQUAL 50LB/BAG #026617 22 50-LB BAG $18.89 $415.58
LESCO WASP & HORNET PLUS
6 |[INSECTICIDE BLAST EM WASP SPRAY, 14 OZ CANS 17 EOZ/CAN #084153* 36 17.5-0Z CAN $5.11 $183.96
7 |INSECTICIDE LESCO FLUSH & CONTACT, 17 OZ CANS ;55’;2 4CB'8° EXTRA 1702 CAN 12 17-0Z CAN $16.70 $200.40
GRAND TOTAL $6,913.68
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BID TABULATION #2111 OPENED 5/9/2008 @ 4:45 PM-CST
HERBICIDES

PURCHASING AGENT: WINONA MARSHALL

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3612

EMAIL: WINONA . MARSHALL@MILWAUKEE.GOV

BIDDER: REINDERS INC.
LINE ITEM MFG & PART # QTY uoMm PRICE EACH TOTAL
1860-15-MONSANTO QUICK PRO
1 |ROUNDUP DRY PACKS IN 1.5 0Z WATER SOLUBLE PACKS (SOLD BY 5 PACK) 50 1.5-0Z PKG $2.18 $109.00
MONSANTO ROUNDUP PRO #1850- 2.5-GAL
2 |ROUNDUP PRO IN 2.5 GALLON CONTAINERS 025 26 CONTAINER $101.85 $2,648.10
3 |SNAPSHOT 2.5TG, GRANULAR IN 50 LB BAGS DOW SNAPSHOT 2.5TG, #248790 39 50-LB BAG $74.50 $2,905.50
4 |SAHARA DG, 2 LB BAGS OR EQUAL SAHARA DG-#26000 20 2-LB BAG $30.00 $600.00
5 |[BIO BLOOM 4-6-4 SUSTAIN, 50 LB BAGS OR EQUAL NO BID
6 [INSECTICIDE BLAST EM WASP SPRAY, 14 OZ CANS NO BID
7 |INSECTICIDE LESCO FLUSH & CONTACT, 17 OZ CANS NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $6,262.60

A NOTICE OF NO BID WAS RECEIVED FROM FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LLC.

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM (1 THROUGH 7) OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING
WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.



