
BID TABULATION #2601 OPENED 6/19/2012 @ 2:00 PM-CST
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR INDUSTRIAL GRADE AKALINE BATTERIES

PURCHASING AGENT:  MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3588
EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

A B C D E TOTAL A B C D E TOTAL A B C D E TOTAL
ADVANCED INDUSERVE 

SUPPLY
BUTLER, WI $0.250 $0.250 $0.530 $0.770 $0.950 $2.750 $0.770 $0.770 $1.810 $1.810 $3.550 $8.710 $0.270 $0.270 $0.550 $0.760 $1.270 $3.120

BATTERIES PLUS LLC
HARTLAND, WI $0.235 $0.235 $0.635 $0.705 $1.090 $2.900 $0.200 $0.200 $0.500 $0.610 $0.930 $2.440

BATTERY PRODUCTS INC.
HARTLAND, WI $0.230 $0.230 $0.460 $0.670 $0.820 $2.410

FACTORY MOTOR PARTS
WAUKESHA, WI $0.370 $0.360 $0.610 $0.740 $1.240 $3.320

REMY BATTERY CO., INC.
MILWAUKEE, WI $0.340 $0.320 $0.670 $0.770 $1.190 $3.290 $0.340 $0.320 $0.670 $0.770 $1.190 $3.290 $0.250 $0.240 $0.450 $0.600 $0.870 $2.410
USA BLUE BOOK
WAUKEGAN, IL $0.280 $0.260 $0.740 $0.780 $1.100 $3.160 $0.260 $0.230 $0.470 $0.650 $0.870 $2.480

A LATE BID WAS RECEIVED FROM INTERLINE BRANDS/AMSAN

GROUP 3 - RAYOVAC BRAND ONLY
(NO SUBSTITUTE)

NO BIDNO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE 
LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

BIDDER

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED FROM: REMY BATTERY CO., INC.

NO BID

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY GROUP TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY 
REQUIREMENTS.  LOW BIDDER FOR EACH GROUP WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF THE QUOTED UNIT PRICES PER BATTERY FOR EACH GROUP AND SIZE OF 
BATTERIES LISTED.  BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT A QUOTE FOR EACH BATTERY SIZE IN A GROUP IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AWARD..

GROUP 1 - EVEREADY BRAND ONLY 
(NO SUBSTITUTE)

GROUP 2 - DURACELL BRAND ONLY
(NO SUBSTITUTE)


