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BID TABULATION #2408 OPENED 08/10/2010 @ 2:00 PM-CST
VALVES, CURB BOX, COUPLINGS, & COPPER COILS

PURCHASING AGENT:  WINONA MARSHALL
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3612
EMAIL:  WINONA.MARSHALL@MILWAUKEE.GOV

MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE QTY TOTAL MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE QTY TOTAL

1 CURB BOX NO BID - 100 - M5623  7FT  2" $43.10 100 $4,310.00
2 CURB BOX NO BID - 75 - M5623  7 1/2  2" $44.60 75 $3,345.00
3 CURB BOX NO BID - 50 - M5623  8'  2" $46.00 50 $2,300.00
4 ROD, SHUT OFF NO BID - 50 - M5660 $9.15 50 $457.50
5 ROD, SHUT OFF NO BID - 100 - M5674 $9.15 100 $915.00
6 BALL VALVE NO BID - 30 - M6104  3/4" $39.60 30 $1,188.00
7 BALL VALVE NO BID - 60 - M6104  1" $53.40 60 $3,204.00
8 BALL VALVE NO BID - 80 - M6104  1-1/4" $81.50 80 $6,520.00
9 BALL VALVE NO BID - 12 - M6104  1-1/2" $114.80 12 $1,377.60
10 BALL VALVE NO BID - 6 - M6104  2" $185.80 6 $1,114.80
11 COUPLINGS NO BID - 150 - M4753Q  1" $9.60 150 $1,440.00
12 COUPLINGS NO BID - 200 - M4753Q  1-1/4" $16.80 200 $3,360.00
13 COUPLINGS NO BID - 150 - M4753Q  1-1/4" x 1" $15.60 150 $2,340.00
14 COUPLINGS NO BID - 25 - M47531 - 1 1/2" x 1 1/4" $21.90 25 $547.50
15 COUPLINGS NO BID - 30 - M4753Q  2" $35.05 30 $1,051.50
16 COUPLINGS NO BID - 12 - NO BID - 12 -
17 BALL VALVE NO BID - 30 - M6101 3/4" $27.85 30 $835.50
18 BALL VALVE NO BID - 50 - M6101  1" $43.30 50 $2,165.00
19 BALL VALVE NO BID - 100 - M6101  1 1/4 X 1 1/2 X 1 1/4 $64.50 100 $6,450.00
20 BALL VALVE NO BID - 30 - M6101  1 1/2" $81.05 30 $2,431.50
21 BALL VALVE NO BID - 12 - M6101  2" $118.50 12 $1,422.00
22 COUPLING NO BID - 50 - M4758Q  1" $11.30 50 $565.00
23 COUPLING NO BID - 60 - M4758Q  1-1/4" $17.80 60 $1,068.00
24 COUPLING NO BID - 36 - M4758  1" $16.00 36 $576.00
25 COUPLING NO BID - 40 - M4758  1-1/4" $30.00 40 $1,200.00
26 COUPLING NO BID - 18 - M4758  1-1/2" $43.80 18 $788.40
27 BUSHING NO BID - 48 - M3126-626 $2.40 48 $115.20

28 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
202016 $12.03 25 $300.75 M2230  1-1/4 x 1 $9.20 25 $230.00

29 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38101-16 $5.23 25 $130.75 M2230  1" $5.30 25 $132.50

30 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
161612 $8.53 50 $426.50 M2230  1 x 3/4 $6.50 50 $325.00

31 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
202012 $8.53 100 $853.00 M2230  1-1/4 x 3/4 $9.20 100 $920.00
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32 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
242412 $16.55 18 $297.90 M2230  1-1/2 x 3/4 $12.65 18 $227.70

33 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
32312 $27.04 12 $324.48 M2230  2 x 3/4 $20.70 12 $248.40

34 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
242420 $16.55 25 $413.75 M2230  1-1/2 x 1-1/4 $12.65 25 $316.25

35 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
242416 $16.55 25 $413.75 M2230  1-1/2 x 1 $12.65 25 $316.25

36 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
323224 $27.04 25 $676.00 M2230  2 x 1-1/2 $20.70 25 $517.50

37 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
323220 $27.04 25 $676.00 M2230  2 x 1-1/4 $20.70 25 $517.50

38 TEES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38106-
323216 $27.04 25 $676.00 M2230  2 x 1 $20.70 25 $517.50

39 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-12 $2.39 100 $239.00 M2200  3/4 $1.50 100 $150.00

40 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-16 $2.37 300 $711.00 M2200  1" $2.15 300 $645.00

41 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-
1620 $2.87 200 $574.00 M2200  1 x 2 $2.65 200 $530.00

42 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-20 $5.30 200 $1,060.00 M2200  1 1/4 $3.21 200 $642.00

43 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-
2020 $6.06 200 $1,212.00 M2200  1 1/4 x 2 $3.70 200 $740.00

44 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-24 $6.90 25 $172.50 M2200  1 1/2 $4.25 25 $106.25

45 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-
2430 $7.42 25 $185.50 M2200  1 1/2 x 2 $4.51 25 $112.75

46 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-32 $10.49 10 $104.90 M2200  2" $6.40 10 $64.00

47 NIPPLES, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #80300-
3225 $11.33 10 $113.30 M2200  2 x 2 1/2 $6.90 10 $69.00

48 PLUGS, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38109-20 $3.65 100 $365.00 M22002  1 1/4 $2.81 100 $281.00
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49 BUSHINGS, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38110-
2016 $4.39 75 $329.25 M2206  1 1/4 x 1 $3.40 75 $255.00
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50 BUSHINGS, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38110-
2016 $4.39 18 $79.02 M2206  1 1/4 x 1 $3.40 18 $61.20

51 BUSHINGS, BRASS ANDERSON METAL #38110-
3224 $8.27 18 $148.86 M2206  2 x 1 1/2 $6.40 18 $115.20

52 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #31272 $0.23 100 $23.00 NO BID - 100 -
53 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #30310 $0.45 150 $67.50 NO BID - 150 -
54 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #30342 $1.92 100 $192.00 NO BID - 100 -
55 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #31296 $1.29 100 $129.00 NO BID - 100 -
56 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #30354 $3.38 100 $338.00 NO BID - 100 -
57 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #31306 $2.24 50 $112.00 NO BID - 50 -
58 FITTINGS, COPPER ELKHART #30716 $0.62 25 $15.50 NO BID - 25 -
59 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $5.65 600 $3,390.00 1" TYPE K $5.03 600 $3,018.00
60 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $6.96 1200 $8,352.00 1 1/4 x 60 TYPE K $6.40 1200 $7,680.00
61 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER* $9.33 200 $1,866.00 1 1/2 x 20 TYPE K $10.21 200 $2,042.00
62 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER** $14.49 100 $1,449.00 2 x 20 TYPE K $15.44 100 $1,544.00
63 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $1.17 200 $234.00 NO BID - 200 -
64 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $2.15 200 $430.00 NO BID - 200 -
65 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $3.21 300 $963.00 NO BID - 300 -
66 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $4.20 400 $1,680.00 NO BID - 400 -
67 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $5.57 100 $557.00 NO BID - 100 -
68 PIPE, COPPER MUELLER $8.98 100 $898.00 NO BID - 100 -

27 ITEMS NOT BID $339.80 $31,179.21 14 ITEMS NOT BID $1,421.86 $73,411.50

*  1-1/2" PIPE ONLY SOLD IN 300' CRATE
** PIPE ONLY SOLD IN 40' COILS `

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT

LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY 
REQUIREMENTS.  BIDDERS ARE STRONGLY CAUTIONED TO QUOTE ALL LINE ITEMS LISTED TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.

PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL WHICHEVER IS DEEMED TO BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY, TO THE

GRAND TOTALS

ITEM # ITEM
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