BID TABULATION #2356
TRUCK CHASSIS & DUMP BODIES

PURCHASING AGENT: MICHAEL DRZEWIECKI

TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-3588
EMAIL: MDRZEW@MILWAUKEE.GOV

PAGE 1 OF 2

OPENED 1/21/2010 @ 2:00 PM-CST

BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID
BADGER TRUCK DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL $25,607.00
WEST ALLIS, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE TRUCK ENGINEERING S25F $6,888.00
OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO CHARGE
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL TRUCK ENGINEERING S25F $21,877.00
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID
CASPER'S TRUCK EQUIPMENT DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL $34,894.00
APPLETON. Wi 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE HENDERSON MARK E $6,871.00
OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO CHARGE
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL HENDERSON MARK E $27,049.00
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID
CASPER'S TRUCK EQUIPMENT DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL $34,177.00
APPLETON, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE BIBEAU BFLS1654854 $6,871.00
(ALTERNATE BID) OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO CHARGE
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL BIBEAU BFLS1654854 $26,332.00
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE INTERNATIONAL / 7500 $89,975.00
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE $1,175.00
LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID
MILWAUKEE, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID NO BID
(PRE-EMISSION 2011 BID) OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE INTERNATIONAL / 7500 $89,975.00
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID NO BID
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE INTERNATIONAL / 7500 $94,975.00
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE $1,175.00
LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID
MILWAUKEE, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID NO BID
(POST-EMISSION 2011 BID) OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE INTERNATIONAL / 7500 $94,975.00
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID NO BID
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BIDDER ITEM # ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART # UNIT PRICE
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO BID
MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL $37,780.00
DEPERE, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE CRYSTEEL SELECT $6,628.00
OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM N/A
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE NO BID NO BID
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL CRYSTEEL SELECT $29,234.00
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE FREIGHTLINER M2112V $105,158.00
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO CHARGE
TRUCK COUNTRY DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID
OAK CREEK, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE FREIGHTLINE M2112V $105,158.00
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID NO BID
1 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6X4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB. GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE KENWORTH MODEL T470 $105,200.00
OPTIONAL SNOW PLOWING PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE NO CHARGE|
WISCONSIN KENWORTH DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID
OAK CREEK, WI 2 OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM NO BID
3 TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, HEAVY DUTY, 64,000 LB GVW, WITH PUSHER AXLE KENWORTH MODEL T470 $105,200.00
4 DUMP BODY, 16 CUBIC YARD, SNOW AND ICE CONTROL NO BID NO BID

AWARD WILL BE MADE AS FOLLOWS:

- LINE ITEMS 1 AND 3 IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS WITH
OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONAL PREP PACKAGE FOR SNOW PLOW USE.

NOTE: THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD THE TRUCK CHASSIS WITH OR WITHOUT THE PREP PACKAGE OPTION WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

" LINE ITEM 2 TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS WITH OR

WITHOUT THE OPTIONAL PACKAGE FOR MATERIAL SPREADER USE AND THE OPTIONAL HYDRAULIC SYSTEMS TRAINING PROGRAM.

NOTE: THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD THIS DUMP BODY WITH OR WITHOUT THE OPTIONS WHICHEVER IS IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE CITY.

" LINE ITEM 4 TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE
LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT EXCEED $25,000.
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