BID TABULATION #2316
TRUCK CHASSIS / DUMP BODY

PURCHASING AGENT: DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.: (414) 286-2395
EMAIL: DIANE.BERNDT@MILWAUKEE.GOV
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OPENED 10/15/2009 @ 2:00 PM-CST

BIDDER ITEM # ITEM UNIT PRICE| QTY TOTAL GRAND TOTAU
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID 2 NO BID
BADGER TRUCK CENTER s146,926.92
' 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD | $73,463.16 | 2 | $146,926.32
CASPERS TRUCK EQUIPMENT 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID 2 NO BID
APPLETON, WI $153,962.00
: 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD | $76,981.00 | 2 | $153,962.00
LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCK 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS $65,475.00 | 2 | $130,950.00
MILWAUKEE, WI $130,950.00
(BUILT PRIOR TO 1/1/2010) 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID
LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCK 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS $66,975.00 | 2 | $133,950.00
MILWAUKEE, WI
' $133,950.00
(BUILT AFTER 1/1/2010, 2 |pumpBODY,FIVEYARD | NOBID | 2 NO BID
2011 MODEL WITH PRE-EMISSION ENG)
LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCK 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS $72,975.00 | 2 | $145,950.00
MILWAUKEE, WI
' $145,950.00
(BUILT AFTER 1/1/2010, 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID
2010 MODEL WITH PRE-EMISSION ENG)
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID 2 NO BID
MONROEDTEITDLIJECF‘;IE EV(3|UIPMENT $144.990.00
: 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD | $72,495.00 | 2 | $144,990.00
1 |TRUCK CHASSIS NO BID 2 NO BID
OLSON(;I'SQI;I;\‘ESA%BV(\)/?Y, LLC $159.986.00
: 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD | $79,993.00 | 2 | $159,986.00
TRUCK COUNTRY 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS $68,256.00 | 2 | $136,512.00
OAK CREEK, WI $136,512.00
(WITHOUT 2010 EMMISSIONS) 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID
TRUCK COUNTRY 1 |[TRUCK cHASSIS $74,256.00 | 2 | $148,512.00
OAK CREEK, WI $148,512.00
(WITH 2010 EMMISSIONS) 2 |pumP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID
WISCONSIN KENWORTH 1 |TRUCK CHASSIS $77,750.00 | 2 | $155,500.00
OAK CREEK, WI $155,500.00
(IF INVOICED BY 12/31/2009) 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID
WISCONSIN KENWORTH 1 |[TRUCK cHASSIS $80,750.00 | 2 | $161,500.00
OAK CREEK, WI $161,500.00
(IF INVOICED AFTER 12/31/2009) 2 |DUMP BODY, FIVE YARD NO BID 2 NO BID

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH
THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

IF A LOCAL BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (LBE) IS A RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, THE LBE SHALL BE AWARDED THE
CONTRACT PROVIDED ITS BID DOES NOT EXCEED THE LOWEST BID BY MORE THAN 5% AND THE DIFFERENCE DOES NOT

EXCEED $25,000.



